
Telephone No. 021-99231418 
Fax #: 	021-99231084 
Email: sindhprisons@gmail.com  

To, 

C 

r 

NUSRAT H SSAIN MANGAN) 
INSPECTOR GENERAL OF PR/SONS 

SINDH KARACHI 

URGENT 

OFFICE OF THE 
INSPECT R GENERAL OF PRISONS, SINDH 

Pir Illahi Buksh Road Muslimabad, Karachi. 

No.SB-11 	 Dated 2 0 MAR 2017 

The Director, 
SPPRA, Government of Sindh, 
Block No.8 Sindh Secretariat No.4A, 
Court Road, Karachi. 

SUBJECT: BID EVALUATION REPORTS (TECHNICAL & FINANCIAL) 
ALONGWITH COMPARATIVE STATEMENTS OF SUCCESSFUL 
BIDDERS FOR PROCUREMENT OF MEDICINE FOR THE YEAR 
2016-2017.  

I am to forward herewith following documents of Medicine (in original) for 

hoisting the same on SPPRA Government of Sindh website i.e. www.pprasindh.gov.pk  at the 

earliest for taking further necessary action in the matter. 

i. Minutes of the meeting of the Proeur-ment Committee-II for receiving the 

bid documents and opening the technical proposals dated 28.02.2017. 

ii. Minutes of the meeting of the Procurement Committee-II for scrutinizing 

the technical proposals and opening the financial proposals dated 

09.03.2017. 

iii. Bidder's qualification report. 

iv. Bid evaluation reports (technical & financial). 

v. Comparative statement of the rates of the successful bidders. 



r 

MINUTES OF THE MEETING OF THE PROCUREMENT COMMITTEE-II FOR 
RECEIVING THE BID DOCUMENTS AND OPENING THE TECHNICAL 
PROPOSALS OF MEDICINE FOR THE YEAR 2016-2017 HELD ON 28.02.2017.  

Meeting of the Procurement Committee-II for receiving the bid documents and 

opening the technical proposals of Medicine for the year 2016-2017 was held on 28.02.2017 at 

• 02:00 p.m in the conference room of Prisons Inspectorate General Sindh Karachi under the 

Chairmanship of Senior Superintendent, Central Prison Karachi. 

Following attended with the meeting: 

1.  Mr. Mumtaz Ahmed Raja, 
Senior Superintendent, 
Central Prison Karachi. 

Head of the Committee 

2.  Dr. Shakir Alam, 
O.S.D, 
Health Department, 
Government of Sindh, Karachi. 

Member 

3.  Dr. Khalil Ahmed Pathan, 
A.M.S, 
Medical Superintendent, 
Civil Hospital, Karachi 

Member 

4.  Dr. Amrat Rai, 
Medical Officer, 
Youthful Offenders Industrial School, 
Karachi. 

Member 

5.  Dr. Abdul Qayum, 
Medical Officer, 
Central Prison Larkana. 

Member 

Tender box duly sealed was put-up before tl.e Procurement Committee and opened 
at 02:00 p.m in presence of the bidders, as the procurement of all the medicine is being made and 

regulated in accordance with the Sindh Public Procurement Rule 46(2) Single Stage Two Envelope 
procedure. 

The Procurement Committee considered the bids received in response to the N.I.T 

advertised by the Inspector General of Prisons Sindh Karachi in newspapers as well as SPPRA 
website. 

Tenders of the 42 No. Medicine were sold upto 27.02.2017, items-wise details of 
the bidders who purchased the tenders is mentioned here as under: 

S # Name of Articles Name of Bidders/Participants Total 

1 Medicine 

M/s Zaffar Brothers 
M/s Naveed Medicos 
M/s Paras Enterprises 
M/s Mir Corporation 
M/s Karachi Medical Company 

05 
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• Following bidders submitted their bids (tec ical & financial proposals) alongwith 

samples on 28.02.2017 upto 01:00 p.m, details mentioned b low. 

S*I Name of Articles Name of Bidders/Participants 
No. of items for which 

technical proposals 
offered 

Total 
firms 

1 Medicine 

M/s Zaffar Brothers 09 

05 

M/s Naveed Medicos 14 
M/s Paras Enterprises 04 
M/s Mir Corporation 03 
M/s Karachi Medical 
Company 02 

After opening the technical bids, the Procur ment Committee found that technical 

proposals alongwith samples of 19 medicine were sub itted by the bidders / firms out of 

42 medicine. The Committee unanimously decided that to hnical proposals of above mentioned 

firms should be scrutinized in the next meeting according o the evaluation criteria mentioned in 

the bid document. 

The meeting ended with the vote of thanks b the Chair. 

(MUMTAZ AHMED RAJA) 
SENIOR SUPERINTENDENT 

CENTRAL PRISON KARACHI 
(CHA RMAN PROCUREMENT COMMITTEE-II) 

Endst No. SB-1/ D 4-4 	 Dated: 2s FEg 2017' 
Copy forwarded to all the members of Pro • rement Committee-II for information 

and necessary action. 

S 
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MINUTES OF THE MEETING OF PROCUREMENT-II FOR SCRUTINIZING THE 
TECHNICAL PROPOSALS AND OPENING THE FINANCIAL PROPOSALS OF 
MEDICINE HELD ON 09.03.2017.  

Meeting of the Procurement Committee-II for scrutinizing the technical proposals 

and opening the financial proposals of Medicine for the year 2016-2017 was held on 09.03.2017 at 

02:30 p.m under the Chairmanship of Senior Superintendent, Central Prison Karachi in the 

Conference Room of Prisons Inspectorate General Sindh Karachi. 

Following attended with the meeting: 

1. Mr. Mumtaz Ahmed Raja, 
Senior Superintendent, 
Central Prison Karachi. 

2. Dr. Shakir Alam, 
O.S.D, 
Health Department, 
Government of Sindh, Karachi. 

3. Dr. Khalil Ahmed Pathan, 
A.M.S, 
Medical Superintendent, 
Civil Hospital, Karachi 

4. Dr. Abdul Qayum, 
Medical Officer, 
Central Prison Larkana. 

Dr. Amrat Rai, 
5. Medical Officer, 

Youthful Offenders Industrial School, 
Karachi. 

(Chairman) 

Member 

Member 

Member 

Member 

The agenda of the meeting was to discuss and examine the technical proposals 

submitted by the bidders according to eligibility and evaluation criteria mentioned in the bid 

document of Medicine for the year 2016-2017. 

The Procurement Committee-II thoroughly examined the technical proposals as 

well as samples submitted by the bidders on 28.02.2017 and also checked the following mandatory 

documents submitted with the technical proposals. 

i. Original Tender receipt. 
ii. Photocopy of Pay Order / Demand Draft of bid security in which amount should not 

be readable, otherwise the bid ignored. 
iii. Each page of the bid should be signed and duly sealed without showing the rates. 
iv. Valid manufacturing license / Valid Drug sales license. 
v. NTN / Income Tax certificate. 

Page 1 of 8 



vi. Professional Tax Certificate. 
vii. GST Registration certificate. 
viii. DRAP (Drug Regulatory Authority of Pakistan 
ix. Relevant experience of atleast 3 years. 
x. Bidder should submit documentary evidence t 

than / equal Rs.50 million. 
xi. Bank turnover of atleast last three years (2013 

turnover should not be less than Rs.1 million). 
xii. Affidavit regarding Non-Blacklisting of Firm 

Bodies executing agencies. 
xiii. Authorization letter on behalf of Principal's 

products. 

Certificate. 

at he can perform business of more 

14, 2014-15 and 2015-16) (Monthly 

y Govt's, Semi Govt's Autonomous 

thorizing the bidders to quote their 

The bidder-wise position is mentioned below. 

1. 	M/S ZAFAR BROTHERS. 

He has furnished all requisite documents 

manufacturer and drap certificate against quoted medicine 

qualify in technical evaluation, therefore, Procurement Com 

quoted medicine and recommended that financial proposal 

However, details mentioned below against each item. 

xcept authorization letters of the 

which are mandatory documents to 

ittee declared him disqualified for all 

may be returned to him unopened. 

SO Item N Description of 
Store Generic Name 

Brand 
Name 

Offered 
Mfr 

Mfg 
Date 

Expiry 
Date 

Remarks 

TABLET 

1 2 Arinac Forte 
Ibuprofen 
/pseudephedrine 
HCL 

Reliefast Lisko 11/2016 11/2018 
Disqualified due to non 
submission of authority 
letter & drap certificate 

7 Brufen 400 Mg 2 Brufedin
in. 

Ibuprofen 400 mg 
Ard 

Phanna 
02/2016 02/2019 -do- -do- 

3 25 Flygel 400 Mg 
Metronidagzole 400 
mg 

Semodaz 
of 

Semos 
Pharma 

11/2016 11/2018 -do- 

CAPSULE 

4 64 Ampiclox 500 mg 
Ampicillin+Cloxacill 
in 500ing  

Novoclo 
x 

500 mg 

ISIS 
Pharma 

06/2016 06/2019 -do- 

5 65 Cefiget 400mg Cefixime 400 mg 
Cefistar 
400 mg 

ISIS 
Pharma 

12/2016 
— 

12/2018 
-do- 

SYRUP 

6 105 Brufen 120 ml Ibuprofen 120 ml Brufedin 
PArdin

harma 
12/2016 12/2018 -do- 

DRESSING 

7 124 
Kaolin Poltus 100 
gm 

Kaolin Poltus 100 gm 
Kaolin 
Poltus 

Zantock 10/2016 09/2018 -do- 

LOTION / 
CREAM / 
POWDER 

8 136 
Dermazine Cream 
25gm 

sliver sulphadiazine 
25 gm 

Sidadin 
20 gm 

Ardin 
Pharma 

01/2017 01/2019 -do- 

DROPS 
9 153 Nilstate Oral Drop Nystatin Mystate Lisko 04/2016 04/2018 -do- 

157 
ts(/ 1 
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2. 	M/S NAVEED MEDICOS. • except authority letters of the 

me. He submitted authority letter of 

r one medicine i.e. Velosef 500mg, 

r aforesaid one medicine only and 

ended that financial proposals of 

tails mentioned below against each 

He has furnished all requisite document 

manufacturer and drap certificates on behalf of quoted medi c  

the manufacturer & drap certificate of Bosch Pharma only f 

therefore, Procurement Committee declared him qualified 

disqualified for remaining quoted medicine and recom 

disqualified items may be returned to him unopened. The d 

item. 

SS Item # Description of 
Store Generic Name 

Brand 
Name 

Offered 
Mfr Mfg 

Date 
Expiry 
Date 

Remarks 

TABLET 

I 7 Brufen 400 Mg Ibuprofen 400 mg 
Brufen 
400 mg 

Abbott 01/2017 07/2019 
Disqualified due to non 
submission of authority 
letter & drap certificate 

2 14 Dosik 5 mg Haloperidol 
Dosik 
5 mg 

Adamjee 02/2015 02/2019 -do- 

3 23 Epival 250 Mg Valproic acid 250 mg 
Epival 
250 mg 

Abbott 10/2016 10/2018 -do- 

4 34 Kempro 5mg 
Proc yclidine HCL 5 
mg 

Kempro m 
5mg 

Adamjee 03/2016 03/2020 -do- 

5 46 Prothadine 75mg 
Dosulepin 
Hydrochloride 
75mg 

Prothadi 
ne 

75 mg 
Abbott 07/2015 07/2017 -do- 

6 51 Silliver 200 mg Sillvemerine 200 mg 200 
Silli mg 

Abbott 04/2016 10/2017 -do- 

7 55 Theograd 350 mg Theophylline 350 mg 
Theogra 

d 
350 mg 

Abbott 11/2015 11/2018 -do- 

CAPSULE 

8 65 Cefiget 400mg Cefixime 400 mg 
Linzitun 
400  mg 

Bosch 09/2016 08/2018 -do- 

9 71 Velosef 500 mg Cephradine 500 mg 
Cefi nex

g 500 in  Bosch 10/2015 09/2018 Qualified 

SYRUP 

10 105 Brufen 120 ml Ibuprofen 120 ml 
Brufen 
120 ml Abbott 02/2017 02/2020 

Disqualified due to non 
submission of authority 
letter & drap certificate 

11 109 Crimafin 120 ml 
liquid 
paraffm+maganium 
hydroxide 

Crimafm 
120 ml 

Abbott 12/2016 12/2019 -do- 

LOTION / CREAM 
aolpiii 

12 139 
Handensa ointment 
I5gm, 

Hemorrhoidal 15 gm 
Hadesa 

Fort 
PPL 09/2016 09/2019 -do- 

13 144 
Travogen Cream10 
gm 

Isoconazole Nitrate 
10 gm 

Travoge 
n 

10 gm 
Bayer 07/2016 07/2021 -do- 

14 145 
Travocort Cream 
10 gm 

Isoconazole Nitrate+ 
Hydrocortisone 10gm 

Travocar 
t 

Bayer 08/2016 08/2021 -do- 

    

    

9r, 
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• 
3. 	M/S PARAS ENTERPRISES. 

He has furnished all requisite documents as w 

was found satisfactory on clinical experience basis, therefo 

him qualified in technical evaluation and recommended for 

details mentioned below against each item. 

II as efficacy of the quoted medicine 

, Procurement Committee declared 

pening his financial proposals. The 

S# Item # 
Description of 

Store 

Generic Name Brand 
Name 

Offered 
Mfr Mfg 

Date 
Expiry 
Date 

Remarks 

TABLET 

1 7 Brufen 400 Mg Ibuprofen 400 mg !n 
400

fe 
 mg Adamjee 04/2016 04/2019 Qualified 

CAPSULE 
2 65 Cefiget 400mg Cefixime 400 mg Ceforal-3 Zafa 01/2017 01/2019 Qualified 

3 71 Velosef 500 mg Cephradine 500 mg Cephgen- Zafa 09/2016 09/2019 Qualified 

SYRUP 

4 105 Brufen 120 ml Ibuprofen 120 ml 
!f en 

90 ml Adamjee 12/2016 12/2018 Qualified 

4. 	M/S MIR CORPORATION. 

He has furnished all requisite documents as well as efficacy of the quoted medicine 

was found satisfactory on clinical experience basis, therefore, Procurement Committee declared 

him qualified in technical evaluation and recommended for opening his financial proposals of all 

quoted medicine. The details mentioned below against each item. 

S.# Item 
No. 

Description of 
Store Generic Name 

Brand 
Name 

Offered 
Mfr Mfg 

Date 
Expiry 
Date Remarks 

CAPSULE 

1 65 Cefiget 400mg Cefixime 400 mg Maxpan 
400 mg 

Indus 
Pharma 07/2016 07/2018 Qualified 

2 71 Velosef 500 mg Cephradine 500 mg Vericef 
500 mg 

Indus 
Phamia 

11/2014 11/2016 Qualified 

DRESSING 

3 124 Kaolin Poltus 100 
gm 

Kaolin Poltus 100 gm Kaolin mho  Zanctock 10/2016 10/2018 Qualified 

5. 	M/S KARACHI MEDICAL COMPANY. 

He has furnished all requisite documents but 

not found satisfactory on clinical experience basis, therefo 

him disqualified in technical evaluation and recommend 

returned to him unopened. The details mentioned below agai  

efficacy of the quoted medicine was 

e, Procurement Committee declared 

d that financial proposals may be 

st each item. 

S# Item # Description of 
Store 

Generic Name 
Brand 
Name 

Offered 
Mfr Mfg 

Da to 
Expiry 
Date  Remarks 

CAPSULE 

1 65 Cefiget 400mg Cefixime 400 mg Evofix 
400 mg 

Pharm 
Evo 07/2016 07/2018 Disqualified, efficacy is 

not found satisfactory on 



clinical experience basis 

2 71 Velosef 500 mg Cephradine 50P mg 
Brocef 

mg 
Surge 11/2014 11/2016 -do- 

The

500 

precise of the qualified and non-qualifi 

evaluation is given here under as mentioned against each. 

d items of the bidders in technical 

  

S# Name of Bidder 
No. of items for 
which technical 

proposals offered 

No. of items 
Technically 
Qualified 

No. of items 
Technically Not 

Qualified 

1 M/s Zaffar Brothers 9 9 

2 M/s Naveed Medicos 14 1 13 

3 M/s Paras Enterprises 4 4 - 

4 M/s Mir Corporation 3 3 - 

5 M/s Karachi Medical Company 2 - 2 

Item-wise precise of the qualified bidders is submitted here as under: 

Sii Description Item 
N of Store Generic Name 

No. of 
Bidders 
Quoted 
of the 
Item 

N. 

of 
I 

qualified 
Bidders 

of 

the 
em 

Brand 
Name 

Offered 
Mfr 

Name of 
Bidders/ 

Firms 

TABLET 

1 1 Angised 0.5 mg 
Glyceryl Trinitrate 0.5 
mg 

-- No bid was offered 

2 2 Arinac Forte Ibuprofen 
/pseudephedrine HCL 

1 — Disqualified, authority letter and DRAP certificate 
was not submitted by M/s Zafar Brothers 

3 5 Avil 25 mg C hloraphinamine 25 
mg -- No bid was offered 

4 7 Brufen 400 Mg Ibuprofen 400 mg 3 I Ifen 400mg Adamjee 
M/s. 

rpri Enterprises 
5 5 14 Dosik S mg Haloperidol 1 — Disqualified, authority letter and DRAP certificate 

was not submitted by M/s Naveed Medicos 

6 17 Deltacartil 5 mg Prednisolone 5 mg -- No bid was offered 
7 19 Disprin Acetylsalicylic Acid -- No bid was offered 

8 20 Deflon 500 mg 
Micronized Purificol 
500 mg 

-- No bid was offered 

9 21 Diazepam 5 mg Diazepam 5 mg -- No bid was offered 

10 23 Epival 250 Mg Valproic acid 250 mg 1 — 
Disqualified. authority letter and DRAP certificate 

vvas not submitted by M/s Naveed Medicos 

11 25 Fl ygel 400 Mg Metronidagzole 400 
mg 

1 —  Disqualified, authority letter and DRAP certificate 
was not submitted by M/s Zafar Brothers 

12 29 Gravinate Bimenhydrinate — No bid was offered 

13 34 Kempro 5mg 1 Procyclidine HCL 5 
--mg 

Disqualified, authority letter and DRAP certificate 
was not submitted by M/s Naveed Medicos 

14 37 Librax Chlordiazepoxite + 
Clidinium -- No bid was offered 

15 46 Prothadine 75mg 
Dosulepin 
Hydrochloride 
75mg 

1 — 
Disqualified, authority letter and DRAP certificate 

was not submitted by M/s Naveed Medicos 

16 48 Resochin Choloroquine -- Phosphate No bid was offered 

17 51 Silliver 200 mg Sillvemerine 200 mg I — 
Disqualified, authority letter and DRAP certificate 

was not submitted by M/s Naveed Medicos 

18 53 Stemetil 
Prochlorperazine 
Maleate -- No bid was offered 

19 55 Theograd 350 mg Theophylline 350 mg I — 
Disqualified. authority letter and DRAP certificate 

was not submitted by M/s Naveed Medicos 

CAPSULE 

20 64 Am piclox 500 mg Ampicillin+Cloxacilli 
n 500mg 

I — Disqualified, authority letter and DRAP certificate 
was not submitted by M/s Zafar Brothers 

At/ 
•••••.-- 
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21 65 Cefiget 400mg Cefixime 400 mg 5 2 
Ceforal-3 Zafa 

M/s. Paras 
Enterprises 

Maxpan 
400 mg 

Indus 
Pharma 

Ws. Mir 
Corporation 

22 71 Velosef 500 mg Cephradinc 500 mg 4 3 

Cefinex 
500 mg 

Bosch 
M/s. 

Naveed 
Medicos 

Cephgen-1 Zafa 
M/s. Paras 
Enterprises 

M/s. Mir 
Corporation 

Vericef 
500 mg 

Indus 
Pharma 

JNJECTION 
23 91 Lasix 20 mg Frusemide 20 mg -- No bid was offered 

,SYRIl'P 

24 105 linden 120 ml Ibuprofen 120 ml 3 1 
!fen 

90 ml 
Adamjee 

M/s. Paras 
Enterprises rprises 

25 109 Crimafin 120 ml 
liquid 
paraffin+maganium 
hydroxide 

1 — 
Disqualified, authonty letter and DRAP certificate 

was not submitted by Mls Naveed Medicos 

26 110 Flagyl 120 ml Metronidagzolc 120m1 -- No bid was offered 

27 114 Mucain 120 ml 
Aluminumhydroxide 
+ Maganiwn 
hydroxide 120 ml 

- No bid was offered 

DRESSING 

28 124 Kaolin Poltus 100 gm Kaolin Poltus 100 gm 2 1 
Kaolin 
Poltus 

Zantock 
M/s Mir 

Corporation 

29 131 
Tincture l3enzien 
450m1 

Tincture Benzien 450 
ml 

-- No bid was offered 

LOTION / CREAM 
/ POWDER 

30 136 
Dermazine Cream 
25gm 

sliver sulphadiazine 
25 gm 

1 — 
Disqualified, authority letter and DRAP certificate 

was not submitted by M/s Zafar Brothers 

31 137 
DermovateN Cream 
I Ogm 

Dennovate+Numicine 
10 gm 

-- No bid was offered 

32 139 Hemorrhoidal 
Ilandensa ointment 

15 gm -'15gm, 
I 

Disqualified. authonty letter and DRAP certificate 

was not submitted by Sts Misted Medicos 

33 141 Polyfax Eye Ointment Polymicine -- No bid was offered 

34 142 
Polyfax Skin 
Cream15 gm 

Polymicine+13acitraci 
n 15 gm 

-- No bid was offered 

35 143 Somogel 15gm 
Lig 	 an& nocaine / Eth 
5 1 	grn 

-- No bid was offered 

36 144 
Travogen Cream10 
gm 

Isoconazole Nitrate 10 
gm 

I — 
Disqualified, authonty letter and DRAP certificate 

was not submitted by MS Naseed Medicos 

37 145 
Travocort Cream 10 
gm 

lsoconazole Nitrate+ 
1.1ydrocortisone 10gm 

I -- 
Disqualified, authonty letter and DRAP Calif-Watt 

was not submitted by M/s Naveed Medicos 

38 148 Xaltide Inhalor 
Salbutamol+Beclome 
phosone 

-- No bid was offered 

PROPS 

39 152 
5 ml 
Lidosporin Ear Drop 

Poly myxim B+ 
Lignocaine+ 
Propylcneglycol 5 ml 

-- No bid was offered 

40 153 Nilstate Oral Drop Nystatin 1 --
Disqualified, authonty letter and DRAP certificate 

was not submitted by Mis Zafar Brothers 

41 154 Otosporin Ear drops 
Polimaxcine+Numicin 
e + HC 

-- No bid was offered 

PSYCHIATRIC. 
J1I E DI('I N ES 
ANTIPSYCHOTICS 

42 159 Tab: Amelen 25 mg Amytriptiline 25 mg -- 	I No bid was offered 

In view of the above, the Committee ope -d the financial bids of technically 

qualified bidders only in presence of the bidders and rates we e announced on the spot. 
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4624 

355 

Appx. Qty Offered 

Name of 
Mfr 	Bidders/ 

Firms 

Rates 
Offered 

Brand Na 

11 !fen 
00 mg l 

A
dZkifie  

Indus 
Pharma 

M/s Paras 
Enterp 

M/s Paras 

M/s Mir 
Co s sration 

403500 

38900 

Indus 
Pharma 

M/s Paras 
Enterprises  
M/s Mir 
Corporation 

67200 Cephgen. I 

Vericef 
500 ma  

Zantoc 

Item-wise comparative statement of the rates of 5 medicine out of 42 medicine of 

qualified bidders has been prepared accordingly as mentioned below. 

S# Item Description of 
Store 

Generic 
Name 

TABLET 

7 Brufen 400 Mg 
Ibuprofen 
400 mg 

CAPSULE 

2 65 Cefiget 400mg 
Cefixime 
400 mg 

3 71 Velosef 500 mg 
Cephradine 
500 mg 

SYRUP 

4 105 Brufen 120 ml 
Ibuprofen 
120 ml 

DRESSING 

5 124 
Kaolin Poltus 
100 gm 

Kaolin 
Poltus 100 
gm 

The comparative statement was discussed in detail and found that following bidders 

are lowest in medicine as mentioned below against each firm. 

S# Name of Bidders / Firms 
No. of medicine in which 

bidder is lowest 
i.  M/s Naveed Medicos 1 
ii.  M/s Mir Corporation 1 
iii.  M/s Paras Enterprises 3 

Total 5 

In view of the above position, there are (3) 

according to SPPRA Rules No.48 single bid is acceptable, 

the bidding process may be considered valid, if it was advert 

prices are comparable to the rates of the last award contract 

rates of single items were compared with the last award 

according to prevailing whole sale market rates as the w 

strictly observed according to SPPRA Rules, therefore, the 

single bid rates offered by the different following bidders / fit  

Ingle qualified bids of medicine and 

ven when only one bid is submitted, 

sed in accordance with the rules, and 

r the market rates. In this regard, the 

contract rates and found the same 

ole tender process of medicine was 

ommittee discussed and accepted the 

S# Name of Bidders / Firms No. of medicine in which single 
bid offered by the bidder 

a. M/s Mir Corporation 1 
b. M/s Paras Enterprises 2 

Total 3 
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The Procurement Committee has discussed th 

of the bid document and SPPRA rules lowest and single 

accepted and acceptance letters and work orders may be issue  

according to the terms & conditions 

ids offered by the bidders may be 

at the earliest. 

The Procurement Committee has further discu 

attached at Annexure-A against which either no bid was o 

items were found technically un-satisfactory. Therefore, it w 

of medicine may be got re-appropriated and kept at the dispo 

purchase as the remaining medicine are also essential and da 

further added that Superintendent Prisons may be directed to 

head of accounts of A03927-Purchase of Drug and Medicin 

may be utilized properly according to SPPRA rules strictly. 

sed about the remaining 37 medicine 

ered or the offered bid against these 

recommended that remaining funds 

1 of Superintendent Prisons for local 

ly use items for the prison hospitals, 

nsure that remaining funds under the 

and A09407-Specific Consumables 

The meeting ended with the vote of thanks by he Chair. 

(Dr. "'kir lam) 
O.S.D, 

Health Department, 
Government of Sindh,rachi. 

(Dr. Khalil Ahmed Pathan), 
A.M.S, 

Medical Superintendent, 
Civil Hospital, Karachi 

_JI 
(Dr. Am t Rai), 
Medical Officer, 

Youthful Offenders Industrial School, 
Karachi. 

(Dr. Abdul Qayum 
Medical Officer, 

Central Prison Larkana. 

(Mumtaz Ahmed Raja), 
Senior Superintendent, 
Central Prison Karachi 

(Chairman Procurement Com ttee-II) 

Endrs No.SB-1/ 64_19 	 Dated: 	 A/LPC-in — 

Forwarded to the Inspector General of Prison Sindh Karachi for kind information 

and further necessary action. 
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BIDDER'S QUALIFICATIONS REPORT OF MEDICINE FOR THE YEAR 2016-2017. 

St/ 
Name of Bidder / 

Firm 

Original 
Tender 
receipt 

Photocopy of 
Pay Order / 

Demand 
Draft of bid 
security in 

which 
amount 

should not be 
readable, 

otherwise the 
bid ignored 

Original 
copy of bid 

without 
showing 
the rates, 
each page 
should be 
signed & 

sealed 

Valid 
manufacturing 
license / Valid 

Drug sales 
license 

NTN / 
Income 

Tax 
certificat 

e 

Professional 
Tax 

Certificate 

GST 
Registration 
certificate 

Relevant 
Experience 

may be 
provided 
atleast 3 

Years 

Bidder 
should 
submit 

documentary 
evidence that 

he can 
perform 

business of 
more than / 
equal Rs.50 

million 

Bank Turnover 
of atleast last 
three Years 

(2013-14, 2014- 
15 and 2015-16) 

(Monthly 
Turnover 

should not be 
less than Rs.1 

million) 
 

Affidavit 
regarding 

Non-Blacklisting 
of Firm by 

Govt's, 
Semi Govt's 
Autonomous 

Bodies executing 
agencies 

Valid 
authorization 
letter of the 

manufacturer 
 

1 
Mis Zafar 
Brothers 

Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes No 

2 
M/s Naveed 
Medicos 

Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes 

M/s Pa Panss
3 

Entees 
Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes 

4 
M/s Mir 
Corporation 

Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes 

5 
M/s Karachi 
Medical 
Company 

Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes 

x 

Yes Yes Yes Yes 

7 

(Dr. 'Ida' m) 
O.S.D, 

Health Department, 
Government of Shift, Karachi. 

e, 
(Dr. Am Ral), 
Medical 

Youthful Offenders Industrial School, 
Karachi. 

(Dr. Khalil ATIim 	than), 
, 

Medical Superintendent, 
Civil Hospital, Karachi 

(Dr. Abdul Qayum), 	- 
Medial Officer, 

Central Prison Larkins. 

(Mumtaz Ahmed Raja), 
Senior Superintendent, 
Central Prison Karachi 

(Chairman Procurement Committee-II) 



• 
BID EVALUATION REPORT (TECHNICAL)  

1. Name of Procuring Agency: 	 Inspector General of Prisons Sindh, Karachi. 

2. Tender Reference No: 	 INFACRY NO.632/2017.  

• 3. Tender Description/Name of work/item: For Supply of "Medicine" for Sindh Prisons Department 
for the year 2016-2017.  

4. Method of Procurement: 	 Single Stage Two Envelops Procedure. 

5. Tender Published: (SPPR k Serial No.31573 & ID No.2147483647 & 
Dail' DaNr n dated 12.02.2017, Daily Express dated  
11.02.21117, Daily j(awish dated: 13.02.2017).  

6. Total Bid documents Sold; 	 05 No.  

7. Total Bids Received: 	 05 No. 

8. Technical Bid Opening date: (if applicable) 28-02-2017 • r  

9. No. of Bid technically qualified (if applicable): 03 No. 

10. Bid(s) Rejected: 	 02 No. 

11. Financial Bid Opening date: 	 09.03.2017 

12. Bid Evaluation Report:  

Bidder-wise detail of technically Qualified and un-qualified is as under:  

S # Name of Contractor 

No. of items 
for which 
technical 
proposal 
offered 

No, of 
items 

Technically 
Qualified 

No. of 
Technically 

Qualified 

items 
not Remarks 

1  M/s Zaffar Brothers 9 - 9 

He 	has 	furnished 	all 	requisite 
documents 	except 	authorization 
letters of the manufacturer and drap 
certificate against quoted medicine 
which are mandatory documents to 
qualify 	in 	technical 	evaluation, 
therefore, 	Procurement 	Committee 
declared 	him 	disqualified 	for 	all 
quoted medicine and recommended 
that 	financial 	proposals 	may 	be 
returned to him unopened. 	. 

2  M/s Naveed Medicos 14 1 13 

He 	has 	furnished 	all 	requisite 
documents except authority letters of 
the manufacturer and drap certificates 
on behalf of quoted medicine. He 
submitted 	authority 	letter 	of 	the 
manufacturer & drap certificate of 
Bosch Pharma only for one medicine 
i.e. 	Velosef 	500mg, 	therefore, 
Procurement Committee declared him 
qualified for aforesaid one medicine 
only and disqualified for remaining 
quoted medicine and recommended 
that 	financial 	proposals 	of 

5/- _JUL, 
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(Dr. m 
Medical 

Rai), r 
ricer, 

Youthful Offenders Industrial School, 
Karachi. 

(Dr. Abdul Qayum), 
Medical Officer, 

C ntral Prison Larkana. 

• 

disqualified items may be returned to 
him unopened. 

3  M/s Paras Enterprises 4 4 , 

He 	has 	furnished 	all 	requisite 
documents as well as efficacy of the 
quoted 	medicine 	was 	found 
satisfactory 	on 	clinical 	experience 
basis, 	therefore, 	Procurement 
Committee declared him qualified in 
technical 	evaluation 	and 
recommended 	for 	opening 	his 
financial proposals. 

4  M/s Mir Corporation 3 3 , 

He 	has 	furnished 	all 	requisite 
documents as well as efficacy of the 
quoted 	medicine 	was 	found 
satisfactory 	on 	clinical 	experience 
basis, 	therefore, 	Procurement 
Committee declared him qualified in 
technical 	evaluation 	and 
recommended 	for 	opening 	his 
financial 	proposals 	of 	all 	quoted 
medicine 

5 

M/s Karachi Medical 

Company 
2 - 2 

He 	has 	furnished 	all 	requisite 
documents but efficacy of the quoted 
medicine were not found satisfactory 
on 	clinical 	experience 	basis, 
therefore, 	Procurement 	Committee 
declared him disqualified in technical 
evaluation 	and 	recommended 	that 
financial proposals may be returned 
to him unopened 

(D 	&kir lam) 
O.S.D, 

Health Department, 
Government of Sindh, Karachi. 

(D Khalil Ahmed Pathan), 

edical Superintendent, 
bill Hospital, Karachi 

(Mumtaz Ahmed Raja), 
Senior Superintendent, 
Central Prison Karachi 

(Chairman Procurement Committee II) 
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BID EVALUATION REPORT (FINANCIAL)  

1. Name of Procuring Agency: 	 Inspector General of prisons Sindh. Karachi.  

2. Tender Reference No: 	 INF/KRY NO.632/2017.  

3. Tender Description/Name of work/item: 	For Supply of "Medicine" for Sindh Prisons Department for the year 
2016-2017.  

4. Method of Procurement: 	 Single Stare Two Envelops Procedure.  

5. Tender Published: 	 fSPPFtA Serial No.31573 & ID No.2147483647 & Daily Dawn 
dated 12.02.2017. Daily Express dated 11.02,2017. Daily 
Kawish dated: 13.02.2017).  

6. Total Bid documents Sold; 	 05 No. 

7. Total Bids Received: 	 05 No. 

8. Technical Bid Opening date: (if applicable) 	28-02-2017 

9. No. of Bid technically qualified (if applicable): 	03 No. 

10. Bid(s) Rejected: 	 02 No. 

11. Financial Bid Opening date: 	 09.03.2017 

12. Financial Bid Evaluation Report:  

S# Item 
# 

Description of 
Store 

Generic Name Brand Name 
Offered 

Mfr. Name of Bidders/ 
Firms 

Rates 
Offered 

TABLET 

1 7 Brufen 400 Mg Ibuprofen 400 mg Ifen 
400 mg 

Adamjee M/s Paras Enterprises 1.55 

CAPSULE,  

2 65 Cefiget 400mg Cefixime 400 mg 
Ceforal-3 Zafa M/s Paras Enterprises 22.00 

Maxpan 
400 mg 

Indus 
Pharma 

M/s Mir Corporation 46.00 

3 71 Velosef 500 mg 
Cephradine 500 
mg 

Cefinex 
500 mg 

 

Bosch M/s Naveed Medicos 11.69 

Cephgen- l Zafa M/s Paras Enterprises 12.00 

Vericef 
500 mg 

Indus 
Pharma 

M/s Mir Corporation 12.50 

SYRUP 

4 105 Brufen 120 ml Ibuprofen 120 ml Ifen 90 ml Adamjec M/s Paras Enterprises 33.00 

DRESSING 

5 124 Kaolin Poltus 100 
8n1 

Kaolin Poltus 100 
gm 

Kaolin Poltus Zantock 
\ 

M/s Mir Corporation 37.00 

 

(Dr. Afakir lam) 
O.S.D, 

Health Department, 
Government of Sindh, 	chL 

 

 

(Dr. K atil Ahmed Pathan), 
A.M.S, 

Medial Superintendent, 
Civil Hospital, Karachi 

(Dr. C ra al), 
Medkal 0 cer, 

Youthful Offenders Industrial School, 
KarachL 

 

(Dr. Abdul Qayum), 
Medical Officer, 

Centtal Prison Larkana. 

(Mumtaz Ahmed Raja), 
Senior Superintendent, 
Central Prison Karachi 

(Chairman Procurement Committee-II) 



(Dr. KLalil Ahmed Pathan), 
A.M.S, 

Medical Superintendent, 
Civil Hospital, Karachi 

1 I lA,Na%.,, 
(Dr. Abdul Qapum), 

Medical omeer. 
Central Prison Larkins. 

(Dr 
0.S.D, 

Health Department, 
Government of Sindb, 	chi. 

(Dr. 	Rai), 
Medical Deicer, 

Youthful Offenders Industrial School. 
Karachi. 

Page 1 of 1 

COMPARATIVE STATEMENT OF THE QUALIFIED BIDDERS / FIRMS FOR SUPPLY OF MEDICIENS FOR  
SINDH PRISONS DEPARTMENT FOR THE YEAR 2016-2017  

S# Item 
No 

Description of Store Generic Name Approximate 
Quantity 

Brand Name 
Offered 

Manufacturer Name of Bidders/ Firms 
Rates 

Offered 

TABLET 

1 7 Brufen 400 Mg Ibuprofen 400 mg 403500 
tier-7-1  

400 mg 
'Fl`—` 

Adam cc 
-- 	ts -"-'1*-"-•-^r-.4", 
M/s. i

, 
 a ras Enterprises 

-5r,  ,---,,4-...,- 
1.55 

CAPSULE 

2 65 Cefiget 400mg Cefixime 400 mg 38900 

IIIIIMIPPRIPMPlillimilik 
Ceforal-3 

illirrawilathimeEit""i'mai" 
Zafa M/s. Paras Enterprises 22.00 

...4..:.ta-- 
Maxpan 
400 mg Pharma 

Indus 
 

M/s. Mir Corporation 46.00 

Irefinex 
500 mg 

, 	Bosch M/s. Naveed Medicos  i 	h 	hvi 

3 71 Velosef 500 mg Cephradine 500 mg 67200 Cephgen-1 Zafa M/s. Paras Enterprises 12.00 

Vericef 
500 mg 

Indus 
Pharma 

M/s. Mir Corporation 12.50 

SYRUP 

4 105 Brufen 120 ml Ibuprofen 120 ml 4624 lien 90 ml Adam
lir 

jee 
1111111111 r 

M/s. Paras Enterprises 
INF 
33.00 

DRESSING 

5 124 Kaolin Poltus 100 gm Kaolin Poltus 100 gm 355 Kaoliet 	an 	M/s.Mii• Corporation 
11. VII 

37.00 

tA-notta.---4 

(Mumtaz Ahmed Raja), 
Senior Superintendent, 
Central Prison Karachi 

(Chairman Procurement Committee-H) 



lift)-( 7 	. 	-Cr  17.41-T 

( el? ov.!-5 	)-2 

1) C )).? 

tA/ 	 "L -le 

• .1J 

ATTENDANCE SHEET OF BIDDERS / 
...FIRMS WHO ATTEND MEETING  
OPEN ING OF FINANCIAL PROPOSALS  
• OF MEDICINES ON 09.03.2017. 
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