OFFICE OF THE MEDICAL SUPERINTENDENT			 
   SERVICES HOSPITAL AND CIVIL SURGEON KARACHI – SINDH. 


Statement showing the comparative statement on account of purchase of Equipment/Furniture, pertaining to the 
strengthening  of Services Hospital, Karachi  under ADP scheme no. 1403 for the year 2015-2016.
Financial bid opening : May 14th, 2016


COMPARATIVE STATEMENT 




	S.No.
	Name of Equipment
	Name of technically Responsive bidder
	Unit Price on US$/Euro/GBP and others
	Exchange rate
	Price Per Unit in Pak Rupees.
	Remarks

	1. 
	ECG Machine with all Accessories 

	M/s. Shirazi Trading 

	2,000US$. 

	104.50

	209,000Pkr 

	
M/s. BIOS approved as 1st lowest 

	2. 
	
	M/s. BIOS 

	953Euro. 
	118.86
	113,273Pkr 
	

	

	3. 
	Crash Cart  Trolley with all accessories

	M/s. Bench Mark 
	39,800Pkr 
	-
	39,800Pkr
	M/s. Bench Mark approved as 1st lowest 

	

	4. 
	Color Ultrasound Machine with 3 Probes
	M/s. Medequip
	33,700US$.

	104.5

	3,521,650Pkr 

	
M/s. BIOS approved as 1st lowest



	5. 
	
	M/s. BIOS

	22,794US$.
	104.5
	2,381,973Pkr 
	

	

	6. 
	Modular Hand Set
	M/s. ZAM Trading 
	680,000Pkr 
	-
	680,000Pkr
	Quoted rate is very high from the approved rate of PC-1, hence may be retender.  


	

	7. 
	Monologue LCP small Fragment Set
	M/s. ZAM Trading 
	550,000Pkr 
	-
	550,000Pkr
	Quoted rate is very high from the approved rate of PC-1, hence may be retender.  


	

	8. 
	Interlocking humorous interlocking set
	M/s. ZAM Trading 
	370,000Pkr 
	-
	370,000Pkr
	Quoted rate is very high from the approved rate of PC-1, hence may be retender.  


	

	9. 
	Pneumatic Drill with Saw
	M/s. ZAM Trading 
	3,000,000Pkr 
	-
	3,000,000Pkr
	Quoted rate is very high from the approved rate of PC-1, hence may be retender.  


	

	10. 
	Pneumatic Tourniquet
	M/s. BIOS 
	3,800 Euro. 
	118.86
	451,668Pkr
	Quoted rate is very high from the approved rate of PC-1, hence may be retender.  



	

	11. 
	Gel Pads for Operation Table
	
	No bid received hence may be retender. 


	

	12. 
	THR Instrument set
	M/s. Khalid Corp. 

	179,000Pkr


	-
	
	
M/s. Khalid Corp. approved as 1st lowest


	13. 
	
	M/s. ZAM Trading 
	1,150,000Pkr 

	
	
	

	

	14. 
	Radiolucent Ortho table with all accessories
	M/s. BIOS


	26,100US$.

	104.5

	2,727,450Pkr

	
M/s. BIOS approved as 1st lowest



	15. 
	
	M/s. Mediline 
	27,500US$. 
	104.5
	2,873,750Pkr
	

	

	16. 
	Ultrasonic bone density calculator
	
	No bid received hence may be retender


	

	17. 
	Dental Unit
	M/s. Universal Ent. 

	3408US$. 
	104.5
	356,136Pkr
	M/s. Universal Ent. approved as 1st lowest

	18. 
	
	M/s. Combined Eng. 
	588,786Pkr
	104.5
	588,786Pkr
	

	

	19. 
	Autoclave dental complete automated
	M/s. Combined Eng. 
	290,000Pkr
	-
	290,000Pkr
	M/s. Combined Eng. approved as 1st lowest



	

	20. 
	Oil free compressor heavy duty with 3 motors
	M/s. Combined Eng. 
	280,000Pkr
	-
	280,000Pkr
	M/s. Combined Eng. approved as 1st lowest



	

	21. 
	High speed contra angle hand pieces
	M/s. Combined Eng. 
	30,000Pkr
	-
	30,000Pkr
	M/s. Combined Eng. approved as 1st lowest



	

	22. 
	HB push button (hand pieces high speed contra angle)
	M/s. Combined Eng. 
	40,000Pkr
	-
	40,000Pkr
	M/s. Combined Eng. approved as 1st lowest



	

	23. 
	Dental Scalar with 6 tips
	M/s. Combined Eng. 
	98,900Pkr
	-
	98,900Pkr
	M/s. Combined Eng. approved as 1st lowest



	

	24. 
	Dental hand pieces disinfectant
	M/s. Combined Eng. 
	95,000Pkr
	-
	95,000Pkr
	M/s. Combined Eng. approved as 1st lowest


	

	25. 
	Dental instrument cabinet
	M/s. Combined Eng. 

	38,500Pkr

	-
	38,500Pkr

	M/s. Combined Eng. approved as 1st lowest

	26. 
	
	
M/s. Khalid Corp. 
	
45,000Pkr
	
	
45,000Pkr

	

	

	27. 
	Water filter
	M/s. Combined Eng. 

	5,000Pkr

	-
	5,000Pkr

	M/s. Combined Eng. approved as 1st lowest

	28. 
	
	
M/s. Khalid Corp
	
12,000Pkr
	
	
12,000Pkr
	

	

	29. 
	Ophthalmic Unit
	M/s. Ameerdin & Sons
	764,000Pkr
	-
	764,000Pkr
	M/s. Ameerdin & Sons approved as 1st lowest


	

	30. 
	Wall mounted ophthalmoscope
	M/s. Ameerdin & Sons
	138,000Pkr
	-
	138,000Pkr
	M/s. Ameerdin & Sons approved as 1st lowest


	

	31. 
	Cataract set (Surgical Cutting instruments)
	M/s. Khalid Corp

	28,000Pkr

	-
	38,000Pkr

	
M/s. Khalid Corp. approved as 1st lowest

	32. 
	
	
M/s. Bench Mark 
	
49,500Pkr
	
	
49,500Pkr

	

	

	33. 
	Glaucoma set
	M/s. Khalid Corp

	42,000Pkr

	-
	42,000Pkr

	
M/s. Khalid Corp. approved as 1st lowest

	34. 
	
	
M/s. Bench Mark 
	
49,500Pkr
	
	
49,500Pkr
	

	

	35. 
	Digital Radiography
	M/s. Medequips

	80,786Euro. 

	118.86

	9,602,224Pkr

	
M/s. BIOS. approved as 1st lowest


	36. 
	
	
M/s. BIOS
	
66,000Euro. 
	
118.86

	
7,844,760Pkr

	

	

	37. 
	Computer with laser printer with accessories
	M/s. Khalid Corp.



	85,000Pkr
	-
	85,000Pkr
	M/s. Khalid Corp. approved as 1st lowest

	

	38. 
	Cautery Machine

	M/s. Universal Ent. 
	1,420Euro.
	118.86
	168,781Pkr
	M/s. Universal Ent. approved as 1st lowest


	

	39. 
	Wood lamp
	M/s. Khalid Corp.
	45,000Pkr
	-
	45,000Pkr
	M/s. Khalid Corp. approved as 1st lowest


	

	40. 
	Electrolyte Analyzer
	M/s. Meditech Inst. 
	3,100US$
	104.5
	323,850Pkr
	M/s. Meditech Inst. approved as 1st lowest



	

	41. 
	Hematology Analyzer
	
	No Technically responsive bidder hence may be retender. 


	

	42. 
	Chemistry analyzer (fully automatic)
	M/s. Meditech Inst. 
	17,000US$
	104.5
	1,776,500Pkr
	M/s. Meditech Inst. approved as 1st lowest



	

	43. 
	Binocular Microscope
	M/s. Life One 

	145,000Pkr

	-
	145,000Pkr


	As per end user’s recommendation, priority  is given to Olympus brand; hence offer of M/s. Khalid Corp is approved. 



	44. 
	
	M/s. Khalid Corp.
	145,000Pkr
	
	145,000Pkr
	

	

	45. 
	Incubator
	M/s. Life One 
	129,000Pkr 
	-
	129,000Pkr
	M/s. Life One approved as 1st lowest


	

	46. 
	Centrifuge
	M/s. Life One 
	179,000Pkr 
	-
	179,000Pkr
	M/s. Life One approved as 1st lowest



	

	47. 
	Electronic balance
	M/s. Khalid Corp.
	210,000Pkr 
	-
	210,000Pkr
	M/s. Khalid Corp.  approved as 1st lowest



	

	48. 
	Hot air oven
	M/s. Life One 
	148,000Pkr 
	-
	148,000Pkr
	M/s. Life One approved as 1st lowest


	

	49. 
	Juster pipettes
	
	
	
	
	No bid received hence item may be retender. 


	

	50. 
	Water bath
	M/s. Life One 
	146,900Pkr 
	-
	146,900Pkr
	M/s. Life One approved as 1st lowest



	

	51. 
	Autoclave (Medium Size)
	M/s. Mediline 
	2265US$ 
	104.5
	236,692Pkr
	M/s. Mediline approved as 1st lowest


	

	52. 
	Stimulator D.L II , plastic body
	
	No bid received hence item may be retender 


	

	53. 
	Shortwave diathermy
	M/s. BIOS 

	3,800GBP

	150.87
	573,306Pkr

	
M/s. BIOS approved as 1st lowest


	54. 
	
	M/s. Khalid Corp. 
	625,000Pkr
	
	625,000Pkr


	

	

	55. 
	Tread mill
	M/s. Life One 
	208,000Pkr 
	-
	208,000Pkr
	M/s. Life One approved as 1st lowest


	

	56. 
	Cycles
	M/s. Life One 

	65,000Pkr 

	-
	65,000Pkr

	M/s. Khalid Corp.  approved as 1st lowest


	57. 
	
	
M/s. Khalid Corp. 
	
38,000Pkr 
	
	
38,000Pkr
	

	

	58. 
	Stepper
	M/s. Khalid Corp. 
	24,000Pkr 
	-
	24,000Pkr
	M/s. Khalid Corp. approved as 1st lowest


	

	59. 
	Quadriceps drill
	M/s. Life One 
	65,000Pkr 
	-
	65,000Pkr
	M/s. Life One approved as 1st lowest


	

	60. 
	Shoulder pullies
	M/s. Life One 

	5,500Pkr 

	-
	5,500Pkr

	M/s. Life One approved as 1st lowest


	61. 
	
	M/s. Khalid Corp .
	9,500Pkr
	
	9,500Pkr
	

	

	62. 
	Biceptor
	M/s. Life One 
	39,000Pkr 

	-
	39,000Pkr
	M/s. Life One approved as 1st lowest

	

	63. 
	Heavy duty surgical drum
	M/s. Life One 
	10,500Pkr 
	-
	10,500Pkr 
	
M/s. Bench Mark  approved as 1st lowest


	64. 
	
	
M/s. Khalid Corp .

	
10,500Pkr

	
	
10,500Pkr

	

	65. 
	
	M/s. Bench Mark 
	9,500Pkr
	
	9,500Pkr
	

	

	66. 
	Oxygen cylinder with stand 240 cft.
	M/s. ZAM Trading

	55,000Pkr 

	-
	55,000Pkr 

	M/s. Khalid Corp.  approved as 1st lowest


	67. 
	
	M/s. Khalid Corp .

	38,000Pkr
	
	38,000Pkr
	

	

	68. 
	Oxygen flow meter pressure gauge
	M/s. Life One

	6,700Pkr 

	-
	6,700Pkr 

	M/s. Life one  approved as 1st lowest


	69. 
	
	M/s. Khalid Corp .
	13,000Pkr
	
	13,000Pkr
	

	

	70. 
	BP Apparatus
	M/s. Bench Mark 

	1,950Pkr 

	-
	1,950Pkr 

	M/s. Bench Mark  approved as 1st lowest


	71. 
	
	M/s. Khalid Corp .
	3,800Pkr
	
	3,800Pkr
	

	

	72. 
	Diathermy unit
	M/s. BIOS

	2,885US$. 

	104.5

	301,482Pkr 

	
M/s. BIOS  approved as 1st lowest


	73. 
	
	M/s. Universal Entp. 
	5,845Euro. 
	118.86
	694,737Pkr


	

	

	74. 
	Basic instrument set
	M/s. Bench Mark 

	96,600Pkr 

	-
	96,600Pkr 

	M/s. Khalid Corp.  approved as 1st lowest


	75. 
	
	M/s. Khalid Corp .

	68,000Pkr

	
	68,000Pkr

	

	76. 
	
	M/s. Life One 
	108,000Pkr 

	
	108,000Pkr 

	

	

	77. 
	Anesthesia unit with electronic ventilator
	M/s. Noor Int. 

	16,400Euro. 

	118.86

	1,949,304Pkr

	

M/s. BIOS  approved as 1st lowest

	78. 
	
	M/s. Mediline

	20,000US$. 

	104.5

	2,090,000Pkr

	

	79. 
	
	M/s. BIOS

	9,850GBP. 

	150.87

	1,486,069Pkr

	

	80. 
	
	M/s. Shirazi Trading
	29,190US$. 
	104.5
	3,050,355Pkr
	

	

	81. 
	OT Ceiling lights (110,000 lux or more)
	M/s. BIOS 

	4,750US$. 

	104.5

	496,375Pkr

	


M/s. BIOS  approved as 1st lowest


	82. 
	
	
M/s. Universal Ent. 

	
5,901.50GBP. 

	
150.87

	
890,359Pkr

	

	83. 
	
	
M/s. Mediline 

	
8,125US$. 
	
104.5
	
849,062Pkr
	

	

	84. 
	Laryngoscope 4 blades
	M/s. Bench Mark

	14,400Pkr. 

	-
	14,400Pkr. 

	
M/s. Life One approved as 1st lowest


	85. 
	
	
M/s. Life One 
	
9,900Pkr
	
	
9,900Pkr
	

	

	86. 
	Infusion pump
	M/s. Mediline 

	580GBP. 

	150.87

	87,505Pkr

	

M/s. Mediline approved as 1st lowest



	87. 
	
	M/s. Noor Intl.

	1195US$. 

	104.5

	124,877Pkr 

	

	88. 
	
	M/s. Universal Ent. 
	1,232.50US$. 
	104.5

	128,796Pkr 

	

	

	89. 
	Labor table
	M/s. Bench Mark 

	235,000Pkr

	-
	235,000Pkr

	M/s. Life One approved as 1st lowest


	90. 
	
	M/s. Life One 
	191,000Pkr
	
	191,000Pkr

	

	

	91. 
	Minor OT Table 
	M/s. Mediline 


	1800US$. 
	104.5
	188,100Pkr 
	M/s. Mediline  approved as 1st lowest



	

	92. 
	Defibrillator
	M/s. BIOS 
	3,750Euro. 
	118.86
	445,725Pkr 
	M/s. BIOS approved as 1st lowest



	

	93. 
	Dressing set
	M/s. Bench Mark 

	12,500Pkr

	-
	12,500Pkr

	M/s. Khalid Corp. approved as 1st lowest






	94. 
	
	M/s. Life One 

	13,900Pkr

	
	13,900Pkr

	

	95. 
	
	M/s. Khalid Corp.
	7,800Pkr
	
	7,800Pkr
	

	

	96. 
	NO2 cylinder
	M/s. ZAM Trading 

	72,000Pkr

	-
	72,000Pkr

	M/s. Khalid Corp. approved as 1st lowest


	97. 
	
	M/s. Khalid Corp.
	41,500Pkr
	
	41,500Pkr
	

	

	98. 
	OT Table (Electro/hydraulic with all ancillaries)
	M/s. BIOS 

	15,700US$. 

	104.5

	1,640,650Pkr

	
M/s. BIOS. approved as 1st lowest


	99. 
	
	M/s. Noor Intl.
	19,250Euro. 

	118.86
	2,288,055Pkr
	

	

	100. 
	Centralized oxygen system O.T , all new wards & 20 bedded resuscitation room
	M/s. Universal Ent. 
	25,222,280Pkr
	-
	25,222,280Pkr
	Quoted rate is very high from the approved rates of PC-1 hence item may be retender. 


	

	101. 
	Air Conditioner 1.5Ton split type

	M/s. Khalid Corp.
	68,000Pkr. 
	-
	68,000Pkr.
	M/s. Khalid Corp. approved as 1st lowest






	S.No.
	Furniture & Miscellaneous
	Name of bidder
	Unit Price 
PKR
	Remarks

	1. 
	Sofa set (Double seated)
	M/s. Khalid Corporation

	36,000

	

Samples not provided hence item may be retender

	2. 
	
	M/s. Bench Mark

	14,400

	

	3. 
	
	M/s. ZAM TRADING  

	14,000
	

	

	4. 
	Sofa set (5 set )
	M/s. Khalid Corporation

	58,000

	
Samples not provided hence item may be retender

	5. 
	
	M/s. Bench Mark

	59,600

	

	6. 
	
	M/s. ZAM TRADING  

	34,000
	

	

	7. 
	Revolving office chair

	M/s. Khalid Corporation

	12,800

	Samples not provided 

	8. 
	
	M/s. Bench Mark

	9,400

	Samples approved, hence order may be awarded to M/s. Bench Mark 

	9. 
	
	M/s. ZAM TRADING  

	8,000
	Samples not approved

	

	10. 
	Seats for patient (Three Seated)

	M/s. Khalid Corporation

	10,500

	Samples not provided 


	11. 
	
	M/s. Bench Mark

	5,400

	Samples approved, hence order may be awarded to M/s. Bench Mark


	12. 
	
	M/s. ZAM TRADING  
	8,400
	Samples not provided 


	

	13. 
	Kitchen Utensils
	M/s. Khalid Corporation


	15,000
	Samples approved, hence order may be awarded to M/s. Khalid Corp. 


	

	14. 
	Over bed table
	M/s. Khalid Corporation

	8750

	Samples approved

	15. 
	
	M/s. Bench Mark

	7950

	Samples approved, order may be  awarded to M/s. Bench Mark as 1st lowest 


	16. 
	
	M/s. ZAM TRADING  

	5000

	Samples not provided 

	17. 
	
	M/s. TK Medical 


	7500
	Samples not approved


	

	18. 
	Office chair
	M/s. Khalid Corporation

	6,500

	Samples not provided 


	19. 
	
	M/s. Bench Mark


	3,850

	Samples approved, hence order may be awarded to M/s. Bench Mark


	20. 
	
	M/s. ZAM TRADING  

	3800

	Samples not approved

	21. 
	
	M/s. TK Medical 
	3200
	Samples not approved

	

	22. 
	Almirah 6x3    
	M/s. Khalid Corporation


	13,800

	Samples not provided 


	23. 
	
	M/s. Bench Mark


	14750
	Samples approved

	24. 
	
	
M/s. ZAM TRADING  

	
23000

	Samples not provided 


	25. 
	
	M/s. TK Medical 


	12500
	Samples approved, hence order may be awarded to M/s. TK Medical as 1st lowest 


	


	26. 
	File office cabinet  
	M/s. Khalid Corporation

	13500

	Samples not provided 


	27. 
	
	M/s. Bench Mark

	9,800

	Samples approved, order may be awarded to M/s. Bench Mark as 1st lowest 


	28. 
	
	M/s. ZAM TRADING  

	21000

	Samples approved

	29. 
	
	M/s. TK Medical 


	
12500
	Samples approved

	

	30. 
	Revolving stool
	M/s. Khalid Corporation

	4,700

	Samples approved

	31. 
	
	M/s. Bench Mark

	6,800

	Samples approved

	32. 
	
	M/s. ZAM TRADING  

	2,500

	Samples not provided 


	33. 
	
	M/s. TK Medical 


	2,700
	Samples approved, order may be awarded to M/s. TK Medical  as 1st lowest 


	

	34. 
	Refrigerator
	M/s. Khalid Corporation


	48,000
	M/s. Khalid Corporation approved as 1st lowest

	

	35. 
	Fowler bed

	M/s. Khalid Corporation

	47,800

	Samples approved

	36. 
	
	M/s. Bench Mark

	29500

	Samples approved, order may be awarded to M/s. Bench Mark as 1st lowest 


	37. 
	
	M/s. ZAM TRADING  

	26000

	Samples not provided 

	38. 
	
	M/s. TK Medical 

	44000

	Samples approved

	39. 
	
	M/s. Mediline 
	51,000
42,500
	Samples approved

	

	40. 
	Bed side locker
	M/s. Khalid Corporation

	9,500

	Samples approved, order may be awarded to M/s. Khalid Corp. as 1st lowest 

	41. 
	
	M/s. Bench Mark

	10,800

	Samples approved,

	42. 
	
	M/s. ZAM TRADING  

	11,000

	Samples not provided 


	43. 
	
	M/s. TK Medical 


	9,200

	Samples not approved

	

	44. 
	Sound /calling system
	M/s. Khalid Corporation



	
	M/s. Khalid Corporation approved as 1st lowest 

	

	45. 
	Examination couch
	M/s. Khalid Corporation


	148,000

	Samples not provided 


	46. 
	
	M/s. ZAM TRADING  


	9,000

	Samples not provided 


	47. 
	
	M/s. TK Medical 


	12,900

	Samples approved, order may be awarded to M/s. TK Medical as 1st lowest 



	48. 
	
	M/s. Bench Mark 


	16,700

	Samples approved

	

	49. 
	Audiovisual system
	M/s. Khalid Corporation



	285,000
	M/s. Khalid Corporation approved as 1st lowest 

	

	50. 
	Stretcher

	M/s. Khalid Corporation

	24,000

	

Samples not provided , hence item may be retender 


	51. 
	
	M/s. Bench Mark

	39,800

	

	52. 
	
	M/s. ZAM TRADING  

	18,000

	

	53. 
	
	M/s. TK Medical 

	13,500
	

	

	      19 .
	Mattress
	M/s. Khalid Corporation
	8,200
	Samples approved


	
	
	M/s. Bench Mark


	8650

	
Samples approved

	
	
	M/s. ZAM TRADING  

	7,500

	Samples approved

	
	
	M/s. TK Medical 


	7,700
	Samples approved

	
	
	M/s. Mediline 


	8,200
7,200
	Samples approved
Samples approved, order may be awarded to M/s. Mediline as 1st lowest

	

	      20. 
	Drip Stand
	M/s. Khalid Corporation

	7,800

	Samples approved, order may be awarded to M/s. Khalid Corp. as 1st lowest 


	
	
	M/s. Bench Mark

	10,700

	Samples approved

	
	
	M/s. ZAM TRADING  

	6,200

	Samples not provided 


	
	
	M/s. TK Medical 


	6,600
	Samples not approved









_____________________________					_____________________________
Dr. Abdul Qayoom							Dr. Capt. Zahid Iqbal
Senior Surgeon, Services Hospital					Incharge, X-Ray Department 
Karachi (Member) 							Services Hospital, Karachi (Member) 





_____________________________					_____________________________
Representative of Deputy Commission					Representative of Accountant General 
Sindh - Karachi (Member) 						Sindh- Karachi (Member) 





					_____________________________
					          Medical Superintendent 
        Service Hospital, Karachi 
[bookmark: _GoBack]       (Chairman)
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