ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION AGENCY
GOVERNMENT OF SINDH.

NIT Sr. No. SPPRA Serial No. 26
INF-KRY No/492/16

Method and Procedure of Procurement : Open Competitive Bidding (National Competitive

Bidding) (Single Stage One Envelope)

Name of ADP Scheme: - STUDY OF ENVIRONMENTAL & HEALTH IMPACT OF

702

PESTICIDES AND CHEMICAL FERTILIZER 1IN

SINDH

PROVINCE.

MINUTES OF MEETING FOR OPENING OF FINANCIAL BID:

A meeting for opening of tender for opening of Financial Bid for procurement of Physical
Assets, Printing and Out sourcing Field Activities for above referred ADP Scheme was held on

14-03-2016 at 12:30 P.M in Committee Room of EPA Complex. The following m¢mbers of

tender Opening Committee were present:

S.No. | Name Designation Department

1. Irfan Ahmed Abbasi | Director (A&F) SEPA Chairman

2, Musarrat Mokhtar Deputy Director Industries Department Member

3. Mubark Ali Assistant Director | SEPA Member

The meeting was started with the reciting of verses of Holy Quran . The Assistan
briefed the Committee members that the sealed Tenders were invited as per SPP Rules

Director
2010 for

the said ADP Scheme .He further briefed that Purchasing date starting from 28-02-2016 to 14-

03-2016. Submission date on 14-03-2016 upto 12 . Noon whereas. opening date of t

was 14-03-2016 at 12:30 P.M The Assistant Director further briefed that 5 bidders purg

bidding documents and submitted the same in time.
1. Danyal Traders

2. USS Enterprises Copy of Attendance Sheet attached
3. Sajid Traders

4. M/s GEMS

5. M/s EMC

The committee started the proceeding of opening of tender in front of aforen

hased th

he tender

(=

nentioned

bidders and read loudly the names of each bidders one by one opening their respegtive bids
and also read aloud bid amount and other details as depicted as follows :
Head: Procurement for Furniture
[tem No. 1: Executive Table & Revolving Chair with side rack Visitor Chair 7
S.No. Name of Firm Bidder Contractor quoted bid | Mathematically corrected Rank in l
amount in Rs: Bid amount in Rs:
1. Sajid Traders 99.786 I
2. Danyal Traders 1,01.500 2
3. USS Enterprises 1.02.000 -
4. M/s GEMS Not quoted A
5. M/s EMC Not quoted
As Sajid Traders quoted Lowest rate therefore committee decided to procure 3 sets Executive
Table & Revolving Chair with side rack Visitor Chair from Sajid Traders at quoted price Rs[99.786/-

per set having Total Cost of Rs2,99.358/-

)




S/N | Item Number of Item | Lowest quoted Bid _J_Tptal_Cost
1 | Executive Table & Revolving Chair with | 3 Rs99.786/- | Rs2,99.358/-
side rack Visitor Chair {
Item No. 2: Table & Revolving Chair with side rack Visitor Chair
S.No. | Name of Firm Bidder Contractor quoted bid Mathematically corrected Rank in |
amount in Rs: Bid amount in Rs: - '
1. Sajid Traders 79,786 o
2. Danyal Traders 80.000 ]
3. USS Enterprises 81,000 -
4. M/s GEMS Not quoted o .
5. M/s EMC Not quoted |
As Sajid Traders quoted Lowest rate therefore committee decided to procure 2 gets
Executive Table & Revolving Chair with side rack Visitor Chair from Sajid Traders at quqted price Rs
79,786/ per set having Total Cost of Rs1,59,572/-
S/N | ltem Number of Item | Lowest quoted Bid | Total Cost
1 Table & Revolving Chair with side rack | 2 ' Rs 79,786/ Rs1,59,572/-
Visitor Chair -
[tem No. 3: Table & Revolving Chair with Visitor Chair for Staff
S.No. | Name of Firm Bidder Contractor quoted bid Mathematically corrected Rank in
amount in Rs: Bid amount in Rs: -
1. Sajid Traders 39,986 | N
2, Danyal Traders 41000 2
3. USS Enterprises 42000 3
4, M/s GEMS Not quoted -
5 M/s EMC Not quoted o
As Sajid Traders quoted Lowest rate therefore committee decided to procure 3 gets Table &
Revolving Chair with side rack Visitor Chair from Sajid Traders at quoted price Rs39,986/ per set
having Total Cost of Rs3,99,860/-
S/N | Item Number of Item Lowest quoted Bid Total Cost
1 Table & Revolving Chair with Visitor | 10 Rs39,986/ Rs3,99,860/
Chair for Staff
Item No. 4: Computer Desk with Chair
S.No. | Name of Firm Bidder | Contractor quoted bid Mathematically correctgd Rank in
amount in Rs: Bid amount in Rs:
1. Sajid Traders 19,786 1 |
2 Danyal Traders 21,000 - 2
3 USS Enterprises 21,500 T 1 3
4, M/s GEMS Not quoted B
5. M/s EMC Not quoted _
As Sajid Traders quoted Lowest rate therefore committee decided to procure 2 spts E
Computer Desk with Chair from Sajid Traders at quoted price Rs 19,786/ per set having Tptal Cost of
Rs39,572/-
Item Number of | Lowest quoted Total Cost
Item Bid
Computer Desk with Chair 2 Rs 19,786/ Rs39,572/-

Ny
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Item No. 5: Almirah

S.No. Name of Firm Bidder Contractor Mathematically Rank in
. quoted bid corrected Bid amount
amount in Rs: in Rs:
L. Sajid Traders 9.986 |
2, Danyal Traders 12,000 2 N
3. USS Enterprises 12,500 3
4. M/s GEMS Not quoted
5, M/s EMC Not quoted S

As Sajid Traders quoted Lowest rate therefore committee decided to procure 10 sets
Almirah from Sajid Traders at quoted price Rs 9.986/ per set having Total Cost of Rs 99,860/-

S/N | Item Number of | Lowest quoted Total Cost
Item Bid
5 Almirah 10 Rs 9.986/ Rs 99,860/-
Office Equipment
Item No. 1: Multipurpose printing Machine
S.No. Name of Firm Bidder Contractor Mathematically Rank in \’
quoted bid corrected Bid amount i
amount in Rs: in Rs: )
1. Sajid Traders 1,79,786 1
2 Danyal Traders 180000 2 '
3, USS Enterprises 182000 3
4, M/s GEMS Not quoted ]
5 M/s EMC Not quoted i
As Sajid Traders quoted Lowest rate therefore committee decided to procure 2 sets
Multipurpose printing Machine from Sajid Traders at quoted price Rs Rs 1,79,786/-per set haying
Total Cost of Rs3,59,572/-
S/N | Item Number of | Lowest quoted Total Cost
Iltem Bid
1 Multipurpose printing Machine 2 Rs 1,79,786/- Rs3,59,572/-
[tem No. 2: Multimedia Projector alongwith screen
S.No. | Name of Firm Bidder | Contractor quoted bid Mathematically corrected Rank in
‘ amount in Rs: Bid amount in Rs:
1. Sajid Traders f 89,986 1
2. Danyal Traders ‘ 92000 2 - |
3. USS Enterprises 93000 3 I
4. M/s GEMS Not quoted ?
5, M/s EMC Not quoted N

As Sajid Traders quoted Lowest rate therefore committee decided to procure 1 set

Multimedia Projector alongwith screen from Sajid Traders at quoted price Rs 89,986/ per sef having
Total Cost of Rs 89,986/~

=
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S/N | Item Number of | Lowest quoted Total Cos ‘

ltem Bid :

2 Multimedia Projector alongwith screen | Rs 89,986/- Rs 89,986/- B

[tem No. 3: Generator

S.No. Name of Firm Bidder Contractor Mathematically Rhnk in |

quoted bid corrected Bid amount |

amount in Rs: in Rs: |

1. Sajid Traders 5,49,986 | |

2 Danyal Traders 5,51,000 2 !

3. USS Enterprises 5,55,000 3 1

4. M/s GEMS Not quoted N
S M/s EMC Not quoted

As Sajid Traders quoted Lowest rate therefore committee decided to procure 1 set

Generator from Sajid Traders at quoted price Rs 5,49,986/ per set having Total Cost of Rs 5,49,986/
S/N | Item ‘Number of | Lowest quoted Total Cost
Item Bid
3 Generator | Rs 5,49,986/ Rs 5,49,986/
Item No. 4: Digital Cameras
S.No. Name of Firm Bidder Contractor Mathematically Rapk in |
quoted bid corrected Bid amount
amount in Rs: in Rs:
b Sajid Traders 19,986 I
2, Danyal Traders 21,000 2
3. USS Enterprises 21,500 3
4. M/s GEMS Not quoted
3, M/s EMC Not quoted
As Sajid Traders quoted Lowest rate therefore committee decided to procure 10 sets|Digital
Cameras from Sajid Traders at quoted price Rs 20,000/ per set having Total Cost of Rs1,99,86Q/-
S/N | Item Number of | Lowest quoted Total Cost
Item Bid
4 Digital Cameras 10 Rs 19,986/- Rs 1,99,860/-
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‘Head : Computers Equipment

Item No. 1: Computers Accessories and Printer including Ups

S.No. Name of Firm Bidder Contractor Mathematically Rank in
quoted bid corrected Bid amount
amount in Rs: in Rs:

L. Danyal Traders 99,786 1

2 Sajid Traders 1,01,000 2

3. USS Enterprises 1,02,000 3

4, M/s GEMS Not quoted

S, M/s EMC Not quoted

Digital Cameras from M/S Danyal Traders at quoted price Rs99,786/-per set having Total Cost df

As M/S Danyal Traders quoted Lowest rate therefore committee decided to procure Ssets

Rs4,98,930/-
S/N | Item Number of | Lowest quoted Total Cost
Item Bid
1 Computers Accessories and Printer | 5 Rs99,786/- Rs4,98,930/-
including Ups

Printing of Awareness Material

[tem No. : Printing of leaflets

S.No. Name of Firm Bidder Contractor Mathematically Rank in
quoted bid corrected Bid amount ’
amount in Rs: in Rs: - A,,,,!
1. USS Enterprises 16.66 ] ;
2 Danyal Traders 17 2 |
3. Sajid Traders 18 3
4. M/s GEMS Not quoted L
3. M/s EMC Not quoted 1

Booklets from M/S USS Enterprises at quoted price Rs 20,000/ per set having Total Cost of

As M/S USS Enterprises quoted Lowest rate therefore committee decided to print 60,000

Rs9.99,600/-

S/N | Iltem Number of | Lowest quoted Total Cost |
Item Bid

4 Printing of Booklet s on 60,000 60,000 Rs16.66 /- Rs9.99.600/-

On effects Chemical Fertilizer on Human

Health

AP

w_
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* OQutsourcing Field Activities

The Assistant Director further briefed that 2 bidders for outsourcing the Field Activities and
"submitted the same in time.

1. M/SGEMS
2. M/sEMS Copy of Attendance Sheet attached

Both firms found that both firms are technically sound to perform Field activities but before
the opening of Financial bid M/s EMS has submitted an application that due to some heavy
engagement they are not in position to carry out this activity therefore financial bid of M/s EMS
may retuned . .After detail discussion the committee recommended to open and award the out
sourcing Field Activities to M/S GEMS at the cost of Rs:18.500.000/-

Musarrat Mokhtar

Assistant Director EPA Deputy Director
. I}/lemb?r . Industries Department
Mubarak All

Assistant Director

Environmental Protection Agency Misarrat Mokﬁ.tar

Government of Sindh , Z eputy Director {Development)
Industries & Commerce Oepartment
Directo Goverament of Sindj Karachi
Admin & Finance
Chairman

Ir:fan hmed Abbasi

'_Di.j'ftctor (Admn, & Finance)

Environmental Protection Agency
Government of Sindh




ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION AGENCY
GOVERNMENT OF SINDH.

NIT Sr. No.

SPPRA Serial No. 26702

Method and Procedure of Procurement : Open Competitive Bidding (National Com,petitive ’

Bidding) (Single Stage One Envelope)

Name of ADP Scheme: - STUDY OF ENVIRONMENTAL & HEALTH IMPACT OF
PESTICIDES AND CHEMICAL FERTILIZER IN SINDH

PROVINCE.

BID EVALUATION REPORT

1. Name of Procuring Agency: Environmental Protection Agency

2. Tender Reference No: INF-KRY No/492/16

3. Tender description / name of work / item: STUDY_ _OF ENVIRONMENTAL &
HEALTH IMPACT OF PESTICIDES AND CHEMICAL FERTILIZER IN SINDH
PROVINCE

4. Method of Procurement:

DOMESTIC/LOCAL

th

5. Tender published : Dawn . Jang. Newspaper on 24" Fgbruaryv.
2016 Print & Electronic Media (NIT Sr. No. SPPRA Serial No.[26702)
6. Total Bids Documents Sold : b
7. Total Bids Received: 5
8. Bids rejected : 0
9. Financial bid opening date : 14-3-2016
10. Bid Evaluation Report : enclosed
11. Estimated Cost :
|
S. Item Name of firm | Cost offered | Rankin | Comparison Reasqn&m | Rem
No of Bidder by the Bidder gin with Sfor ark
terms Estimated acceptance
of cost cost Rejection |
1. | Executive Table & | Sajid Traders | Rs.99.786/- | Lowest | Lowest from the | Accepted
estimated Cost oh the basis |

Revolving Chair |
with side rack of Lowest l
Visitor Chair |

2. | Table & Revolving | Sajid Traders | Rs. 79.786/- Lowest | Lowest from the | |
Chair with side estimated Cost |
rack Visitor Chair | B i
3. | Table & Revolving | Sajid Traders | Rs.39.986/- | Lowest | Lowest from the |
Chair with Visitor estimated Cost |
Chair for Staff .
4. | Computer Desk Sajid Traders | Rs. 19,786/- Lowest | Lowest from the j
with Chair estimated Cost ;
o Almirah Sajid Traders Rs. 9.986/- Lowest | Lowest from the [

estimated Cost

\x/\%g
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Signature of the Members of the Committee

W\

Mubark Al
Assistant Director EPA

Member, .
lem erAll

L1 aralk

Assistant Director
Environmental Protection Agency
Government of Sindh

oyt

irector

Admin & Finance

Musarrat Mokhtar
Deputy Director

De

Industries Department

Musarrat Mokh

Director {Cevelopment)
ries & Commerce Department
Government of Sindh Karachi

Chairman
Irfan Ahmed Abbasi
Director (Admn, & Finance)
Environmental Protection Agency'
Government of Sindh

6. | Multipurpose Sajid Traders | Rs. 1.79.786/- | Lowest | Lowest from the
* | printing Machine estimated Cost
7. | Multimedia Sajid Traders | Rs.89.986/- | Lowest | Lowest from the
Projector estimated Cost
alongwith screen
8. | Generator Sajid Traders | Rs. 549.986/- | Lowest | Lowest from the
estimated Cost o
9. | Digital Cameras Sajid Traders | Rs. 19,986/- Lowest | Lowest from the
estimated Cost
10. | Computers Danyal Traders | Rs. 99,986/- Lowest | Lowest from the
Accessories and estimated Cost
Printer including
Ups
11. | Printing of leaflets | USS Enterprises Rs16.66 Lowest | Lowest from the
on in Sindhi, Urdu estimated Cost
& English (60000
each)
12. | Outsourcing Field | M/s GEMS Rs:18.,500.000/ | Lowest | Lowest from the
Activities = estimated Cost




ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION AGENCY
GOVERNMENT OF SINDH.

Inf Kry No. 491/16 Dated: 24/Feb/2016

Name of ADP Scheme : STUDY OF ENVIRONMENTAL & HEALTH IMPA(C

BIDDERS QUALIFICATION REPORT

T _OF

PESTICIDES AND CHEMICAL FERTILIZER IN SINDH
PROVINCE.
Name of Procuring Agency Environmental Protection Agency ]
,!
Tender Reference Number Inf-Kry No. 492/16 Dated 24-Feb-2016 i
|
Method of Procurement Single Stage One Envelope Procedure i
Tender Fee/Cost of Bidding Document Rs.500/-
Sr. | Bidder’s Qualification Firms
No.
1. | Name of Firm/Bidder M/s GEMS | M/s EMC M/s USS M/s Sajii | M’s
Enterprises | Traders Danyal |
2. | Registration with Income Tax Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes 1
Department |
3. | Registration with SRB Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes 1
4. | Bank statement showing cash Yes Yes 1es Yes Yes
balance ]
5. | 2 % Earnest money Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes 1
6. | Firm has not been blacklist Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes ‘
previously by any executing ;
agency N
7. | All documents information Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes E
furnished are true & correct | L |

—

Musarrat Mokhtar

Assistant Director EPA Deputy Director
“Member Industries Department
Mubarak Alj Musarrat MoKkhtar
. Assistant Director ' DeputyBirector (Development)
Environmental Protectipn Agency Indusdties & Commerce Department

Government of Sindh TJC_I_\/ Ggvernment of Sindh Karachi
irector ‘

Admin & Finance

Chairman ‘
Infan; Ahmed Abbasi.

Mnanee)
d

- - & T Y

_';m_f::cmr {Admn, & Financd

wivironmental Protectip n’Agcn“g'
Government wf Qind#




ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION AGENCY

GOVERNMENT OF SINDH.

NIT Sr. No. SPPRA Serial No. 26702

COMPARATIVE STATEMENT

Admin & Finance

Chairman

{rfan Ahmed Abbss1

Director (

{(snvernment »
overnment Jl o

Admn. & Finance)
1 Uentectibn Agency

1h

Name of Work: “STUDY OF ENVIRONMENTAL & HEALTH IMPACT OF
PESTICIDES AND CHEMICAL FERTILIZER IN I|SINDH
PROVINCE”
S.NO | Details Qty Name of Bidders/ Rate Per unit cost including all Govt taxes
M/S Sajid M/S Danyal | M/S USS M/sIGEMS [ M/S
Traders Traders Enterprises | EMC
Head: Procurement for Furniture [ e
1. | Executive Table & Revolving | 3 sets | Rs. 99,786/- Rs. 1.01.500- | Rs1.02.000/~ | No bjd Nobid |
Chair with side rack Visitor }
Chair N | 1
2. | Table & Revolving Chair with 2 sets Rs. 79,786/- Rs. 80.000/- Rs. 81.000/- No bid [ No bid |
side rack Visitor Chair N
3. | Table & Revolving Chair with 10sets Rs. 39.986/- Rs. 41000/- Rs. 42000/- No bid No bid
Visitor Chair for Staff .
4. | Computer Desk with Chair 2 sels Rs. 19.786/- Rs. 21000/- Rs. 21.500/- No bid No bid
5. | Almirah 10sets | Rs. 9,986/ Rs. 12000/- Rs12.500/- No bid | Nobid |
Head: Office Equipment |
1. | Multipurpose printing Machine 2sets | Rs.1,79,786/- | Rs. 180000/ Rs. 182000/ | No bid No bid
2. | Multimedia Projector alongwith | set Rs. 89.986/- Rs. 92000/ Rs. 93000/ No bid No bid
screen ]
3. | Generator I 'set | Rs.549.986/- | Rs.5.51.000/ Rs5.55.000/ | No bifi [ Nobid
4. | Digital Cameras 10sets | Rs. 19.986/- Rs. 21000/ Rs. 21.500/ No bi LNn bid
Head: Computer Equipment i
1 Computers Accessories and 5 Sets | Rs. 1,01,000/ Rs. 99.986/- Rs. 1,02,000 No bid No bid |
Printer including Ups .
Head: Awareness Printing Material |
Printing of leaflets | (60000) | 16.66 17 18 No bi No bid |
Head: Qutsourcing Field Activities N
Outsourcing Field 1 Job No bid No bid No bid Rs:18.5 00.000/ No bid
Activities - B
&
Mubark Ali Musarrat Mokhtar
Assistant Director EPA ' z;;{uty Director
IndUstHEELDERtidear: / ¢
Mu%?ﬁ’ﬁrmj 20Uty Diregm -f‘-;.ﬂ.,,_?,_,,,,
Assistant Director naustries & Commerce vens
Environmental Protection Agency weernment ot Sin,
Government of Sindh 7
re




ENVIRONMENTA

ATTENDANCE SHEET

FINANCIAL BID INVITATION (STUDY OF

AND CHEMICAL FERTILIZER IN SINDH PROVIN CE)

OPENING ON 14" March, 2016.

S/NO. NAME DESIGNATION ORGANIZATION SIGNATURE
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ENVIRONMENTAL & HEALTH IMPACT OF PESTICIDES

ATTENDANCE SHEET

FINANCIAL BID INVITATION (STUDY OF

AND CHEMICAL FERTILIZER IN SINDH PROVIN CE)

OPENING ON 14™ March. 2016.
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ATTENDANCE SHEET
FINANCIAL BID INVITATION ( STUDY OF

ENVIRONMENTAL & HEALTH IMPACT OF PESTICIDES

AND CHEMICAL FERTILIZER IN SINDH PROVINCE)
OPENING ON 14™ March, 2016.

Sl NAME DESIGNATION ORGANIZATION SIGNATURE
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NOTIFICATION

NO.SO(E)V-65/15: In pursuance of rule-7 of SPPRA 2010 a Procurement Committee,

GOVERNMENT OF
FOREST, ENVIRONI
WILDLIFE DEPART

Karachi dated the 07" Fe#uary 2016

SINDH
MENT &
MENT

comprising on the
s of Environmental

following is hereby constituted for procurement, executing & implementing the A.D.P. schemg
Protection Agency, Government of Sindh:-

Director (Admin & Finance),
Environmental Protection Agency

Chai

Representative from Industries Department Memb

(Not Below the rank of BPS-18 officer)

Assistant Director (Technical), Mempb

Environmental Protection Agency

The details of the A.D.P. schemes are as under:-

rman

er

er

ADP
SCHEME
NO.

TOTAL COST

HRaE: (RS.IN MILLION

IS)

350 Study of Environmental & Health impacrs of | 33 millions
nesticides and chemical fertiizer in Sindh

Province

Strengthening of Environmental Monitoring | 140 millions

351
) System in EPA

352 Environmental Awareness & Education for | 115 millions
Conservation and Protection of Natural and

Ecological Resources of Sindh

TOR’s of the committee in observation of Rule 8 of SPPRA are as under
Preparing bidding documents.

Carrying out technical as well as financial evaluation of the bids.
Preparing evaluation report as provided in Rule 45.

Making recommendations for the award of contract to the competent
authorty.
Perform any other function ancillary and incidental to the above.

-- RIZWAN MEM
Secretary tg Govt. 4
Karachi dated the 07" Febru

A copy is forwarded for information & necessary action to:-
1) Secretary (Finance), Department Govt. of Sindh, Karachi.
2) Managing Director, SPPRA, Govt. of Sindh, Karachi.
3) The Accountant General Sindh, Karachi.
t—=A) The Director General, Environmental Protection Agency, Sindh, Karachi.
5) The Chairman / Members of the Committee.
6) P.S. to Minister for Environment Department, Govt. of Sindh, Karachf.
7)

NO.SOE)V-65/15

ON -
£ Sindh

ary 2016

P.S. to Secretary, Forest, Environment & Wildlife Karachi.

The DDO / Accountant Forest & Wildlife Department:
Aw my imn PXMN@‘

tew .
/)’)’ﬂ&d ﬁﬂ/ f‘t/&’f'ﬁﬁ/ ( SYED NJS A )
SECTION OFFICER (G)
For Secretany to Govt. of Sindh
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