



## Sindh Technical Education &amp; Vocational Training Authority (STEVTA)

ST-19, Block 6, Guishan-e-Iqbal, Near NIPA, Karachi.

Phone No. 99244112-7 Fax No. 99244118

Website: <http://www.stevta.gos.pk>

## BID EVALUATION REPORT

1	Name of Procuring Agency	Sindh Technical Educational & Vocational Training Authority (STEVTA)
2	Tender Reference No.	STEVTA/WS/156/2012-13
3	Tender Description / Name of Work / Item	Construction of Technical Training Centre at Mithi Phase-I
4	Method of Procuring	Procurement of Works through Single Stage one Envelope
5	Tender Published	Advertised on 02-05-2013 through daily news paper and website of SPPRA & STEVTA.
6	Total Bids Documents Sold	03
7	Total Bids Received	03
8	Technical Bids Opening Date	N/A
9	No of Bids Technically Qualified	03
10	No of Bids Rejected	Nil
11	Financial Bid Opening Date	31-05-2013

S.No.	Name of Firm Bidder	Quoted Rate in Pak Rs.	Ranking in Terms of Cost	Comparison with Estimated Cost.	Reasons for Acceptance / Rejection	Remarks
0	1	2	3	4	5	6
1	M/s S.K & Company	Rs. 26,019,727/-	1 <sup>st</sup> Lowest	8% Above	Selected on the basis of Technically qualified and lowest price offered	Accepted (1st Lowest)
2	M/s Ishaq Bux Ansari & Brothers	Rs. 28,304,364/-	2 <sup>nd</sup> Lowest	17.58% Above	Technically qualified but offered higher rates.	2nd Lowest
3	M/s Gulzar Ahmed Ansari	Rs. 29,076,044/-	3 <sup>rd</sup> Lowest	23.22% Above	Technically qualified but offered higher rates.	3rd Lowest

Following members of the tender opening committee after due consideration have recommended for the acceptance of the lowest bid amounting to Rs. Rs. 26,019,727/- in favour of M/s S.K & Company

Name of Member	Designation	Signature	Name of Member	Designation	Signature
Mr. Ghulam Sarwar Jinyo	Director (Works & Services) / Chairman		Mr. Abdul Waheed Shaikh	Deputy Director (Works & Services)	
Mr. Wazir Ali Jalbani (Member)	Accounts Officer Mines & Mineral Development Govt of Sindh		Mr. Badar Hussain Shahani	Deputy Director (Accounts)	
Mr. Rahan M.Khan (Member)	Assistant Controller Bureau of Supply & Prices				



## Sindh Technical Education &amp; Vocational Training Authority (STEVTA)

ST-19, Block 6, Gulshan-e-Iqbal, Near NIPA, Karachi.

Phone No. 99244112-7 Fax No. 99244118

Website: <http://www.stevta.gov.pk>

## BID EVALUATION REPORT

1	Name of Procuring Agency	Sindh Technical Educational & Vocational Training Authority (STEVTA)
2	Tender Reference No.	STEVTA/WS/159/2013-14
3	Tender Description / Name of Work / Item	Construction of Polytechnic Institute Thull (Phase - II)
4	Method of Procuring	Procurement of Works through Single Stage one Envelope
5	Tender Published	Advertised on 02-05-2013 through daily news paper and website of SPPRA & STEVTA
6	Total Bids Documents Sold	03
7	Total Bids Received	03
8	Technical Bids Opening Date	N/A
9	No of Bids Technically Qualified	03
10	No of Bids Rejected	No
11	Financial Bid Opening Date	29-05-2013

S.No.	Name of Firm Bidder	Quoted Rate in Pak Rs.	Ranking in Terms of Cost	Comparison with Estimated Cost	Reasons for Acceptance / Rejection	Remarks
0	1	2	3	4	5	6
1	M/s Ahmed Haji Ghazi & Co	Rs. 31,033,832/-	1 <sup>st</sup> lowest	3.38 % Above	Selected on the basis of Technically qualification and lowest price offered	Accepted (1st Lowest)
2	M/s Al Waheed & Syed Enterprises	Rs. 31,664,987/-	2 <sup>nd</sup> Lowest	5.48 % Above	Technically qualified but offered higher rates.	-
3	M/s Asif Ah Mahar	Rs. 32,018,862/-	3 <sup>rd</sup> Lowest	6.66 % Above	Technically qualified but offered higher rates.	-

Following members of the tender opening committee after due consideration have recommended for the acceptance of the lowest bid amounting to Rs. 31,033,832/- in favour of M/s Ahmed Haji Ghazi & CO.

Name of Member	Designation	Signature	Name of Member	Designation	Signature
Mr. Ghulam Sarwar Jyo (Chairman of the Committee)	Director (Works & Services STEVTA)		Mr. Badaruddin Shahani (Member)	Deputy Director (Accounts) STEVTA	
Mr. Wazir Ali Jilbani (Member)	Accounts officer Mines & Mineral Development Govt. of Sindh		Mr. Abdul Waheed Shaikh (Secretary)	Deputy Director (Works & Services) STEVTA	
Mr. Rehan .M.Khan (Member)	Assistant Controller Bureau of Supply & Prices				



Employment through Skill

## Sindh Technical Education &amp; Vocational Training Authority (STEVA)

ST-19, Block 6, Gulshan-e-Iqbal, Near NIPA, Karachi.

Phone No. 99244112-7 Fax No. 99244118

Website: <http://www.stevta.gov.pk>

## BID EVALUATION REPORT

1	Name of Procuring Agency	Sindh Technical Educational & Vocational Training Authority (STEVA)
2	Tender Reference No.	STEVA/WS/174/2012-13
3	Tender Description / Name of Work / Item	Repair & Maintenance Works of Sindh Skill Development Program (SSDP) at Sukkur Region
4	Method of Procuring	Procurement of Works through Single Stage one Envelope
5	Tender Published	Advertised on 02-05-2013 through daily news paper and website of SPPRA & STEVA.
6	Total Bids Documents Sold	03
7	Total Bids Received	03
8	Technical Bids Opening Date	N/A
9	No of Bids Technically Qualified	03
10	No of Bids Rejected	No
11	Financial Bid Opening Date	23-05-2013

S.No.	Name of Firm Bidder	Quoted Rate in Pak Rs.	Ranking in Terms of Cost	Comparison with Estimated Cost	Reasons for Acceptance / Rejection	Remarks
0	1	2	3	4	5	6
1	M/s Mascon	Rs. 1,609,131/-	1 <sup>st</sup> lowest	14.38% Above	Selected on the basis of Technically qualification and lowest price	Accepted (1st Lowest)
2	M/s Poly Products International	Rs. 2,790,649/-	2 <sup>nd</sup> Lowest	98.36 % Above	Technically qualified but offered higher rates.	-
3	M/s Hi-Tech Poly Construction	Rs. 2,911,677/-	3 <sup>rd</sup> Lowest	106.96% Above	Technically qualified but offered higher rates.	-

Following members of the tender opening committee after due consideration have recommended for the acceptance of the lowest bid amounting to Rs. 1,609,131/- in favour of M/s Mascon.

Name of Member	Designation	Signature	Name of Member	Designation	Signature
Mr. Ghulam Sarwar Joyo (Chairman of the Committee)	Director (Works & Services STEVA)		Mr. Badaruddin Shahani (Member)	Deputy Director (Accounts) STEVA	
Mr. Wazir Ali Jilbani (Member)	Accounts officer Mines & Mineral Development Govt. of Sindh		Mr. Abdul Waheed Shaikh (Secretary)	Deputy Director (Works & Services) STEVA	
Mr. Rehan .M.Khan (Member)	Assistant Controller Bureau of Supply & Prices				



Employment through Skill

Sindh Technical Education & Vocational Training Authority (STEVA)  
ST-19, Block 6, Gulshan-e-Iqbal, Near NIPA, Karachi.  
Phone No. 99244112-7 Fax No. 99244118  
Website: <http://www.stevta.gos.pk>



**BID EVALUATION REPORT**

1	Name of Procuring Agency	Sindh Technical Educational & Vocational Training Authority (STEVA)
2	Tender Reference No.	STEVA/WS/TENDER/166
3	Tender Description / Name of Work / Item	External Development & Repair of Govt. vocational School (G). Sachal Goth, Karachi
4	Method of Procuring	Procurement of Works through Single Stage One Envelope
5	Tender Published	Dated 02-05-2013
6	Total Bids Documents Sold	03
7	Total Bids Received	03
8	Technical Bids Opening Date	Not Applicable
9	No of Bids Technically Qualified	03
10	No of Bids Rejected	No Bid Rejected
11	Financial Bid Opening Date	28/05/2013

**Bid Evaluation Report**

S.No	Name of Firm Bidder	Cost Offered by the Bidder	Ranking in Terms of Cost	Comparison with Estimated Cost	Reasons for Acceptance / Rejection	Remarks
0	1	2	3	4	5	6
1	M/S Reliant Link Enterprises	Rs.1,988,937/=	1st Lowest	0.553 % below	Selected on the basis of Technically qualification and lowest price offered	Accepted
2	M/S Zebdin Engineers	Rs.2,005,740/=	2nd Lowest	0.287 % above	Technically qualified but offered higher rates.	2nd Lowest
3	M/S Mehran Associates	Rs.2,043,860/=	3rd Lowest	2.19 % above	Technically qualified but offered higher rates.	3rd Lowest

**Signatures of Tender Opening Committee**

Name of Member	Designation	Signature	Name of Member	Designation	Signature
Mr. Ghulam Sarwar Joyo (Chairman of the Committee)	Director (Works & Services, STEVA)		Mr. Badaruddin Shahani (Member)	Deputy Director (Accounts) STEVA	
Mr. Wazir Ali Jalbani (Member)	Accounts Officer Mines & Mineral Development Department, Govt. of Sindh		Mr. Abdul Waheed Shaikh (Secretary)	Deputy Director (Works & Services) STEVA	
Mr. Rehan M. Khan (Member)	Assistant Controller Bureau of Supply & Prices				



## Sindh Technical Education &amp; Vocational Training Authority (STEVTA)

ST-19, Block 6, Gulshan-e-Iqbal, Near NIPA, Karachi.

Phone No. 99244112-7 Fax No. 99244118

Website: <http://www.stevta.gov.pk>

## BID EVALUATION REPORT

1	Name of Procuring Agency	Sindh Technical Educational & Vocational Training Authority (STEVTA)
2	Tender Reference No.	STEVTA/WS/170/2012-13
3	Tender Description / Name of Work / Item	Repair & Renovation of Government Vocational School (Girls) Qamber, District Shahdad Kot.
4	Method of Procuring	Procurement of Works through Single Stage one Envelope
5	Tender Published	Advertised on 02-05-2013 through daily news paper and website of SPPRA & STEVTA.
6	Total Bids Documents Sold	03
7	Total Bids Received	03
8	Technical Bids Opening Date	N/A
9	No of Bids Technically Qualified	03
10	No of Bids Rejected	No
11	Financial Bid Opening Date	29-05-2013

S.No.	Name of Firm Bidder	Quoted Rate in Pak Rs.	Ranking in Terms of Cost	Comparison with Estimated Cost	Reasons for Acceptance / Rejection	Remarks
0	1	2	3	4	5	6
1	M/s Anwar & Ali Associates	Rs. 5,314,006/-	1 <sup>st</sup> lowest	4.98 % Above	Selected on the basis of Technically qualification and lowest price offered	Accepted (1st Lowest)
2	M/s Siddiqui Engineers & Constructors	Rs. 5,500,876/-	2 <sup>nd</sup> Lowest	8.68 % Above	Technically qualified but offered higher rates.	-
3	M/s Imtiaz Ali Malano	Rs. 5,823,181/-	3 <sup>rd</sup> Lowest	13.04 % Above	Technically qualified but offered higher rates.	-

Following members of the tender opening committee after due consideration have recommended for the acceptance of the lowest bid amounting to Rs. 5,314,006/- in favour of M/s Anwar & Ali Associates.

Name of Member	Designation	Signature	Name of Member	Designation	Signature
Mr. Ghulam Sarwar Joyo (Chairman of the Committee)	Director (Works & Services STEVTA)		Mr. Badaruddin Shahani (Member)	Deputy Director (Accounts) STEVTA	
Mr. Wazir Ali Jilbani (Member)	Accounts officer Mines & Mineral Development Govt: of Sindh		Mr. Abdul Waheed Shaikh (Secretary)	Deputy Director (Works & Services) STEVTA	
Mr. Rehan .M.Khari (Member)	Assistant Controller Bureau of Supply & Prices				



Employment through Skill.

Sindh Technical Education & Vocational Training Authority (STEVTA)  
ST-19, Block 6, Gulshan-e-Iqbal, Near NIPA, Karachi.  
Phone No. 99244112-7 Fax No. 99244118  
Website: <http://www.stevta.gos.pk>



**BID EVALUATION REPORT**

1	Name of Procuring Agency	Sindh Technical Educational & Vocational Training Authority (STEVTA)
2	Tender Reference No	STEVTA/WS/TENDER/149
3	Tender Description / Name of Work / Item	Repair / Renovation of Vocational Training Centre at Dumba Goth, Main Super Highway, Karach
4	Method of Procuring	Procurement of Works through Single Stage One Envelope
5	Tender Published	Dated 02-05-2013
6	Total Bids Documents Sold	03
7	Total Bids Received	03
8	Technical Bids Opening Date	Not Applicable
9	No of Bids Technically Qualified	03
10	No of Bids Rejected	No Bid Rejected
11	Financial Bid Opening Date	29/05/2013

**Bid Evaluation Report**

S.No.	Name of Firm Bidder	Cost Offered by the Bidder	Ranking in Terms of Cost	Comparison with Estimated Cost	Reasons for Acceptance / Rejection	Remarks
0	1	2	3	4	5	6
1	M/S Al-Waheed Enterprises	Rs. 1,323,326 /=-	1 <sup>st</sup> Lowest	9.75% above	Selected on the basis of Technically qualification and lowest price offered	Accepted
2	M/S Farhan Enterprises	Rs. 1,356,484/-	2nd Lowest	12.49% above	Technically qualified but offered higher rates.	2nd Lowest
3	M/S Hussain Advisory	Rs. 1,422,801/-	3rd Lowest	17.96% above	Technically qualified but offered higher rates.	3rd Lowest

**Signatures of Tender Opening Committee**

Name of Member	Designation	Signature	Name of Member	Designation	Signature
Mr. Ghulam Sarwar Jyo (Chairman of the Committee)	Director (Works & Services, STEVTA)		Mr. Badaruddin Shahani (Member)	Deputy Director (Accounts) STEVTA	
Mr. Wazir Ali Jalbani (Member)	Accounts Officer Mines & Mineral Development Department, Govt. of Sindh		Mr. Abdul Waheed Shaikh (Secretary)	Deputy Director (Works & Services) STEVTA	
Mr. Rehan .M. Khan (Member)	Assistant Controller Bureau of Supply & Prices				





## Sindh Technical Education &amp; Vocational Training Authority (STEVTA)

ST-19, Block 6, Gulshan-e-Iqbal, Near NIPA, Karachi.

Phone No. 99244112-7 Fax No. 99244118

Website: http://www.stevta.gov.pk



## BID EVALUATION REPORT

1	Name of Procuring Agency	Sindh Technical Educational & Vocational Training Authority (STEVTA)
2	Tender Reference No.	STEVTA/WS/153/2012-13
3	Tender Description / Name of Work / Item	Repair & Maintenance Works of Sindh Skill Development Program (SSDP) at Mirpurkhas Region
4	Method of Procuring	Procurement of Works through Single Stage one Envelope
5	Tender Published	Advertised on 02-05-2013 through daily news paper and website of SPPRA & STEVTA
6	Total Bids Documents Sold	04
7	Total Bids Received	04
8	Technical Bids Opening Date	N/A
9	No of Bids Technically Qualified	03
10	No of Bids Rejected	No
11	Financial Bid Opening Date	23-05-2013

S.No.	Name of Firm Bidder	Quoted Rate in Pak Rs.	Ranking in Terms of Cost	Comparison with Estimated Cost	Reasons for Acceptance / Rejection	Remarks
0	1	2	3	4	5	6
1	M/s Ruffi & Company	Rs. 7,029,846/-	1 <sup>st</sup> lowest	1.60 % Above	Selected on the basis of Technically qualification and lowest price	Accepted (1st Lowest)
2	M/s Al Waheed & syed Enterprises	Rs. 9,996,030/-	2 <sup>nd</sup> Lowest	4.40 % Above	Technically qualified but offered higher rates.	-
3	M/s Hussain Advisory	Rs. 10,712,622/-	3 <sup>rd</sup> Lowest	54 % Above	Technically qualified but offered higher rates.	-
4	Muhammad Bux Kumbhar & Co	Rs. 15,468,149/-	4th lowest	123 % above	Technically qualified but offered higher rates.	-

Following members of the tender opening committee after due consideration have recommended for the acceptance of the lowest bid amounting to Rs. 7,029,846/- in favour of M/s Ruffi & Company

Name of Member	Designation	Signature	Name of Member	Designation	Signature
Mr. Ghulam Sarwar Joyo (Chairman of the Committee)	Director (Works & Services STEVTA)		Mr. Badaruddin Shahani (Member)	Deputy Director (Accounts) STEVTA	
Mr. Wazir Ali Jilbani (Member)	Accounts officer Mines & Mineral Development Govt: of		Mr. Abdul Waheed Shaikh (Secretary)	Deputy Director (Works & Services) STEVTA	
Mr. Rehan .M.Khan (Member)	Assistant Controller Bureau of Supply & Prices				



Employment through Skill

Sindh Technical Education & Vocational Training Authority (STEVTA)

ST-19, Block 6, Gulshan-e-Iqbal, Near NIPA, Karachi.

Phone No. 99244112-7 Fax No. 99244118

Website: <http://www.stevta.gov.pk>



BID EVALUATION REPORT

1	Name of Procuring Agency	Sindh Technical Educational & Vocational Training Authority (STEVTA)
2	Tender Reference No.	STEVTA/WS/173/2012-13
3	Tender Description / Name of Work / Item	Repair & Maintenance Works of Sindh Skill Development Program (SSOP) at Larkana Region
4	Method of Procuring	Procurement of Works through Single Stage one Envelope
5	Tender Published	Advertised on 02-05-2013 through daily news paper and website of SPPRA & STEVTA
6	Total Bids Documents Sold	03
7	Total Bids Received	03
8	Technical Bids Opening Date	N/A
9	No of Bids Technically Qualified	03
10	No of Bids Rejected	No
11	Financial Bid Opening Date	23-05-2013

S.No.	Name of Firm Bidder	Quoted Rate in Pak Rs.	Ranking in Terms of Cost	Comparison with Estimated Cost	Reasons for Acceptance / Rejection	Remarks
0	1	2	3	4	5	6
1	M/s Anwar & Ali Associates	Rs. 04,387,118/-	1 <sup>st</sup> Lowest	4.74 % Above	Selected on the basis of Technically qualification and lowest price	Accepted (1st Lowest)
2	M/s Siddiqui Engineers & Constructor	Rs. 04,614,588/-	2 <sup>nd</sup> Lowest	10.17 % Above	Technically qualified but offered higher rates.	
3	M/s Imtiaz Ali Malano	Rs. 05,127,303/-	3 <sup>rd</sup> Lowest	22.41% Above	Technically qualified but offered higher rates.	

Following members of the tender opening committee after due consideration have recommended for the acceptance of the lowest bid amounting to Rs. 4,387,118/- in favour of M/s Anwar & Ali Associates.

Name of Member	Designation	Signature	Name of Member	Designation	Signature
Mr. Ghulam Sarwar Joyo (Chairman of the Committee)	Director (Works & Services STEVTA)		Mr. Badaruddin Shahani (Member)	Deputy Director (Accounts) STEVTA	
Mr. Wazir Ali Jalilbani (Member)	Accounts officer Mines & Mineral Development Govt: of		Mr. Abdul Waheed Shaikh (Secretary)	Deputy Director (Works & Services) STEVTA	
Mr. Rehan .M.Khan (Member)	Assistant Controller Bureau of Supply & Prices				





## Sindh Technical Education &amp; Vocational Training Authority (STEVTa)

ST-19, Block 6, Gulshan-e-Iqbal, Near NIPA, Karachi.

Phone No. 99244112-7 Fax No. 99244118

Website: <http://www.stevta.gov.pk>

## BID EVALUATION REPORT

1	Name of Procuring Agency	Sindh Technical Educational & Vocational Training Authority (STEVTa)
2	Tender Reference No.	STEVTa/W/165/2012-13
3	Tender Description / Name of Work / Item	Construction of First Floor at Government Vocational School, Sachal Goth Karachi.
4	Method of Procuring	Procurement of Works through Single Stage one Envelope
5	Tender Published	Advertised on 02-05-2013 through daily news paper and website of SPPRA & STEVTa.
6	Total Bids Documents Sold	03
7	Total Bids Received	03
8	Technical Bids Opening Date	N/A
9	No of Bids Technically Qualified	03
10	No of Bids Rejected	No
11	Financial Bid Opening Date	28-05-2013

S.No.	Name of Firm Bidder	Quoted Rate in Pak Rs.	Ranking in Terms of Cost	Comparison with Estimated Cost	Reasons for Acceptance / Rejection	Remarks
0	1	2	3	4	5	6
1	M/s Mehran Associates	Rs. 6,411,263/-	1 <sup>st</sup> lowest	19.35 % Above	Selected on the basis of Technically qualified and lowest price offered	Accepted (1st Lowest)
2	M/s Indus Associates	Rs. 6,532,656/-	2 <sup>nd</sup> Lowest	21.61 % Above	Technically qualified but offered higher rates.	-
3	M/s R.K. Consult. Company	Rs. 6,652,457/-	3 <sup>rd</sup> Lowest	23.84 % Above	Technically qualified but offered higher rates.	-

Following members of the tender opening committee after due consideration have recommended for the acceptance of the lowest bid amounting to Rs. 6,411,263/- in favour of M/s Mehran Associates.

Name of Member	Signature	Name of Member	Signature
Mr. Ghulam Sarwar Joso Director (W & S) Chairman		Mr. Abdul Wahed Shaikh Deputy Director (Works & Services)	
Representative of Mines & Minerals Deptt. (To be nominated by Director General)		Mr. Badar Hussain Shahani Deputy Director Accounts, STEVTa	
Representative of Bureau of Supply & Prices Deptt. (To be nominated by Director/Controller)			



Employment through Skill

Sindh Technical Education & Vocational Training Authority (STEVTA)

ST-19, Block E, Gulshan-e-Iqbal, Near NIPA, Karachi.

Phone No. 99244112-7 Fax No. 99244118

Website: <http://www.stevta.gov.pk>



**BID EVALUATION REPORT**

1	Name of Procuring Agency	Sindh Technical Educational & Vocational Training Authority (STEVTA)
2	Tender Reference No.	STEVTA/WS/150/2012-13
3	Tender Description / Name of Work / Item	Providing water supply system at Saifee Edi Zahbi (B. TECH SECTION) North Nazimabad Karachi.
4	Method of Procuring	Procurement of Works through Single Stage one Envelope
5	Tender Published	Advertised on 02-05-2013 through daily news paper and website of SPPRA & STEVTA.
6	Total Bids Documents Sold	03
7	Total Bids Received	03
8	Technical Bids Opening Date	N/A
9	No of Bids Technically Qualified	03
10	No of Bids Rejected	No
11	Financial Bid Opening Date	31-05-2013

S.No.	Name of Firm Bidder	Quoted Rate in Pak Rs.	Ranking in Terms of Cost	Comparison with Estimated Cost	Reasons for Acceptance / Rejection	Remarks
0	1	2	3	4	5	6
1	M/s Al Waheed & Syed Enterprises	Rs. 1,088,878/-	1 <sup>st</sup> Lowest	14.50% Above	Selected on the basis of Technically qualification and lowest price	Accepted (1st Lowest)
2	M/s Syed & Siddiqui Associates	Rs. 1,122,184/-	2 <sup>nd</sup> Lowest	18.00% Above	Technically qualified but offered higher rates	
3	M/s Metcon	Rs. 1,136,449/-	3 <sup>rd</sup> Lowest	19.50 % Above	Technically qualified but offered higher rates	

Following members of the tender opening committee after due consideration have recommended for the acceptance of the lowest bid amounting to Rs. 1,088,878/- in favour of M/s Al Waheed & Syed Enterprises.

Name of Member	Designation	Signature	Name of Member	Designation	Signature
Mr. Ghulam Sarwar Jyo (Chairman of the Committee)	Director (Works & Services STEVTA)		Mr. Badaruddin Shahani (Member)	Deputy Director (Accounts) STEVTA	
Mr. Wazir Ali Jailbani (Member)	Accounts officer Mines & Mineral Development Govt. of		Mr. Abdul Waheed Shaikh (Secretary)	Deputy Director (Works & Services) STEVTA	
Mr. Rehan .M.Khan (Member)	Assistant Controller Bureau of Supply & Prices				



Employment through Skill

Sindh Technical Education & Vocational Training Authority (STEVTA)

ST-19, Block 6, Gulshan-e-Iqbal, Near NIPA, Karachi.

Phone No. 99244112-7 Fax No. 99244118

Website: <http://www.stevta.gov.pk>



**BID EVALUATION REPORT**

1	Name of Procuring Agency	Sindh Technical Educational & Vocational Training Authority (STEVTA)
2	Tender Reference No.	STEVTA/WS/168/2012-13
3	Tender Description / Name of Work / Item	Repair of Government Vocational Institute (Boys) Shikarpur
4	Method of Procuring	Procurement of Works through Single Stage one Envelope
5	Tender Published	Advertised on 02-05-2013 through daily news paper and website of SPPRA & STEVTA.
6	Total Bids Documents Sold	04
7	Total Bids Received	04
8	Technical Bids Opening Date	N/A
9	No of Bids Technically Qualified	04
10	No of Bids Rejected	No
11	Financial Bid Opening Date	28-05-2013

S.No.	Name of Firm Bidder	Quoted Rate in Pak Rs.	Ranking in Terms of Cost	Comparison with Estimated Cost	Reasons for Acceptance / Rejection	Remarks
0	1	2	3	4	5	6
1	M/s Muhammad Bux Kumbhar & Co	Rs. 6,204,310/-	1 <sup>st</sup> lowest	15.75 % Above	Selected on the basis of Technically qualification and lowest price.	Accepted (1st Lowest)
2	M/s Hussain Advisory	Rs. 8,039,955/-	2 <sup>nd</sup> Lowest	49.99 % Above	Technically qualified but offered higher rates	-
3	M/s Zealco Engineering (Pvt.) Ltd	Rs. 8,200,754/-	3 <sup>rd</sup> Lowest	52.99 % Above	Technically qualified but offered higher rates	-
4	AL - Hamza Enterprises	Rs. 8,307,954/-	4th Lowest	55 % Above	Technically qualified but offered higher rates	-

Following members of the tender opening committee after due consideration have recommended for the acceptance of the lowest bid amounting to Rs. 6,204,310/- in favour of M/s Muhammad Bux Kumbhar & Co.

Name of Member	Designation	Signature	Name of Member	Designation	Signature
Mr. Ghulam Sarwar Joyo (Chairman of the Committee)	Director (Works & Services) STEVTA		Mr. Badaruddin Shahani (Member)	Deputy Director (Accounts) STEVTA	
Mr. Wazir Ali Jailbani (Member)	Accounts officer Mines & Mineral Development Govt. of Sindh		Mr. Abdul Waheed Shaikh (Secretary)	Deputy Director (Works & Services) STEVTA	
Mr. Rehan .M.Khan (Member)	Assistant Controller Bureau of Supply & Prices				



Employment through Skill

**Sindh Technical Education & Vocational Training Authority (STEVTA)**

ST-19, Block 6, Gulshan-e-Iqbal, Near NIPA, Karachi.

Phone No. 99244112-7 Fax No. 99244118

Website: <http://www.stevta.gov.pk>**BID EVALUATION REPORT**

1	Name of Procuring Agency	Sindh Technical Educational & Vocational Training Authority (STEVTA)
2	Tender Reference No.	STEVTAWS/TENDER/163
3	Tender Description / Name of Work / Item	Electric Work of GPI, Sachal Goth, Karachi
4	Method of Procuring	Procurement of Works through Single Stage One Envelope
5	Tender Published	Dated 02-05-2013
6	Total Bids Documents Sold	03
7	Total Bids Received	03
8	Technical Bids Opening Date	Not Applicable
9	No of Bids Technically Qualified	03
10	No of Bids Rejected	No Bid Rejected
11	Financial Bid Opening Date	29/05/2013

12.

**Bid Evaluation Report**

S.No.	Name of Firm Bidder	Cost Offered by the Bidder	Ranking in Terms of Cost	Comparison with Estimated Cost	Reasons for Acceptance / Rejection	Remarks
0	1	2	3	4	5	6
1	M/S Kaiser Electric Co	Rs.1,150,222/=	1st Lowest	15 % above	Selected on the basis of Technically qualification and lowest price offered	Accepted
2	M/S Al-Abid & Co	Rs.1,151,752/=	2nd Lowest	15.17 % above	Technically qualified but offered higher rates.	2nd Lowest
3	M/S Rizwan Electric Govt. Contractor	Rs.1,154,143/=	3rd Lowest	15.41 % above	Technically qualified but offered higher rates.	3rd Lowest

**Signatures of Tender Opening Committee**

Name of Member	Designation	Signature	Name of Member	Designation	Signature
Mr. Ghulam Sarwar Joyo (Chairman of the Committee)	Director (Works & Services, STEVTA)		Mr. Badaruddin Shahani (Member)	Deputy Director (Accounts) STEVTA	
Mr. Wazir Ali Jalbani (Member)	Accounts Officer Mines & Mineral Development Department, Govt. of Sindh		Mr. Abdul Waheed Shaikh (Secretary)	Deputy Director (Works & Services) STEVTA	
Mr. Rehan M. Khan (Member)	Assistant Controller Bureau of Supply & Prices				



## Sindh Technical Education &amp; Vocational Training Authority (STEVTA)

ST-19, Block 6, Gulshan-e-Iqbal, Near NIPA, Karachi.

Phone No. 99244112-7 Fax No. 99244118

Website: http://www.stevta.gos.pk

## BID EVALUATION REPORT

1	Name of Procuring Agency	Sindh Technical Educational & Vocational Training Authority (STEVTA)
2	Tender Reference No.	STEVTA/WS/TENDER/171/2012-13
3	Tender Description / Name of Work / Item	Repair & Renovation of Government Vocational School (Girls) Pano Akil
4	Method of Procuring	Procurement of Works through Single Package one Envelope
5	Tender Published	Advertised on 02/05/2013 through Daily news paper & website of STEVTA & SPPRA .
6	Total Bids Documents Sold	03
7	Total Bids Received	03
8	Technical Bids Opening Date	N.A
9	No of Bids Technically Qualified	03
10	No of Bids Rejected	No Bid Rejected
11	Financial Bid Opening Date	30/05/2013

S.No.	Name of Firm Bidder	QUOTED RATE IN PAK. RS.	RANKING IN TERMS OF COST	COMPARISON WITH ESTIMATED COST	Reasons for Acceptance / Rejection	Remarks
1	M/S Khalil-ul-Rahman Kalwar	Rs: 2,098,006/-	1ST LOWEST	4.9 % above	Selected on the basis of Technically qualification and lowest price offered	Accepted (1st Lowest)
2	M/S Saifullah Kalwar	Rs: 2,183,316/-	2ND LOWEST	9.16 % above	Technically qualified but offered higher rates.	(2nd Lowest)
3	M/S Asif Ali Mahar	Rs: 2,243,574/-	3RD LOWEST	12.17 % above	Technically qualified but offered higher rates.	(3rd Lowest)

Following members of the tender opening committee after due consideration have recommended for the acceptance of the lowest bid amounting to rupees 2,098,006/- in favour of M/S Khalil-ul-Rahman Kalwar

Name of Member	Designation	Signature	Name of Member	Designation	Signature
Mr. Ghulam Sarwar Joyo (Chairman of the Committee)	Director (Works & Services STEVTA)		Mr. Badaruddin Shahani (Member)	Deputy Director (Accounts) STEVTA	
Mr. Wazir Ali Jilbani (Member)	Accounts officer Mines & Mineral Development Govt: of Sindh		Mr. Abdul Waheed Shaikh (Secretary)	Deputy Director (Works & Services) STEVTA	
Mr. Rehan .M.Khan (Member)	Assistant Controller Bureau of Supply & Prices				



## Sindh Technical Education &amp; Vocational Training Authority (STEVTA)

ST-15, Block 6, Gulshan-e-Iqbal, Near NIPA, Karachi.

Phone No. 99244112-7 Fax No. 992441118

Website: <http://www.stevta.gov.pk>

## BID EVALUATION REPORT

1	Name of Procuring Agency	Sindh Technical Educational & Vocational Training Authority (STEVTA)
2	Tender Reference No.	STEVTA/WS/152/2012-13
3	Tender Description / Name of Work / Item	Repair & Maintenance Works of Sindh Skill Development Program (SSDP) at Hyderabad Bealon
4	Method of Procuring	Procurement of Works through Single Stage one Envelope
5	Tender Published	Advertised on 02-05-2013 through daily news paper and website of SPPRA & STEVTA.
6	Total Bids Documents Sold	06
7	Total Bids Received	03
8	Technical Bids Opening Date	N/A
9	No of Bids Technically Qualified	03
10	No of Bids Rejected	No
11	Financial Bid Opening Date	23-05-2013

S.No.	Name of Firm Bidder	Quoted Rate in Pak Rs.	Ranking in Terms of Cost	Comparison with Estimated Cost	Reasons for Acceptance / Rejection	Remarks
0	1	2	3	4	5	6
1	M/s G.Q.S Contractors	Rs. 13,782,809/-	1 <sup>st</sup> lowest	3.27% Above	Selected on the basis of Technical qualification and lowest price	Accepted (1st Lowest)
2	M/s Al-Hamza Enterprises	Rs. 14,898,504/-	2 <sup>nd</sup> Lowest	11.63% Above	Technically qualified but offered higher rates	-
3	M/s Sindh Automation	Rs. 15,237,161/-	3 <sup>rd</sup> Lowest	14.17 % Above	Technically qualified but offered higher rates	-

Following members of the tender opening committee after due consideration have recommended for the acceptance of the lowest bid amounting to Rs. 13,782,809/- in favour of M/s G.Q.S Contractors.

Name of Member	Designation	Signature	Name of Member	Designation	Signature
Mr. Ghulam Sarwar Jyo (Chairman of the Committee)	Director (Works & Services STEVTA)		Mr. Badaruddin Shahani (Member)	Deputy Director (Accounts) STEVTA	
Mr. Wazir Ali Jailbani (Member)	Accounts officer Mines & Mineral Development Govt. of		Mr. Abdul Waheed Shaikh (Secretary)	Deputy Director (Works & Services) STEVTA	
Mr. Rehan .M.Khan (Member)	Assistant Controller Bureau of Supply & Prices				





## Sindh Technical Education & Vocational Training Authority (STEVTA)

ST-19, Block 6, Gulshan-e-Iqbal, Near NIPA, Karachi.

Phone No. 99244112-7 Fax No. 99244118

Website: <http://www.stevta.gov.pk>

### BID EVALUATION REPORT

1	Name of Procuring Agency	Sindh Technical Educational & Vocational Training Authority (STEVTA)
2	Tender Reference No.	STEVTA/WS/157/2012-13
3	Tender Description / Name of Work / Item	Construction of Government Polytechnic Institute Siraj Piyaro Khan District Khairpur Phase-I
4	Method of Procuring	Procurement of Works through Single Stage one Envelope
5	Tender Published	Advertised on 02-05-2013 through daily news paper and website of SPPRA & STEVTA.
6	Total Bids Documents Sold	03
7	Total Bids Received	03
8	Technical Bids Opening Date	N/A
9	No of Bids Technically Qualified	03
10	No of Bids Rejected	No
11	Financial Bid Opening Date	31-05-2013

S.No.	Name of Firm Bidder	Quoted Rate in Pak Rs.	Ranking in Terms of Cost	Comparison with Estimated Cost	Reasons for Acceptance / Rejection	Remarks
0	1	2	3	4	5	6
1	M/s Asif Enterprises	Rs. 38,922,384/-	1 <sup>st</sup> lowest	10.55 % Above	Selected on the basis of Technically qualification and lowest price offered	Accepted (1st Lowest)
2	M/s Waseem Builders	Rs. 39,312,479/-	2 <sup>nd</sup> Lowest	11.45 % Above	Technically qualified but offered higher rates	
3	M/s K.khan & Company	Rs. 39,610,684/-	3 <sup>rd</sup> Lowest	12.29 % Above	Technically qualified but offered higher rates	

Following members of the tender opening committee after due consideration have recommended for the acceptance of the lowest bid amounting to Rs. 38,922,384/- in favour of M/s Asif Enterprises.

Name of Member	Designation	Signature	Name of Member	Designation	Signature
Mr. Ghulam Sarwar Joyn (Chairman of the Committee)	Director (Works & Services) STEVTA		Mr. Badaruddin Shahani (Member)	Deputy Director (Accounts) STEVTA	
Mr. Waqir Ali Iqbalani (Member)	Accounts officer Mines & Mineral Development Govt. of Sindh		Mr. Abdul Wahid Shaikh (Secretary)	Deputy Director (Works & Services) STEVTA	
Mr. Behan M.Khan (Member)	Assistant Controller Bureau of Supply & Prices				



Employment through Skill.

**Sindh Technical Education & Vocational Training Authority (STEVA)**

ST-19, Block 6, Gulshan-e-Iqbal, Near NIPA, Karachi.

Phone No. 99244112-7 Fax No. 99244118

Website: <http://www.stevta.gos.pk>**BID EVALUATION REPORT**

1	Name of Procuring Agency	Sindh Technical Educational & Vocational Training Authority (STEVA)
2	Tender Reference No.	STEVA/WS/TENDER/164
3	Tender Description / Name of Work / Item	Construction of Polytechnic Institute at Sachal Goth, (Main Building Phase-II) Balance Work
4	Method of Procuring	Procurement of Works through Single Stage One Envelope
5	Tender Published	Daily Dawn Dated: 02-05-2013
6	Total Bids Documents Sold	03
7	Total Bids Received	03
8	Technical Bids Opening Date	28/05/2013
9	No of Bids Technically Qualified	03
10	No of Bids Rejected	No Bid Rejected
11	Financial Bid Opening Date	28/05/2013

**Bid Evaluation Report**

S.No.	Name of Firm Bidder	Cost Offered by the Bidder	Ranking in Terms of Cost	Comparison with Estimated Cost	Reasons for Acceptance / Rejection	Remarks
0	1	2	3	4	5	6
1	M/S Iqbal Brothers	Rs.29,984,333/=	1st Lowest	1.41 % above	Selected on the basis of Technically qualification and lowest price offered	Accepted
2	M/S Kamdi Corporation	Rs.31,010,652/=	2nd Lowest	4.83 % above	Technically qualified but offered higher rates	2nd Lowest
3	M/S Al-Ghafar Enterprises	Rs.31,764,156/=	3rd Lowest	7.26 % above	Technically qualified but offered higher rates.	3rd Lowest

**Signatures of Tender Opening Committee**

Name of Member	Designation	Signature	Name of Member	Designation	Signature
Mr. Ghulam Sarwar Jyo (Chairman of the Committee)	Director (Works & Services, STEVA)		Mr. Badaruddin Shahani (Member)	Deputy Director (Accounts) STEVA	
Mr. Wazir Ali Jaibani (Member)	Accounts Officer Mines & Mineral Development Department, Govt. of Sindh		Mr. Abdul Waheed Shaikh (Secretary)	Deputy Director (Works & Services) STEVA	
Mr. Rehan M. Khan (Member)	Assistant Controller Bureau of Supply & Prices				





## Sindh Technical Education &amp; Vocational Training Authority (STEVTA)

ST-19, Block 6, Gulshan-e-Iqbal, Near NIPA, Karachi.

Phone No. 99244112-7 Fax No. 99244118

Website: <http://www.stevta.gov.pk>

## BID EVALUATION REPORT

1	Name of Procuring Agency	Sindh Technical Educational & Vocational Training Authority (STEVTA)
2	Tender Reference No.	STEVTA/WS/TENDER/161/2012-13
3	Tender Description / Name of Work / Item	Repair & Maintenance of Government Vocational Institute (W) Azizabad Karachi.
4	Method of Procuring	Procurement of Works through Single Package one Envelope
5	Tender Published	Advertised on 02/05/2013 through Daily news paper & website of STEVTA & SPPRA.
6	Total Bids Documents Sold	03
7	Total Bids Received	03
8	Technical Bids Opening Date	N.A
9	No of Bids Technically Qualified	03
10	No of Bids Rejected	No Bid Rejected
11	Financial Bid Opening Date	24/05/2013

S.No.	Name of Firm Bidder	QUOTED RATE IN PAK. RS.	RANKING IN TERMS OF COST	COMPARISON WITH ESTIMATED COST.	Reasons for Acceptance / Rejection	Remarks
1	M/S K. Khan & Company	5,371,812/-	1ST LOWEST	7.43% ABOVE	Selected on the basis of Technically qualification and lowest price offered	Accepted (1st Lowest)
2	M/S Araf Interprises	5,465,378/-	2ND LOWEST	9.30% ABOVE	Technically qualified but offered higher rates.	(2nd Lowest)
3	M/S Wasim Builders	5,861,437/-	3RD LOWEST	17.22% ABOVE	Technically qualified but offered higher rates.	(3rd Lowest)

Following members of the tender opening committee after due consideration have recommended for the acceptance of the lowest bid amounting to rupees 5,371,812/- in favour of M/S K.Khan & Company.

Name of Member	Signature	Name of Member	Signature
Mr. Ghulam Sarwar Jyo Director (Works & Services)		Mr. Abdul Waheed Shaikh Deputy Director (Works & Services)	
Representative of Mines & Minerals Department (to be nominated by Director General)		Representative of Bureau of Supply & Prises Department (to be nominated by Director / Controller)	
Mr. Badar Hussain Shahani Deputy Director (Accounts) STEVTA			



## Sindh Technical Education &amp; Vocational Training Authority (STEVTA)

ST-19, Block 6, Gulshan-e-Iqbal, Near NIPA, Karachi.

Phone No. 99244112-7 Fax No. 99244118

Website: <http://www.stevta.gov.pk>

## BID EVALUATION REPORT

1	Name of Procuring Agency	Sindh Technical Educational & Vocational Training Authority (STEVTA)
2	Tender Reference No.	STEVTA/WS/TENDER/169/2012-13
3	Tender Description / Name of Work / Item	Repair & Renovation of Government monotechnic Institute Faiz Gunj District Khairpur.
4	Method of Procuring	Procurement of Works through Single Package one Envelope
5	Tender Published	Advertised on 02/05/2013 through Daily news paper & website of STEVTA & SPPRA.
6	Total Bids Documents Sold	03
7	Total Bids Received	03
8	Technical Bids Opening Date	N.A
9	No of Bids Technically Qualified	03
10	No of Bids Rejected	No Bid Rejected
11	Financial Bid Opening Date	28/05/2013

S.No.	Name of Firm Bidder	QUOTED RATE IN PAK. RS.	RANKING IN TERMS OF COST	COMPARISON WITH ESTIMATED COST	Reasons for Acceptance / Rejection	Remarks
1	M/S K.Khan & Company	5,300,000/-	1ST LOWEST	6% ABOVE	Selected on the basis of Technically qualification and lowest price offered	Accepted (1st Lowest)
2	M/S Asif Interprises	5,350,000/-	2ND LOWEST	9.30% ABOVE	Technically qualified but offered higher rates.	(2nd Lowest)
3	M/S Wasim Builders	5,500,000/-	3RD LOWEST	10% ABOVE	Technically qualified but offered higher rates.	(3rd Lowest)

Following members of the tender opening committee after due consideration have recommended for the acceptance of the lowest bid amounting to rupees 5,300,000/- in favour of M/S K.Khan & Company.

Name of Member	Signature	Name of Member	Signature
Mr. Ghulam Sarwar Jyo Director (Works & Services)		Mr. Abdul Waheed Shaikh Deputy Director (Works & Services)	
Representative of Mines & Minerals Department (to be nominated by Director General)		Representative of Bureau of Supply & Prises Department (to be nominated by Director / Controller)	
Mr. Badar Hussain Shahani Deputy Director (Accounts) STEVTA			



Employment through Skills

Sindh Technical Education & Vocational Training Authority (STEVTA)

ST-19, Block 6, Gulshan-e-Iqbal, Near NIPA, Karachi.

Phone No. 99244112-7 Fax No. 99244118

Website: <http://www.stevta.gov.pk>



**BID EVALUATION REPORT**

1	Name of Procuring Agency	Sindh Technical Educational & Vocational Training Authority (STEVTA)
2	Tender Reference No.	STEVTA/WS/145/2012-13
3	Tender Description / Name of Work / Item	Repair & Maintenance of Government Vocational Institute (G.P.E.C.H.S, Karachi, (Remaining Work)
4	Method of Procuring	Procurement of Works through Single Stage one Envelope
5	Tender Published	Advertised on 02-05-2013 through daily news paper and website of SPPRA & STEVTA
6	Total Bids Documents Sold	03
7	Total Bids Received	03
8	Technical Bids Opening Date	N/A
9	No of Bids Technically Qualified	03
10	No of Bids Rejected	No
11	Financial Bid Opening Date	24-05-2013

S.No.	Name of Firm Bidder	Quoted Rate in Pak Rs.	Ranking in Terms of Cost	Comparison with Estimated Cost	Reasons for Acceptance / Rejection	Remarks
0	1	2	3	4	5	6
1	M/s Mustafa Associates	3,116,180.00	1st Lowest	10% Above	Selected on the basis of Technically qualification and lowest price offered	Accepted (1st Lowest
2	M/s Ali Jumani Enterprises	3,242,623.00	2nd Lowest	14.47% Above	Technically qualified but offered higher rates.	2nd Lowest
3	M/s Jiya Enterprises	3,340,640.00	3rd Lowest	17.92% Above	Technically qualified but offered higher rates.	3rd Lowest

Following members of the tender opening committee after due consideration have recommended for the acceptance of the lowest bid amounting to Rs. 3,116,180/- in favour of M/s Mustafa Associates.

Name of Member	Signature	Name of Member	Signature
Mr. Ghulam Sarwar Jyo (W & S) Chairman Director		Mr. Abdul Waheed Shaikh Deputy-Director (Works & Services)	
Representative of Mines & Minerals Deptt. (To be nominated by Director General)		Mr. Badar Hussain Shahani Deputy Director Accounts, STEVTA	
Representative of Bureau of Supply & Prices Deptt. (To be nominated by Director/Controller)			





Employment through Skill

**Sindh Technical Education & Vocational Training Authority (STEVTA)**

ST-19, Block 6, Gulshan-e-Iqbal, Near NIPA, Karachi.

Phone No. 99244112-7 Fax No. 99244118

Website: <http://www.stevta.gov.pk>**BID EVALUATION REPORT**

1	Name of Procuring Agency	Sindh Technical Educational & Vocational Training Authority (STEVTA)
2	Tender Reference No.	STEVTAWS/TENDER/151
3	Tender Description / Name of Work / Item	Minor Repair Renovation & Refurbishment of Market Driven Trades under Component-II of SSDP, Project Karachi Region
4	Method of Procuring	Procurement of Works through Single Stage One Envelope
5	Tender Published	Daily Dawn Dated: 02-05-2013
6	Total Bids Documents Sold	03
7	Total Bids Received	03
8	Technical Bids Opening Date	23/05/2013
9	No of Bids Technically Qualified	03
10	No of Bids Rejected	No Bid Rejected
11	Financial Bid Opening Date	23/05/2013

12

**Bid Evaluation Report**

S.No.	Name of Firm Bidder	Cost Offered by the Bidder	Ranking in Terms of Cost	Comparison with Estimated Cost	Reasons for Acceptance / Rejection	Remarks
0	1	2	3	4	5	6
1	M/S Pakistan Electric Works	8,369,665.00	1st Lowest	0.079 % below	Selected on the basis of Technically qualification and lowest price offered	Accepted
2	M/S Shahzeb Associates	8,596,652.00	2nd Lowest	2.63 % above	Technically qualified but offered higher rates.	2nd Lowest
3	M/S Kamran Builders	8,801,670.00	3rd Lowest	5.078 % above	Technically qualified but offered higher rates.	3rd Lowest

**Signatures of Tender Opening Committee**

Name of Member	Designation	Signature	Name of Member	Designation	Signature
Mr. Ghulam Sarwar Joyo (Chairman of the Committee)	Director (Works & Services, STEVTA)		Mr. Badaruddin Shahani (Member)	Deputy Director (Accounts) STEVTA	
Mr. Wazir Ali Jaibani (Member)	Representative of Mines & Mineral Development Department, Govt. of Sindh		Mr. Abdul Waheed Shaikh (Secretary)	Deputy Director (Works & Services) STEVTA	
Mr. Rehan M. Khan (Member)	Representative of Bureau of Supply & Prices				



Employment through Skill

## Sindh Technical Education &amp; Vocational Training Authority (STEVTA)

ST-19, Block 6, Gulshan-e-Iqbal, Near NIPA, Karachi.

Phone No. 99244112-7 Fax No. 99244118

Website: <http://www.stevta.gov.pk>

## BID EVALUATION REPORT

1	Name of Procuring Agency	Sindh Technical Educational & Vocational Training Authority (STEVTA)
2	Tender Reference No.	STEVTA/WS/146/2012-13
3	Tender Description / Name of Work / Item	Maintenance & Repair of Government College of Technology, Karimabad, Karachi
4	Method of Procuring	Procurement of Works through Single Stage one Envelope
5	Tender Published	Advertised on 02-05-2013 through daily news paper and website of SPPRA & STEVTA.
6	Total Bids Documents Sold	03
7	Total Bids Received	03
8	Technical Bids Opening Date	N/A
9	No of Bids Technically Qualified	03
10	No of Bids Rejected	No
11	Financial Bid Opening Date	24-05-2013

S.No.	Name of Firm Bidder	Quoted Rate in Pak Rs.	Ranking in Terms of Cost	Comparison with Estimated Cost	Reasons for Acceptance / Rejection	Remarks
0	1	2	3	4	5	6
1	M/s Mustafa Associates	4,952,828.00	1st Lowest	4.27% Above	Selected on the basis of Technically qualification and lowest price offered	Accepted (1st Lowest)
2	M/s Jiya Enterprises	5,039,330.00	2nd Lowest	6.09% Above	Technically qualified but offered higher rates.	2nd Lowest
3	M/s Ali Jumani Enterprises	5,100,786.00	3rd Lowest	7.38% Above	Technically qualified but offered higher rates.	3rd Lowest

Following members of the tender opening committee after due consideration have recommended for the acceptance of the lowest bid amounting to Rs. 4952828/- in favour of M/s Mustafa Associates.

Name of Member	Signature	Name of Member	Signature
Mr. Ghulam Sarwar Joyo (W & S) Chairman Director		Mr. Abdul Waheed Shaikh Deputy Director (Works & Services)	
Representative of Mines & Minerals Deptt. (To be nominated by Director General)		Mr. Badar Hussain Shahani Deputy Director Accounts, STEVTA	
Representative of Bureau of Supply & Prices Deptt. (To be nominated by Director/Controller)			



## Sindh Technical Education &amp; Vocational Training Authority (STEVTA)

ST-19, Block 6, Gulshan-e-Iqbal, Near NIPA, Karachi.

Phone No. 99244112-7 Fax No. 99244118

Website: <http://www.stevta.gos.pk>

## BID EVALUATION REPORT

1	Name of Procuring Agency	Sindh Technical Educational & Vocational Training Authority (STEVTA)
2	Tender Reference No.	STEVTA/WS/160/2012-13
3	Tender Description / Name of Work / Item	Construction of Poly Technic Institute at Khuhra District Khairpur Phase-II
4	Method of Procuring	Procurement of Works through Single Stage one Envelope
5	Tender Published	Advertised on 02-05-2013 through daily news paper and website of SPPRA & STEVTA.
6	Total Bids Documents Sold	03
7	Total Bids Received	03
8	Technical Bids Opening Date	N/A.
9	No of Bids Technically Qualified	03
10	No of Bids Rejected	No
11	Financial Bid Opening Date	28-05-2013

S.No.	Name of Firm Bidder	Quoted Rate in Pak Rs.	Ranking in Terms of Cost	Comparison with Estimated Cost	Reasons for Acceptance / Rejection	Remarks
0	1	2	3	4	5	6
1	M/s Mustafa Associates	11,403,618.00	1st Lowest	13.5% Above	Selected on the basis of Technically qualification and lowest price offered	Accepted (1st Lowest)
2	M/s Jiya Enterprises	13,705,848.00	2nd Lowest	36.41% Above	Technically qualified but offered higher rates.	2nd Lowest
3	M/s Ali Jumani Enterprises	13,973,211.00	3rd Lowest	39.07% Above	Technically qualified but offered higher rates.	3rd Lowest

Following members of the tender opening committee after due consideration have recommended for the acceptance of the lowest bid amounting to Rs. 11,403,618/- in favour of M/s Mustafa Associates.

Name of Member	Signature	Name of Member	Signature
Mr. Ghulam Sarwar Javo (W & S) Chairman Director		Mr. Abdul Waheed Shaikh Deputy Director (Works & Services)	
Representative of Mines & Minerals Deptt. (To be nominated by Director General)		Mr. Badar Hussain Shahani Deputy Director Accounts, STEVTA	
Representative of Bureau of Supply & Prices Deptt. (To be nominated by Director/Controller)			