



Employment through Skill

Sindh Technical Education & Vocational Training Authority (STEVTA)

ST-19, Block 6, Gulshan-e-Iqbal, Near NIPA, Karachi.

Phone No. 99244112-7 Fax No. 99244118

Website: <http://www.stevta.gos.pk>

BID EVALUATION REPORT

1	Name of Procuring Agency	Sindh Technical Educational & Vocational Training Authority (STEVTA)
2	Tender Reference No.	STEVTA/WS/TENDER/57/2011-12
3	Tender Description / Name of Work / Item	Finishing Work of Government Vocational School, Sachal Goth, Karachi.
4	Method of Procuring	Procurement of Works through Single Stage One Envelope
5	Tender Published	Advertised on 29-07-2011 through STEVTA & SPPRA Website
6	Total Bids Documents Sold	04
7	Total Bids Received	03
8	Technical Bids Opening Date	26/7/2011
9	No of Bids Technically Qualified	03
10	No of Bids Rejected	No Bid Rejected
11	Financial Bid Opening Date	26/7/2011
12		

Bid Evaluation Report

S.No.	Name of Firm Bidder	Cost Offered by the Bidder	Ranking in Terms of Cost	Comparison with Modified Estimated Cost	Reasons for Acceptance / Rejection	Remarks
0	1	2	3	4	5	6
1	M/s Mehran Associates	984,575.00	1st Lowest	26.25% Above	Selected on the basis of Technically qualification and lowest price offered	Accepted
2	M/s K.K. Shahzad & Co.	998,630.00	2nd Lowest	28.05% above	Technically qualified but offered higher rates.	2nd Lowest
3	M/s Al-Shahid & Co.	999,666.00	3rd Lowest	28.18% Above	Technically qualified but offered higher rates.	3rd Lowest

Name of Member	Designation	Signature	Name of Member	Designation	Signature
Mr. Ghulam Sarwar Joyo	Director (Works & Services)		Mr. Abdul Waheed Shaikh	Assistant Director (Finance)	
Abdul Hafez Abbasi	Deputy Director (MIS)		Mr. Muhammad Zahid Shaikh	Deputy Director (Works & Services)	
Saeed Ahmed Shaikh	Deputy Secretary Admn CM Secretariat		Mr. Khadim Hussain	Deputy Director (D...)	

Sindh Technical Education & Vocational Training Authority (STEVTA)

ST-19, Block 6, Gulshan-e-Iqbal, Near NIPA, Karachi.

Phone No. 99244112-7 Fax No. 99244118

Website: <http://www.stevta.gos.pk>

BID EVALUATION REPORT

1	Name of Procuring Agency	Sindh Technical Educational & Vocational Training Authority (STEVTA)
2	Tender Reference No.	STEVTA/WS/TENDER/58/2011-12
3	Tender Description / Name of Work / Item	Repair Work of Government Polytechnic Institute (Women) Korangi, Karachi.
4	Method of Procuring	Procurement of Works through Single Stage One Envelope
5	Tender Published	Daily Ebrat at 23-07-2011
6	Total Bids Documents Sold	04
7	Total Bids Received	03
8	Technical Bids Opening Date	Not Applicable
9	No of Bids Technically Qualified	03
10	No of Bids Rejected	No Bid Rejected
11	Financial Bid Opening Date	4/8/2011

Bid Evaluation Report

S.No.	Name of Firm Bidder	Cost Offered by the Bidder	Ranking in Terms of Cost	Comparison with Modified Estimated Cost	Reasons for Acceptance / Rejection	Remarks
0	1	2	3	4	5	6
1	M/s Al-Noor Construction & Co.	4,384,725.00	1st Lowest	7.90% Below	Selected on the basis of Technically qualification and lowest price offered	Accepted
2	M/s Faqeer Muhammad Constructor.	5,377,000.00	2nd Lowest	12.93% above	Technically qualified but offered higher rates.	2nd Lowest
3	M/s Al-Shahid & Co.	5,996,250.00	3rd Lowest	25.93% Above	Technically qualified but offered higher rates.	3rd Lowest

Name of Member	Designation	Signature	Name of Member	Designation	Signature
Mr. Ghulam Sarwar Joyo	Director (Works & Services)		Mr. Abdul Waheed Shaikh	Assistant Director (Finance)	
Abdul Hafeez Abbasi	Deputy Director (MIS)		Mr. Muhammad Zahid Shaikh	Deputy Director (Works & Services)	
Saeed Ahmed Shaikh	Deputy Secretary Admn CM Secretariat		Mr. Khadim Hussain	Deputy Director (DW)	



Employment through Skill

Sindh Technical Education & Vocational Training Authority (STEVTA)

ST-19, Block 6, Gulshan-e-Iqbal, Near NIPA, Karachi.

Phone No. 99244112-7 Fax No. 99244118

Website: <http://www.stevta.gos.pk>

BID EVALUATION REPORT

1	Name of Procuring Agency	Sindh Technical Educational & Vocational Training Authority (STEVTA)
2	Tender Reference No.	STEVTA/WS/TENDER/56/2011-12
3	Tender Description / Name of Work / Item	Setting up park & plantation work at STEVTA Head Quarter, Near Nipa Chowrangi, Karachi.
4	Method of Procuring	Procurement of Works through Single Stage One Envelope
5	Tender Published	Advertised on 29-07-2011 through STEVTA & SPPRA Website
6	Total Bids Documents Sold	03
7	Total Bids Received	03
8	Technical Bids Opening Date	6/8/2011
9	No of Bids Technically Qualified	03
10	No of Bids Rejected	No Bid Rejected
11	Financial Bid Opening Date	6/8/2011

Bid Evaluation Report

No.	Name of Firm Bidder	Cost Offered by the Bidder	Ranking in Terms of Cost	Comparison with Estimated Cost	Reasons for Acceptance / Rejection	Remarks
0	1	2	3	4	5	6
1	M/s The Green Leaf	995,000.00	1st Lowest	4.7% Above	Selected on the basis of Technically qualification and lowest price offered	Accepted
2	M/s Bismillah Garden Maker	1,140,877.69	2nd Lowest	20.05% above	Technically qualified but offered higher rates.	2nd Lowest
3	M/s Plants N Plants	1,428,528.00	3rd Lowest	50.32% Above	Technically qualified but offered higher rates.	3rd Lowest

Name of Member	Designation	Signature	Name of Member	Designation	Signature
Mr. Ghulam Sarwar Joyo	Director (Works & Services)		Mr. Abdul Waheed Shaikh	Assistant Director (Finance)	
Abdul Hafeez Abbasi	Deputy Director (MIS)		Mr. Muhammad Zahid Shaikh	Deputy Director (Works & Services)	
Saeed Ahmed Shaikh	Deputy Secretary Admn CM Secretariat		Mr. Khadim Hussain	Deputy Director (DW)	



Employment through Skill

Sindh Technical Education & Vocational Training Authority (STEVTA)

ST-19, Block 6, Gulshan-e-Iqbal, Near NIPA, Karachi.

Phone No. 99244112-7 Fax No. 99244118

Website: <http://www.stevta.gov.pk>

BID EVALUATION REPORT

1	Name of Procuring Agency	Sindh Technical Educational & Vocational Training Authority (STEVTA)
2	Tender Reference No.	STEVTA/WS/TENDER/55/2011-12
3	Tender Description / Name of Work / Item	Plantation Work at Technical Training Centre, Kotri.
4	Method of Procuring	Procurement of Works through Single Stage One Envelope
5	Tender Published	Advertised on 29-07-2011 through STEVTA & SPPRA Website
6	Total Bids Documents Sold	04
7	Total Bids Received	03
8	Technical Bids Opening Date	5/8/2011
9	No of Bids Technically Qualified	03
10	No of Bids Rejected	No Bid Rejected
11	Financial Bid Opening Date	5/8/2011

12

Bid Evaluation Report

S.No.	Name of Firm Bidder	Cost Offered by the Bidder	Ranking in Terms of Cost	Comparison with Estimated Cost	Reasons for Acceptance / Rejection	Remarks
0	1	2	3	4	5	6
1	M/s Muhammad Idrees	980,250.00	1st Lowest	1.97% Below	Selected on the basis of Technically qualification and lowest price offered	Accepted
2	M/s Ali Murtaza Panhyor	995,650.00	2nd Lowest	0.43% Below	Technically qualified but offered higher rates.	2nd Lowest
3	M/s M.N International	999,350.00	3rd Lowest	0.06% Below	Technically qualified but offered higher rates.	3rd Lowest

Name of Member	Designation	Signature	Name of Member	Designation	Signature
Mr. Ghulam Sarwar Joyo	Director (Works & Services)		Mr. Abdul Waheed Shaikh	Assistant Director (Finance)	
Abdul Hafeez Abbasi	Deputy Director (MIS)		Mr. Muhammad Zahid Shaikh	Deputy Director (Works & Services)	
Saeed Ahmed Shaikh	Deputy Secretary Admn CM Secretariat		Mr. Khadim Hussain	Deputy Director (DW)	