

Sindh Technical Education & Vocational Training Authority (STEVTA)

ST-19, Block 6, Gulshan-e-Iqbal, Near NIPA, Karachi.

Phone No. 99244112-7Fax No. 99244118

Website: http://www.stevta.gos.px



			BID EVALUAT	ION REPORT				
1	Name of Procuring Agency			Sindh Technical Educational & Vocational Training Authority (STEVTA)				
2	Tender Reference No.			STEVTA/WS/TENDER/69	/2011-12	3115		
3 ·	Tender Description / Name	of Work / Item .	24	MAINTENANCE & RENOV SCHOOL, ROHRI	VATION WORK OF GOVERNMEN	T VOCATIONAL		
4	Method of Procuring			Procurement of Works t	hrough Single Stage One Envelo	pe ·		
5	Tender Published			Advertised on 24-02-20 Website	12 through News Paper & STEVT	'A & SPPRA		
6	Total Bids Documents Sold			03 .				
7.	Total Bids Received			03				
8	Technical Bids Opening Da	te		N.A				
9	No of Bids Technically Qua	ilified		03				
10	No of Bids Rejected			No Bid Rejected				
.11	Financial Bid Opening Date	2		21/03/2012		-		
12			Bid Eva	luation Report				
S.No.	Name of Firm Bidder	Cost Offered by the Bidder	Ranking in Terms of Cost	Comparison with Estimated Cost	Reasons for Acceptance / Rejection	Remarks		
0	1	2	3	4	5	. 6		
1	M/S Dua Enterprises	Rs. 4,024,315/-	1st Lowest	33.69% above	Selected on the basis of Technically qualification and lowest price offered	Accepted		
2 .	M/S Ahmed & Co.	Rs. 5,504,670/-	2nd Lowest -	- 82.87% above	Technically qualified but offered higher rates.	2nd Lowest		
3	M/S AI-Asad Traders	Rs.5,561,884/-	3rd Lowest	84.77% above	Technically qualified but offered higher rates.	3rd Lowest		

M/S Dua Enterprises have given 12% rebate on their total bid amount of Rs. 4,573,085/= and as such their offer now stands for Rs. 4,024,315/= for the complete work. The following members of the tender opening committee have accordingly recommended for the acceptance of the lowest offer amounting to Rs. 4,024,315/= in favor of M/S Dua Enterprises.

Name of Member	Designation	Signature	Name of Member	Designation	Signature
Mr. Ghulam Sarwar Joyo	Director (Works & Services)	hof	Mr. Abdul Waheed Shaikh	Assistant Director (Finance)	?
Abdul Haffez Abbasi	Deputy Director (MIS)	m	Mr. Muhammad Zahid Shaikh	Deputy Director (Works & Services)	8/18
Representative of Administrative Deptt/CM Secretariat	(to be nominated by Secretary to CM)	/	Mr. Khadim Hussain	Deputy Oirector (D op	Inde
Representative of Works & Services Deptt.	(to be nominated by Secretary)		. 18		, 4

Employment through Skill

Sindh Technical Education & Vocational Training Authority (STEVTA) ST-19, Block 6, Guishan-e-lqbal, Near NIPA, Karachl, Phong No. 99244112-7 Fax No. 99244118 Website: http://www.stevta.gos.px

			Avenuation in the	Variation Boarbo			
	The state of the s		BID EVALUA	ATION REPORT	Г		
I	Name of Procuring Agency	7			Sindh Technical Educational & Vocational Training Authority (STEVTA)		
12	Tender Reference No.	The second second second			STEVTA/WS/TENDER/ 67 /2011-12		
3	Tender Description / Name of	f Work / Item	Maintenance and Renovation work at Governm Karachi (B.Tech) Section.	nent College of Technolog			
4	Method of Procuring			Procurement of Works through Single St	age One Envelope		
5	Tender Published		Advertised on 24 / 02 /2012 through r of STEVTA & SPPRA.	ews paper & website			
6	Total Bids Documents Sold				03		
7	Total Bids Received			03			
8	Technical Bids Opening Date			N.A			
9	No of Bids Technically Qualifie	ed _		03			
10	No of Bids Rejected				No Bid Rejected		
11	Financial Bid Opening Date				15 /03/2012		
12							
S.No.	Name of Firm Bidder	QUOTED RATE IN PAK.	RANKING IN TERMS OF COST	COMPARISON WITH ESTIMATED COST	Reasons for Acceptance / Rejection	Remarks	
0	1	2	3	4	5	6	
1	M/S Ali Jumani Enterprises	Rs: 28,135,691/-	1 st Lowest	20.78 -% above	Selected on the basis of Technically qualification and lowest price offered	Accepted (1st Lowest)	
2	M/S Jiya Enturprises	Rs: 28, 419,303/-	2 rd Lowest	22.00 % above	Technically qualified but offered higher rates.	(2nd Lowest)	
3	M/S Naseer Prother	Rs: 29,199,996/-	3 rd Lowest	25.35 % above	Technically qualified but offered	(3rd Lowest)	

Following members of the tender opening committee after due consideration have recommended for the acceptence of the lowest bid amounting to rupees = 28,135,691/- in favour of M/S Jumani Enterprises.

Name of Member	Signature	Name of Member	Signature
Mr. Ghulam Sarwar Joyo Director (Works & Services	Sanfa	Mr. Abdul Waheed Shaikh Assistant Director (Finance)	Many
Abdul Haffez Abbasi Deputy Director (MIS)	The s	Mr. Muhammad Zahid Shaikh Deputy Director (Works & Services)	278
Mr. Khadim Hussain Deputy Director (DW)	(Guerral)	Representive of Administrative Deptt/CM Secretariat (to be nominated by Secretary to CM)	
Representive of Works & Services Depti. (to be nominated by Secretary)			

ing



Employment through Skill

Sindh Technical Education & Vocational Training Authority (STEVTA)

5T-19, Block 6, Gulshan-e-Iqbal, Near NIPA, Karachi. Phone No. 99244112-7 Fax No. 99244118 Website: http://www.stevta.gos.pk

			Website: http:/	/www.stevta.gos.pk			
			BID EVALUA	ATION REPOR	T		
1 -	Name of Procuring Agency				Sindh Technical Educational & Vocational Training Authority (STEVTA)		
2	Tender Reference No.				STEVTA/WS/TENDER/ 65 /2011-12		
3	Tender Description / Name of	Work / Item		Maintenance and Repair Work of Government Institute Khairpur	Vocational Training		
4	Method of Procuring				Procurement of Works through Single St	age One Envelope	
5	Tender Published			Advertised on 24 / 02 /2012 through C "Express" & website of STEVTA & SPPRA	The second secon		
6	Total Bids Documents Sold				03		
7	Total Bids Received				03		
8	Technical Bids Opening Date				N.A		
9	No of Bids Technically Qualific	ed			03		
10	No of Bids Rejected				No Bid Rejected		
11	Financial Bid Opening Date	15-7			12 / 03 /2012		
12			Bid E	valuation Report			
S.No.	Name of Firm Bidder	QUOTED RATE IN PAK. RANKING IN TERMS RS. OF COST COMPARISON WITH ESTIMATED COST			Reasons for Acceptance / Rejection	Remarks	
0	1	2	3	4	5	6	
1	M/S G.M Enterprises	25,252,974	1ST LOWEST	31.06 % ABOVE	Selected on the basis of Technically qualification and lowest price offered	Accepted (1st Lowest)	
2	M/S Riaz & Brothers	28,921,730	2ND LOWEST	50.10 % ABOVE	Technically qualified but offered higher rates.	(2nd Lowest)	
3	M/S Al-Madina	29.649.210	3RD LOWEST	53.88 % anbove	Technically qualified but offered	(3rd Lowest)	

Following members of the tender opening committee after due consideration have recommended for the acceptence of the lowest bid amounting to rupees = 25,252,974 in favour of M/S G.M Enterprises.

higher rates.

Name o	f Member	Signature	Name of Member	Signature
5.00 (CASA CASA CASA CASA CASA CASA CASA CAS	n Sanwar Joyo rks & Services)	June J	Mr. Abdul Waheed Shaikh Assistant Director (Finance)	My
	ffez Abbasi rector (MIS)	Jun	Mr. Muhammad Zahid Shaikh Deputy Director (Works & Services)	21.7
3,040,200,077	im Hussain rector (DW)	finding.	Representive of Administrative Deptt/CM Secretariat (to be nominated by Secretary to CM)	
	orks & Services Deptt. ted by Secretary)			`



Employment through Skill

Sindh Technical Education & Vocational Training Authority (STEVTA)

ST-19, Block 6, Gulshan-e-Iqbal, Near NIPA, Karachi. Phone No. 99244112-7 Fax No. 99244118 Website: http://www.stevta.gos.pk

1	Name of Procuring Agency	Sindh Technical Educational & Vocational Training Authority (STEVTA)
2	Tender Reference No.	STEVTA/WS/TENDER/ 115 /2011-12
3	Tender Description / Name of Work / Item	Maintenance and Repair Work of Government Polytechnic Institute Makl at Thatta.
4	Method of Procuring	Procurement of Works through Single Stage One Envelope
5	Tender Published	Advertised on 24 / 02 /2012 through news paper & website of STEVTA & SPPRA.
6	Total Bids Documents Sold	03
7	Total Bids Received	03
8	Technical Bids Opening Date	N.A
9	No of Bids Technically Qualified	03
10	No of Bids Rejected	No Bid Rejected
11	Financial Bid Opening Date	28 / 03 /2012
12		Bid Evaluation Report

QUOTED RATE IN PAK. RANKING IN TERMS S.No. Name of Firm Bidder COMPARISON WITH Reasons for Acceptance / Rejection Remarks RS. ESTIMATED COST OF COST 18. 0 M/S Preety Construction Co: 6,034,157 1ST LOWEST 21.57 % ABOVE Selected on the basis of Technically Accepted (1st Lowest) qualification and lowest price offered Technically qualified but offered M/S N & N Enterprises 6,719,543 2NO LOWEST 35.38 % ABOVE (2nd Lowest) higher rates. Technically qualified but offered M/S Al-Shahid & Co: 7,208,162 3RD LOWEST 45.23 % anbove (3rd Lowest) higher rates.

Following members of the tender opening committee after due consideration have recommended for the acceptence of the lowest bid amounting to rupees = 6,034,157/- in favour of M/S Mustafa Associates.

Name of Member	Signature	Name of Member	Signature
Mr. Ghulam Sarwar Joyo Director (Works & Services)	fund	Mr. Abdul Waheed Shaikh Assistant Director (Finance)	J. J.
Abdul Haffez Abbasi Deputy Director (MIS)	(M)	Mr. Muhammad Zahid Shaikh Deputy Director (Works & Services)	Bis of
Mr. Khadim Hussain Deputy Director (DW)	mon 3	Representive of Administrative Deptt/CM Secretariat (to be nominated by Secretary to CM)	
Representive of Works & Services Deptt. (to be nominated by Secretary)			,

2.

OCK-5. Sindh (Abdul Wareed)Descriptibids Evaluation of Thatta



Sindh Technical Education & Vocational Training Authority (STEVTA) 57-19, Block 6, Gulshan-e-Iqbal, Near NIPA, Karachi.

Phone No. 99244112-7 Fax No. 99244118 Website: http://www.steyta.gos.px

1	Name of Procuring Agency	Sindh Technical Educational & Vocational Training Authority
2		(STEVTA)
4	Tender Reference No.	STEVTA/WS/TENDER/116/2011-12
3	Tender Description / Name of Work / Item	Renovate / Refurbishment of Model Class Room at Government college of Technology S.I.Y.E Karachi, Government Polytechnic Institute Thatta and Government Polytechnic Institute Larkana:
4	Method of Procuring	Procurement of Works through Single Package Two Envelope
5	Tender Published	Advertised on 28/02/2012 through news paper & website of STEVTA & SPPRA
6	Total Bids Documents Sold	03
7	Total Bids Received	03
8	Technical Bids Opening Date	19/3/2012
9	No of Bids Technically Qualified	03
10	No of Bids Rejected	No Bid Rejected
11	Financial Bid Opening Date	26/03/2012
12		tion report of Technical Proposal

echnical Proposal submitted by the following firms are scruitnized & M/s Decent Trading Company declare technically qualified by obtaining

of 67.9 out of 70 which is more higher than the other two participants . Their position is given below for ready reference:

	Total	200	70.	67.9	47.1	44
3	Technical Proposal	50	30	30	17	19
4	Design Proposal	50	30	30	24	18
1	Company Profile	100	10	7.9	6.1	7
\$:No		MaxiScore	(Optained score	Decent Trading Co:	HI-Tech Poly Construction Associates	Mas-Con

(II) Bid Evaluation report of Financial Proposal

S.No.	Name of Firm Bidder	QUOTED RATE IN PAX. RS.	RANKING IN TERMS OF COST	COMPARISON WITH ESTIMATED COST	Reasons for Acceptance / Rejection	Remarks
1	M/S Decent Trading Company,	15,372,835/-	1ST LOWEST	16.02% ABOVE	Selected on the basis of Technically qualification and lowest price offered	Accepted (1st Lowest)
2 →	i Hi-Tech Poly Construction Associate	17,923,869/-	2ND LOWEST	35.2% ABOVE	Technically qualified but offered higher rates.	(2nd Lowest)
3	M/S Mas-con	18,913,156/-	3RD LOWEST	42.74% ABOVE	Technically qualified but offered higher rates.	(3rd Lowest)

ollowing members of the tender opening committee after due consideration have recommended for the acceptence of the owest bid amounting to rupees 15,372,835/- in favour of M/S Decent Trading Company.

r. Ghulam Sarwar Joyo	The state of the s	nature
rector (Warks & Services)	Mr. Abdul Waheed Shaikh Assistant Director (Finance)	h
odul Haffez Abbasi puty Oirector (MIS)	Mr. Muhammad Zahid Shaikh * Deputy Director (Works & Services)	Lad
. Khadim Hussain puty Director (OW)	Representive of Administrative Deptt/CM Secretariat (to be nominated	100
presentive of Warks & Services Deptt. be nominated by Secretary)	by Secretary to CM)	

Ecent/Abdul Wished/Desktop/bid Evaluation of Model dass Room - II

13

S.No.

3

lowii rest Ł

Haffez y Direc adim h o Direct entive

Enployment through Skill

Sindh Technical Education & Vocational Training Authority (STEVTA) ST-19, Block 6, Guishan-e-Iqbal, Near NIPA, Karachi. Phone No. 99244112-7 Fax No. 99244118 Website: http://www.stevta.gos.pk

1		100000000000000000000000000000000000000	BID EVALUA	STREET, STREET	MEDICAL CONTRACT CONT	
	Name of Procuring Agency				Sindh Technical Educational & Vocational Training Authority (STEVTA)	
2	Tender Reference No.				STEVTA/WS/TENDER/109/2011-12	
3	Tender Description / Name of Work / Item				Renovate/ Refurbishment of Regional Directorate office & Trade Testi Board at Govt: college of Technology (Girls) Karimabad, Regional Directorate Office Hyderabad & Regional Directorate office Sukkur	
4	Method of Procuring				Procurement of Works through Single Package Two Envelope	
5					Advertised on 28/02/2012 through news paper & website of	
3	Tender Published				STEVTA & SPPRA .	
6	Total Bids Documents Sold				03	
7	Total Bids Received				03	
8	Technical Bids Opening Date				19/3/2012	
9	No of Bids Technically Qualified				03	
10	No of Bids Rejected				No Bid Rejected	
11 _	Financial Bid Opening Date				26/03/2012	
	Family and				E010017017	
12	(1) Bid Evaluation report of Technical Proposal					
	Technical Proposal submitted by the following firms are scruitnized & M/s Decent Trading Company declare technically qualified by obtaining					
	Lean and the state of	Company declare technically qualified by	obtaining			
0.0003	of 68.2 out of 70 which is more h	ligher than the other	two participants . T	heir position is giv	ren below:	
S:No	Section	Max: Score	Optained score	Decent Trading Co:	Hi-Tech Poly Construction Associates	Mas-Con
1	Company Profile	WW. 1. 10 HE WE		的数据中国国际地区等于	SMEANING SHARE SHOULD VAR A SECTION	(Viaz-Con
_ c=_ ,	Company Profile	100	10	8.2	5.1	6.3
2	Design Proposal	50	30	30	24	18
3	Technical Proposal	50	30	30	18	20
	Total	200	70	68.2	47.1	44.3
13	(II) Bid Evaluation report of Financial Proposal					
1000	4-1702-194					Allega de la companya de la company
S.No.	Name of Firm Bidder	QUOTED RATE IN PAK	RANKING IN TERMS OF COST	COMPARISON WITH ESTIMATED COST	Reasons for Acceptance / Rejection	Remarks
	M/S Decent Trading Company.	55,580,519/-	1ST LOWEST	24.61% ABOVE	Selected on the basis of Technically	
1		19-100-001		24.01.0 MaGVE	qualification and lowest price offered	Accepted (1st) Lowest
-	M/S Hi-Tech Poly Construction Associate	57,319,274/-	2ND LOWEST	26.56% ABOVE	qualification and lowest price offered Technically qualified but offered higher rates.	Accepted (1st Lowest (2nd Lowest)

Representive of Works & Services Deptt. (to be nominated by Secretary)