BN Evaluation Report for Establishment of 06 Garbage Transfer Station

GTS)

with Material Recovery Facilities {MRF) and Refuse Drived Fuel {(RDF) Unit

in the

ADP-2015-16.

1. Name of Procuring Agency:
2. Tender Reference No:
3. Tender Description/Name of work/item:

4. Method of Procurement:

5. Tender Published:

Sindh Solid Waste Management Board.
SSWMB/NIT-18.

Establishment of 06 Garbage Transfer Station (GTS) with

Material Recovery Facilities (MRF) and R
Fuel (RDF) Unit in the ADP-2015-16.

efuse Drived

Open Competitive Bidding (National) Single Stage — Two

Envelop Procedure.
SPPRA & SSWMB Website (SPPRA Serial
Daily Jung Karachi, Kawish Hyderabad and

No. 25587),
Dawn Karachi

Secretary/ Member Procurement Committee-1 & ||

SSWMB Karachi

{ Shamsuddin Katpar }
Deputy Director (Finance} SSWMB Karachi
Member

Executive

irector-1, SSWMB Karachi

Mem/ber

P,
Y,

/

L

( Abdu! Rauf)

Section Dfficer'SGAKCD

on 28.10.2015 and 29.10.2015 respectively,
Corrigendum in Daily Jung Karachi, Kawish Hyderabad
and Dawn Karachi on 12.11.2015 and 13.11.2015
respectively.
6. Total Bid documents Sold: 01.
7. Total Bids Received: NIL.
8. Technical Bid Opening date: 30.11.2015
9. No. of Bid technically qualified: NIL.
10. Bid(s) Rejected: NIL.
11. Financial Bid Opening date: 30.11.2015
12. Bid Evaluation Report:
Procurement committee meeting dated 29.01.2016
Work-A. - . R
Construction of Garbage Transfer Station { Civil, Electrical, Water Supply, Sanitary and
allied Mechanical Works.
Iltem No. 1 {(a) Meva Shah near Graveyard, District West.
f . Comparison
f S | NameofFirmor | Costoffered I'?ankmg with Reasans for
' No Bidder by the Bidder | "™ | Estimateq | Occeptance/ Remarks
| of cost rejection
| cost
1 NIL NIL NIL NIL NIL Me be
ol | Retendered
Kf SOt \R, T \\é\}
( Dr. Abdul-Yabbar Shaikh } (Abdl}t\ﬂ%z, anna)

NN

D.D (Tech) SEPA, Karachi

Member

. A. D. Sajnani )

Chairman




BI¥ Evaluation Report for Establishment of 06 Garbage Transfer Station

(GTS)

with Material Recovery Facilities {MRF) and Refuse Drived Fuel (RDF)} Unit

tin the

ADP-2015-16.

1. Name of Procuring Agency:
2. Tender Reference No:

3. Tender Description/Name of work/item:

4. Method of Procurement:

5. Tender Published:

6. Total Bid documents Sold:

7. Total Bids Received:

8. Technical Bid Opening date:

9. No. of Bid technically qualified:
10. Bid(s) Rejected:

11. Financial Bid Opening date:
12. Bid Evaluation Report:

Procurement committee meeting dated 29.01.2016

Work-A.

Construction of Garbage Transfer Station { Civil, Electrical, Water Supply, Sani

Sindh Solid Waste Management Board.
SSWMB/NIT-18.
Establishment of 06 Garbage Transfer Statig

on {GTS) with

Material Recovery Facilities (MRF) and Refuse Drived

Fuel (RDF) Unit in the ADP-2015-16.

Open Competitive Bidding (National) Singl
Envelop Procedure.

SPPRA & SSWMB Website (SPPRA Seria
Daily Jung Karachi, Kawish Hyderabad and

on 28.10.2015 and 29.10.2015

p Stage — Two

No. 25587),
Dawn Karachi
respectively,

Corrigendum in Daily Jung Karachi, Kawish Hyderabad

and Dawn Karachi
respectively.

02 and 02 download from Internet Website.

02.
30.11.2015
02

NIL.
30.11.2015

on 12.11.2015 and 13.11.2015

tary and

allied Mechanical Works.
Item No. 2 (a)

Near Korangi Causeway / Malir River

. ki C 1 Reasons fo
S | Name of Firmor | Cost offered by the {?an 'ng omp fmson s for
. . in terms with acceptance/ Remarks
No Bidder Bidder , N
of cost | Estimated cost rejection
M/S Rehman First Accepted as 't\"a‘/ bed tr:com“;'e"‘:‘:d
i
1 Construction 167,926,241.70 Open Rate lowest © award the contract 1o
—_— Lowest ] M/S Rehman

- Co. o B o _ b'dder B _Constryction Co.

M/S Kamran & Second
2 / 264,249,013.00 - - -

Kampany. Lowest

’/i -
GGy
( Dr. Abdu! Xitbar Shaikh ) (Abdu\);a(kéz\}t\aﬁna)
Secretary/ Member Procurement Committee‘l &Il Section” Qffizer SGAK .
SSWMB Karachi Member ~
S _
/\\\ SR
Q(\. Sy N
( Shamsuddin Katpar ) e { Abdul Rauf)

Deputy Director (Finance) SSWMB Karach ! & )
Member
{ Br. A. D. Sajnani)

Executive Director-I, SSWMB Karachi

Member

Chairman

D.D (Tech) SEPA, Karachi




B’E Evaluation Report for Establishment of 06 Garbage Transfer Station (GTSJ

with Material Recovery Facilities (MRF} and Refuse Drived Fuel (RDF) Unit in the

ADP-2015-16.

1. Name of Procuring Agency:
2. Tender Reference No:

3. Tender Description/Name of work/item:

4. Method of Procurement:

5. Tender Published:

. Total Bid documents Sold:

. Total Bids Received:

. Technical Bid Opening date:

. No. of Bid technically qualified:
10. Bid(s) Rejected:

11. Financial Bid Opening date:
12. Bid Evaluation Report:

WO 00~ O

Procurement committee meeting dated 29.01.2016

Work-A.

Sindh Solid Waste Management Board.
SSWMB/NIT-18.

Establishment of 06 Garbage Transfer Statipn (GTS) with
Material Recovery Facilities (MRF) and Refuse Drived
Fuel (RDF} Unit in the ADP-2015-16.
Open Competitive Bidding (National)} Single Stage — Two
Envelop Procedure.
SPPRA & SSWMB Website (SPPRA Seria}l No. 25587),
Daily Jung Karachi, Kawish Hyderabad and Dawn Karachi
on 28.10.2015 and 29.10.2015 respectively,
Corrigendum in Daily Jung Karachi, Kawish Hyderabad
and Dawn Karachi on 12.11.2015 and 13.11.2015
respectively.
01.

NIL.
30.11.2015
NIL.

NIL.
30.11.2015

Construction of Garbage Transfer Station ( Civil, Electrical, Water Supply, Sanitary and

allied Mechanical Works.

Item No. 3 (a}) Sharafi Goth Near Graveyard, Altaf Hussain Road Landhi. i
- : R
S | Name of Firmor | Cost offered by the f'?ankmg Comp.anson easons for
. . interms with acceptance/ Remarks
No Bidder Bidder , N
of cost | Estimated cost rejection
1 NIL NIL NIL NIL NIL May be
. A __ | Re-tendered

{ Dr. Abdul)ﬁ%r Shalkh )
Secretary/ Member Procurement Committee-|
SSWMB Karachi

( Shamsuddin Katpar)
Deputy Director (Finance) SSWMB Karachi
Member

T ‘5"
(x/l‘) Sajnani )

Executive Director-i, SSWMB Karachi

, ( Abd m I\jna
&1 SectionOR| ?\SGA&C

U

Member

1y N
AN
( Abdul Rauf )

D (Tech) SEPA, Karachi
Member

o

Chairman




Bl Evaluation Report for Establishment of 06 Garbage Transfer Station

(GTS)

with Material Recovery Facilities (MRF) and Refuse Drived Fuel (RDF) Uni

tin the

1. Name of Procuring Agency:
2. Tender Reference No:

3. Tender Description/Name of work/item:

4. Method of Procurement:

5. Tender Published:

. Total Bid documents Sold:
. Total Bids Received:
. Technical Bid Opening date:

O 00~

10. Bid{s) Rejected:
11. Financial Bid Qpening date:
12. Bid Evaluation Report:

. No. of Bid technically qualified:

ADP-2015-16.

Sindh Solid Waste Management Board.

SSWMB/NIT-18.

Establishment of 06 Garbage Transfer Stati
Material Recovery Facilities (MRF) and
Fuel (RDF) Unit in the ADP-2015-16.

Open Competitive Bidding (National) Singl

Envelop Procedure.

SPPRA & SSWMB Website (SPPRA Seria
Daily Jung Karachi, Kawish Hyderabad and

on

Corrigendum in Daily Jung Karachi, Kawi
and Dawn Karachi

28.10.2015 an

respectively.

01.
01.

30.11.2015

01.
NIL.

30.11.2015

Procurement committee meeting dated 29.01.2016

on 12.11.2015 an

d 29.10.2015

pn {GTS) with
Refuse Drived

e Stage — Two

| No. 25587),

Dawn Karachi
respectively,

sh Hyderabad
d 13.11.2015

Work-A.
Construction of Garbage Transfer Station { Civil, Electrical, Water Supply, Sanitary and
allied Mechanical Works.
ltem No. 4 (a) Sohrab Goth Near Lyari Express Way.
N N j R n
S ¢.Jme of Cost offered by Ranking in terms (..‘ompu.nson easons for
Firm or . with Estimated acceptance/ Remarks
No . the Bidder of cost N
Bidder cost rejection ‘
May be accepted as ;
Single bidder. Bid fufills | oY P¢
M/S criteria laid down undef :\e’:’:;)zmen € tI:Z '
1 Gulzari 167,076,370.00 | Single Bid Open Rate Rule 48 of SPP Ruleg | ' =+ 1o M/S
. — 2010 {Amended 2013). .
Associates. ) Gulzari
May be accepted as First Associates
L | _ R ] o _| lowest bidder. | | )
- \\ |
AN AL
( Dr. Abdulddbbar Shaikh ) (Abéw{\il afede Channa )
Secretary/ Member Procurement Committee-| & II Section Officer SGA&CD
SSWMB Karachi Member o
AN
W ?\I\\W\ ‘
( Shamsuddin Katpar } - ( Abdul Rauf ) ~
Deputy Director (Finance) SSWMB Karacéhi/-— ~ /”\/‘ 8 D.D (Tech) SERA, Karachi
Member - o Member
. A, D. Sajnani )




Bid Evaluation Report for Establishment of 06 Garbage Transfer Station (GTS) with

Material Recovery Facilities (MRF) and Refuse Drived Fuel (RDF) Unitin the ADP-2015-16.

1. Name of Procuring Agency:
. Tender Reference No:
. Tender Description/Name of work/item:

w N

4. Method of Procurement:

5. Tender Published:

6. Total Bid documents Sold:

7. Total Bids Received:

8. Technica! Bid Opening date:

9. No. of Bid technically qualified:
10. Bid{s) Rejected:

11. Financial Bid Opening date:
12. Bid Evaluation Report:

Procurement committee meeting dated 29.01.2016

Work-A.

Sindh Sclid Waste Management Board.
SSWMB/NIT-18.

Establishment of 06 Garbage Transfer Station (GTS) with
Material Recovery Facilities {MRF) and Refuse Drived Fuel

(RDF) Unit in the ADP-2015-16.

Open Competitive Bidding (National) Single
Envelop Procedure.

SPPRA & SSWMB Website {SPPRA Serial No.
Jung Karachi,
28.10.2015 and 29.10.2015 respectively, Corrig
Jung Karachi,
12.11.2015 and 13.11.2015 respectively.

02 and 02 download from Internet Website.
03.

30.11.2015

03.

NIL.

30.11.2015

Stage — Two

25587), Daily

Kawish Hyderabad and Dawp Karachi on

endum in Daily

Kawish Hyderabad and Dawp Karachi on

Construction of Garbage Transfer Station ( Civil, Electrical, Water Supply, Sanitary and

allied Mechanical Works.

Item No. 5 (a) Gulshan-e-Igbal.
; : R
s Name of Firm or Cost offered by the I.?ankmg (;ompar:son easons for
) . in terms with Estimated acceptance/ Remarks
No Bidder Bidder N
of cost cost rejection
i ; : May he recommended
1 M/S GU|ZaF' 164,575,163.00 First Open Rate ?ccepted as to awprd the contract to
| |fsocates.  e—— o towest ) trsttowest. | mys Guizari Associates.
2 M/S Zamir Ahmed & 167,325,239.00 Second ) i i
_ . |.Lo I Lowest S R
3 M/S Kamran & 264.249,013.00 Third i i i
oy Kampany | 0 .. ._ ltowest | o B}
2o/ | ;
. )
e, it
( Dr. Abdgf Jabbar Shaikh ) ( Abd &M&mna )
Secretary/ Member Procurement Committee-1 & I Section T SGAGCD
SSWMB Karachi Memper
1.
- YN N, »\\i
N, g
| P\\"\\}n’\\ . " y ¥
( Shamsuddin Katpar) ( Abdui Rauf )
Deputy Director {Finance) SSWMB Karachi D.D (Tech) SEPA, Karachi
Member P //T/,_— Member
&
. D. Sajnani )
Executive Drector-1, SSWMB Karachi
Chairman




= Bid Evaluation Report for Establishment of 06 Garbage Transfer Sf

tation

(GTS) with Material Recovery Facilities (MRF) and Refuse Drived

Fuel

(RDF) Unit in the ADP-2015-16.

1. Name of Procuring Agency:
2. Tender Reference No:
3. Tender Description/Name of work/item:

Sindh Solid Waste Management Board.
SSWMB/NIT-18.
Establishment of 06 Garbage Transfer Stati

Material Recovery Facilities (MRF) and
Fuel (RDF) Unit in the ADP-2015-16.

Open Competitive Bidding (National) Singl
Envelop Procedure.

4. Method of Procurement:

5. Tender Published:
Daily Jung Karachi, Kawish Hyderabad and
on 28.10.2015 and 29.10.2015
Corrigendum in Daily Jung Karachi, Kaw
and Dawn Karachi
respectively.

6. Total Bid documents Sold: 03.
7. Total Bids Received: 03.
8. Technical Bid Opening date: 30.11.2015
9. No. of Bid technically qualified: 03.
10. Bid(s) Rejected: NIL.
11. Financial Bid Opening date: 30.11.2015

12. Bid Evaluation Report:
Procurement committee meeting dated 29.01.2016
Work-A.

on (GTS) with
Refuse Drived

L Stage — Two

SPPRA & SSWMB Website (SPPRA Serial No. 25587),

Dawn Karachi
respectively,
sh Hyderabad

on 12.11.2015 and 13.11.2015

b

Construction of Garbage Transfer Station { Civil, Electrical, Water Supply, Sanitary and
allied Mechanical Works.
Item No, 6 (a) Saforra Goth Near Rececourse on University Road.
. Rankin Compariso Reasons for
R) Name of Firm or Cost offered . g p' " f
) . interms with acceptance/ Remarks
No Bidder by the Bidder , .
of cost | Estimated cost rejection
: First Accepted as | May be recommended to
1 | M/SAl-Hussaini & Co. | 144,882,598.00 L s ¢ Open Rate First Lowest. award the contract to
- I e R | M/sarHyssaini&Co.
5 M/S G.ulzarl 167,076,370.00 Second A ) i
Associates. Lowest
— - - owest b .
3 M/S Qamaruddin 171,954,222.64 | Third ) ) )
| Shaikh j | Lowest
e | A R ’/,7 S T - - . — - - _— - _—— e - 7777”7_&\——7
o
( Dr. Abdul JgBbar Shaikh ) ( Ab ul He(;feiz\ég‘A na)
Secretary/ Member Procurement Committee-| & Sect»Qn Q &CD
Il SSWMB Karachi \ \Méﬁ"hber
,"/ A “ .
( Shamsuddin Katpar ) ( Abdul Rauf )
Deputy Director {Finance) SSWMB KarAaIC/h',‘ T D.D (Tech) SEPA, Karachi
Member T & Member
. A. D. Sajnani )

Executive’Director-1, SSWMB Karachi
Chairman




B Evaluation Report for Establishment of 06 Garbage Transfer Station

GTS)

with Material Recovery Facilities (MRF) and Refuse Drived Fuel (RDF) Unit in the

ADP-2015-16.

1. Name of Procuring Agency:
2. Tender Reference No:
3. Tender Description/Name of work/item:

SSWMB/NIT-18.

Sindh Solid Waste Management Board.

Establishment of 06 Garbage Transfer Statian (GTS) with

Material Recovery Facilities (MRF) and Refuse Drived

Fuel {(RDF) Unit in the ADP-2015-16.
Open Competitive Bidding (National) Single Stage — Two

4. Method of Procurement:
Envelop Procedure.
5. Tender Published:

on 28.10.2015

SPPRA & SSWMB Website (SPPRA Serial
Daily Jung Karachi, Kawish Hyderabad and

29.10.2015

No. 25587),
Dawn Karachi
respectively,

Corrigendum in Daily Jung Karachi, Kawish Hyderabad

and Dawn Karachi on 12.11.2015 and 13.11.2015
respectively.
6. Total Bid documents Sold: 01 download from Internet website.
7. Total Bids Received: 01.
8. Technical Bid Opening date: 30.11.2015
9. No. of Bid technically qualified: NIL.
10. Bid(s) Rejected: NIL.
11. Financial Bid Opening date: 30.11.2015
12. Bid Evaluation Report:
Procurement committee meeting dated 29.01.2016
Work-B,
Manufacturing, Supply Installation & Commissioning of Mechanical Units .
{ s [ | costofferedby |Ranking | Comparison | Reasonsfor ||
' No Name of Firm or Bidder | the Bidder interms | with acceptance/ | Remarks
of cost Estimated cost | rejection
'y | M/S Technomen NIL | NIL NIL NIL May be ’
| ifmesties i ... |[Re-tendered |
//‘_/ ///’-’b _»\' ' .
(Dr. Abdujﬁbar Shaikh ) ( Ab\i\\&f&z_\fhama )
Secretary/ Member Procurement Committee-l & Il Section Officer SGA&CD
SSWMB Karachi Member
TN N G\
¥ ‘Q' \/
{ Shamsuddin Katpar ( Abdul Rauf )
Deputy Director (Finance) SSWIMB Karachi D.D (Tech) SEPA, Karachi
Member - Member
T
é?//‘ 2
( Dr. o D. $Sajnani )
Executive Difector-1, SSWMB Karachi

Chairman




B'ﬁ Evaluation Report for Establishment of 06 Garbage Transfer Station

GTS)

with Material Recovery Facilities {MRF} and Refuse Drived Fuel (RDF) Unit in the

1. Name of Procuring Agency:
2. Tender Reference No:

3. Tender Description/Name of work/item:

4. Method of Procurement:

5. Tender Published:

D 00~ O

10. Bid(s) Rejected:

. Total Bid documents Sold:

. Total Bids Received:

. Technical Bid Opening date:

. No. of Bid technically qualified:

11. Financial Bid Opening date:
12. Bid Evaluation Report:

Procurement committee meeting dated 29.01.2016

Work-C.

Supply of Solid Waste Machinery.

ADP-2015-16.

Sindh Solid Waste Management Board.
SSWMB/NIT-18.

Establishment of 06 Garbage Transfer Stati
Material Recovery Facilities (MRF) and
Fue! (RDF) Unit in the ADP-2015-16.
Open Competitive Bidding (National) Sing|
Envelop Procedure.
SPPRA & SSWMB Website (SPPRA Seria
Daily Jung Karachi, Kawish Hyderabad and
on 28.10.2015 and 29.10.2015
Corrigendum in Daily Jung Karachi, Kawi
and Dawn Karachi on 12.11.2015 an
respectively.
03.

02.
30.11.2015
02.

NIL.
30.11.2015

on (GTS) with
Refuse Drived

g Stage — Two

| No. 25587),
Dawn Karachi

respectively,
sh Hyderabad
d 13.11.2015

Executive

{ Dy A. D. Sajnani )
irector-l, SSWMB Karachi
Chairman

BN 1 Rankingin | Comparison | Reasonsfor | |
S | Nameofrimar | Costoffersa | PO | Comperton | Rewsenslor
No Bidder by the Bidder pta.
cost cost rejection |
May be ‘
L M/SKZKGroup. | 147800000 FirstLowest | OpenRate | N/A | pocndered
M/S Crient Second
/ 1,830,000.00 " Open Rate N/A - do -
Energy System ~ Jlowest | "~ |
7y il e
( Dr. Abdul ¢gbbar Shaikh ) ( Abgh 1 'ié\e\!—(:hé‘lnna)
Secretary/ Member Procurement Committee-l & Sect‘ron iger SGA&CD
1l SSWMB Karachi Member :
\“("‘"\\ ~ :\\J
\( s
( Shamsuddin Katpar ) ( Abdul Rauf )
Deputy Director (Finance) SSWMB Karachi D (Tech) SEPA, Karachi
Member e Member
é/}/\ &




SSWRMS NIT:  18-a (1-6)

Method and precedure of Procurement:

Description of Work:

Name of Bidder:

Open Competitive Bidding {National Competitiv

e Bidding}

Single Stage —-One Envelope)

CONSTRUCTION OF 06 (SIX)] GARBAGE TRANSFER STATIONS

{Civil, Electrical, Water Supply, Sanitary and Allied Mechanical

Worls). At GULSHAN-e-IQBAL, KARACHI.

M/s ZAMIR AHMED & CO.

BIDDER’S ELIGIBILITY / QUALIFICATION REPORT.

Eligibility / Qualification Criteria:

(‘ T e o I Documents |
S.No. Eligibility / Qualification Criteria . Remarks
Available
1 Registration with PEC (C-3 or above having codes i YES f
CE10,BCO1,EEDS) License No: As per bidding document
] o |oDOeeS{C o
2 | NTN YES -do -
I | NTN# 1159219-2
3 Company Profile i L YES
Quallflcatlon Criteria
4 ﬁﬂl\/limmum 3/5 years’ experience of relevant field YES
5 Construction Equipmenf e B YES s
6 | Qualification and Experience of technical ﬁgrsonnel of key YES
L /svnte management e |
. z_ | Financial statement of last three years e o W;Y_ES o
_784 [ Information regarding litigation and abandoned wo works |fany. PROVIDED
9 Quaquled / Disqualified QUALIFIED

% ”‘V
Dr. Abdul %har Shaikh
Secretary / Member PréCurement Committee-1&ll
SSWMB Karachi

TN

( Shamsuddin Katpar)

Deputy Director (Finance) SSWMB Karachi D.D.(Tech) SEPA Kara
Member Member
/\ —
=Y * 9;
"A. D. Sajnani)

Executive Director-I, SSWMB Karachi
Chairman

( Abdiy] ifkezBhanna )
Sectio Officer SGA&CD’
Memper_..
k /// -
. ."\,\‘ N
‘\( N
TN

{ Abdul Rauf )

chi




SSWM’B NIT:

18-a (1-6)

Method and procedure of Procurement:

Description of Work:

Name of Bidder:

Open Competitive Bidding (National Competitive Bidding)

Single Stage —One Envelope)

CONSTRUCTION OF 06 (SIX]) GARBAGE TRANSFER STATIONS

(Civil, Electrical, Water Supply, Sanitary and Allied Mechanical

Works). At SAFOORA GOTH, KARACHI.

M/s AL-HUSSAIN| & COMPANY {Pvt.) LIMITED.

BIDDER’S ELIGIBILITY / QUALIFICATION REPQRT.

Eligibility / Qualification Criteria:

- P I N Documents |
S.No. Eligibility / Qualification Criteria . Remarks
Available |
1 Registration with PEC (C-3 or above having codes YES AS ver biddin
CE10,BCO1, EEOS) License No: 11422 | 1P &
document
- (C-IV) S
2 NTN YES -do -
. _ e | NTN#3553044-2 B
3 | Company Profile o i YES - | -do-
Qualification Criteria B ) 7 - -
4 Minimum 3/5 years’ experience of relevant field [ YES 1A per bidding
i I document |
5 Construction Equipment ] YES -do -
6 Qualification and Experience of technical personne! of YES ~do
L key site management I o
7 Financial statement of last three years o Yyes | | -do-
/ 8 Lln'r'ormatton regarding litigation and abandoned works if PROVIDED do
any. - - B
| 9 | Qualified / Disqualified QUALIFIED

ol

Dr. Abdul { bar Shaikh

Secretary / Member Procurement Committee-1&I!

SSWMB Karachi

( Shamsuddin Katpar)

Deputy Director (Finance) SSWMB Karachi

Member
R ’_’“‘/’T,.‘
CM’ - ?

( Dr/A. D. Sajnani )

Executive Director-I, SSWMB Karachi

Chairman

A \ é@\éz\\\@*ﬁh nla/)

Section Officér S@A&CD '

Mémber
. . )
roONEY

( Abdui Rauf)
D.D.(Tech) SEPA Kara
Member

chi




stm NIT:

18-a (1-6)

Method and procedure of Procurement:

Description of Work:

Name of Bidder:

Eligibility / Qualification Criteria:

Open Competitive Bidding (National Competitive Bidding)
Single Stage —One Envelope)

CONSTRUCTION OF 06 (SIX) GARBAGE TRANSFER STATIONS
{Civil, Electrical, Water Supply, Sanitary and Allied Mechanical
Works). At KORANGI CAUSEWAY, KARACHI.

M/s REHMAN CONSTRUCTION CO.

BIDDER'S ELIGIBILITY / QUALIFICATION REPORT.

ey ers et a e Documents —l
S.No. Eligibility / Qualification Criteria ) Remarks
Available
1 Registration with PEC (C-3 or above having codes YES ) -
CE10,8C01,EE05) License No: 01507 | A1 Per Pidding
document
) ,_ -~ A I
2 | NTN YES -do-
‘ e NTN# 1760586-5 o
3 Company Profile - YES | -do-
Qualification Criteria
4 Minimum 3/5 years’ experience of relevant field YES As per bidding
- o document
5 Construction Equipment YES -do-
6 Qualification and Experience of technical personnel of YES _do-
key site management 7 _ B
7 Financial statement of last three years _ YES ~do-
8 Information regarding litigation and abandoned works if
PROVIDED -do -
any.
9 Qualified / Disqualified e QUALIFIED

Dr. Abdul J
Secretary / Member Procurement Committee-1&|1

( Shamsuddin Katpar)
Deputy Director (Finance) SSWMB Karachi

" ol
L~ N e \ :
bar Shaikh { Abk(é&g\&h’anqa )

Section Officer SGAGCD
SSWMB Karachi - Member

S | N
{/'\\\\G«-\& | v NN

( Abdul Rauf)
D.D.(Tech) SEPA Karachi

Member Member

( Dy?A. D. Sajnani )
Executive Director-1, SSWMB Karachi
Chairman




Yy
SSWMB NIT: 18-a (1-6)

Method and procedure of Procurement:

Description of Work:

Name of Bidder:

BIDDER’S ELIGIBILITY / QUALIFICATION REPORT.

Open Competitive Bidding (National Competitive Bidding)

Single Stage -One Envelope)

CONSTRUCTION OF 06 (SIX} GARBAGE TRANSFER STATIONS
{Civil, Electrical, Water Supply, Sanitary and Alliled Mechanical
Works). At SAFOORA GOTH, KARACHI.

M/s GULZARI ASSOCIATE.

Eligibility / Qualification Criteria:

Pt cps s o Documents
S.No. Eligibility / Qualification Criteria . Remarks
Available
1 Registration with PEC (C-3 or above having codes YES -
Al bidd
CE10,BCO1,EED5) License No: 00047 per bidding
document
- (CB)
2 | NTN YES -do -

3 | Company Profile - "_i'__j__:;jﬁ_'%' do-

NTN# 0675110-7 )»

Qualification Criteria

any.

4 Minimum 3/5 years’ experience of relevant field ] YES As permdmé_
3 _|document |
5 Construction Equipment _ L YES -do -
6 Qualification and Experience of technical personnel of YES do-
key site management o o
7 Financial statement of last three years ] YES | -do- |
8 Information regarding litigation and abandoned works if PROVIDED do-

9 Qualified / Disqualified

QUALIFIED

Y
Dr. Abdu( %ar Shaikh
d

Secretary / Member Pro
SSWMB Karachi

( Shamsuddin Katpar)

Deputy Director (Finance) SSWMB Karachi

Member

e U
7

Executive Director-1, SSWMB Karachi

\6"*-”\\

rement Committee-1&ll

( Ab«x\j\:f&t hanha )

Section Ofﬁcer SGA&CE
I\/lember

%

\_4" ‘\)
( Abdul Rauf)
D.D.(Tech) SEPA Karachi

Member

. A. D. Sajnani )

Chairman




SSWMB NIT:

18-a {1-6)

Method and procedure of Procurement:

Description of Work:

Name of Bidder:

Open Competitive Bidding (National Competitive Bidding)

Single Stage —One Envelope)

CONSTRUCTION OF 06 (SIX} GARBAGE TRANSFER STATIONS

(Civil, Electrical, Water Supply, Sanitary and All

ed Mechanical

Works). At SOHRAB GOTH, KARACHI.

M/s GULZARI ASSOCIATE.

BIDDER'S ELIGIBILITY / QUALIFICATION REPORT.

Eligibility / Qualification Criteria:

T, pe —_— Documents
S.No. Eligibility / Qualification Criteria . Remarks
Available
1 Registration with PEC (C-3 or above having codes YES -
Ag per biddin
CE10,BCO1,EE05) License No: 00047 per bidding
document
, ) (c8) ‘
2 NTN YES -do -
NTN# 0679110-7 )
3 Company Profile o 3 - YES -do-
Qualification Criteria
4 Minimum 3/5 years’ experience of relevant field YES As per bidding
- _|document
5 Construction Equipment YES -do- |
6 Qualification and Experience of technical personnel of YES do -
key site management - B ] B
7 Financial statement of last three years B YES -do-
8 Information regarding litigation and abandoned works if PROVIDED - do -
oy
9 Qualified / Disqualified QUALIFIED

‘ /1"’7’}
ii, 7
(!" 19
Dr. Abdu Jq%bar Shaikh

Secretary / Member Procurement Committee-1&Il

SSWMB Karachi

RSN

R

( Shamsuddin Katpar) N\

\

Deputy Director (Finance) SSWMB Karachi

Member

~ T
o

( DYZA. D. Sajnani )

Executive Director-1, SSWMB Karachi

Chairman

(Ab&.\)gif“g \kb_am’la )
Section GA&CD

Member

L

P)‘\\\\N\ .

I

( Abdul Rauf )
D.D.(Tech) SEPA Kara
Member

chi




o
SSWMB NIT: 18-a (1-6)

Method and procedure of Procurement: Open Competitive Bidding (National Competitive Bidding)
Single Stage —One Envelope)

Description of Work: CONSTRUCTION OF 06 (SIX) GARBAGE TRANSFER STATIONS
(Civil, Electrical, Water Supply, Sanitary and Allied Mechanical
Works). At GULSHAN-e-IQBAL, KARACHI.

Name of Bidder: M/s GULZARI ASSOCIATE.

BIDDER’S ELIGIBILITY / QUALIFICATION REPORT.

Eligibility / Qualification Criteria:

. . . . Documents
S.No. Eligibility / Qualification Criteria . Remarks
Available
1 Registration with PEC (C-3 or above having codes . YES 2004 As per bidding
CE10,BCO1,EE05) License No: 00047 document
(CB)
2 | NTN YES -do -
_ NTN# 0679110-7 B
3 Company Profile YES -do-
Qualification Criteria
4 Minimum 3/5 years’ experience of relevant field YES Ag per bidding
document
Construction Equipment YES -do -
Qualification and Experience of technical personnel of YES q
- O -
key site management
Financial statement of last three years YES -do -
Information regarding litigation and abandoned works if
PROVIDED -do -
any.
9 Qualified / Disqualified QUALIFIED

7,
Dr. Abdul Jabbar Shaikh
Secretary / Member Procurement Committee-1&ll

SSWMB Karachi Membfer A
. A ‘ ’
‘ N ‘
\ N N
( Shamsuddin Katpar) ( Abdul Rauf )
Deputy Director {Finance) SSWMB Karachi D.D.(Tech) SEPA Karachi
Member /__- Member

[’%g
LA, D Sajnanl)

Executwe Director-1, SSWMB Karachi
Chairman
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SSWMB NIT: 18-a (1-6)

Method and procedure of Procurement: Open Competitive Bidding {National Competitive Bidding)
Single Stage —One Envelope}

Description of Work: CONSTRUCTION OF 06 (SIX) GARBAGE TRANSFER STATIONS
[Civil, Electrical, Water Supply, Sanitary and Allied Mechanical
Works). At SAFCORA GOTH, KARACHI.

Name of Bidder: M/s QAMARUDDIN & CO.

BIDDER’S ELIGIBILITY / QUALIFICATION REPORT.

Eligibility / Qualification Criteria:

- g e o Documents
S.No. Eligibility / Qualification Criteria X Remarks
Available
1 Registration with PEC (C-3 or above having codes YES -
A
CE10,8CO1,EEDS) License No: 00237 s per bidding
document
.. . &) ,
2 NTN YES -do -
- NTN# 1639763-7
3 Company Profile o YES ) -do - -
Qualification Criteria _
4 Minimum 3/5 years’ experience of relevant field List of only road As per bidding
o ~ Sector Projects document
5 Construction Equipment - I YES -do - .
6 Qualification and Experience of technical personnel of YES - do -
key site management o o ) R
7 Financial statement of last three years 7 YES -do- |
8 Information regarding litigation and abandoned works if PROVIDED do-
any. B 7 B B
9 Qualified / Disqualified ) QUALIFIED
; , .
il / N
L -
Dr. Abdul J b%’ Shaikh ( Abdul fam nna )
Secretary / Member Procutement Committee-1&ll Section i‘\r'c \ Ef[D
SSWMB Karachi Merhber ~
/\ RNV 7 "o
rul ' N
\ % SN
{ Shamsuddin Katpar) ( Abdul Rauf)
Deputy Director (Finance) SSWMB Karachi D.D.(Tech) SEPA Karachi
Member Member

{ DgA. D. Sajnani )
Executive Director-l, SSWMB Karachi
Chairman
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SSWMB NIT:

18-a (1-6}

Method and procedure of Procurement:

Description of Work:

Open Competitive Bidding {National Competitive Bidding)
Single Stage —One Envelope)

CONSTRUCTION OF 06 (SIX} GARBAGE TRANSFER STATIONS

(Civil, Electrical, Water Supply, Sanitary and Allied Mechanical
Works). At GULSHAN-e-IQBAL, KARACHI.
Name of Bidder: M/s KAMRAN & KAMPANY.
BIDDER'S ELIGIBILITY / QUALIFICATION REPORT.
Eligibility / Qualification Criteria:
- o as . Documents
S.No. Eligibility / Qualification Criteria . Remarks
Available
1 Registration with PEC (C-3 or above having codes YES .
. As|per biddin
CE10,BC01,EEQ5) License No: 00144 per iading
Hocument
J o (cB) i
2 NTN YES -do -
- - ~ NTN#0673691-2 )
3 Company Profile - YES -do- |
Qualification Criteria
4 Minimum 3/5 years’ experience of relevant field YES As per bidding
document
5 Construction Equipment YES -do -
Qualification and Experience of technical personnel of YES _do -
key site management _ B Y R R D
T 7 Financial statement of last three years YES | -do-
Information regarding litigation and abandoned works if PROVIDED “do -
any.
g Qualified / Disqualified QUALIFIED

Dr. Abdul Jafbar Shaikh

e
/Z//,/Z/

( Abdul\@b Mﬂ‘ﬂ P
Section Offi

Secretary / Member Procurement Committee-1&ll rSGARLCD
SSWMB Karachi Member -+~
\‘J\Gw/- e \n\ \J
3
{ Shamsuddin Katpar) \ { Abdul Rauf)
Deputy Director (Finance) SSWMB Karachi D.D.(Tech} SEPA Karachi

Member Member

( Dp/A. D. Sajnani )
Executive Director-1, SSWMB Karachi
Chairman
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SSWMB NIT:

18-a (1-6)

Method and procedure of Procurement:

Description of Work:

Name of Bidder:

Open Competitive Bidding {(National Competitive Bidding)

Single Stage —One Envelope)

CONSTRUCTION OF 06 (SIX) GARBAGE TRANSFER STATIONS

(Civil, Electrical, Water Supply, Sanitary and Allied Mechanical

Works). At KORANGI CAUSEWAY, KARACHI.

M/s KAMRAN & KAMPANY.

BIDDER’S ELIGIBILITY / QUALIFICATION REPORT.

Eligibility / Qualification Criteria:

s . . Documents
S.No. Eligibility / Qualification Criteria . Remarks
Available
1 Registration with PEC (C-3 or above having codes YES i
CE?O,BCOl,EEOS) | ¢ License No: 00144 | A Per bidding
document
_ B} (CB) ,
2 NTN YES -do -
N B NTN# 0673691-2
3 Company Profile ) YES -do - N
Qualification Criteria ] '
4 Minimum 3/5 years’ experience of relevant field YES Ag per bidding
- document
5 Construction Equipment ' _ YES -do -
6 Qualification and Experience of technical personnel of YES do-
key site management o L o -
7 Financial statement of last three years - B YES | -do-
3 Ian:\(/)-rmatlon regarding litigation and abandoned works if PROVIDED do-
9 Qualified / Disqualified QUALIFIED

///
Dr. Ahdul l;%ar Shaikh

Secretary / Member Procurement Committee-1&ll

SSWMB Karachi

f \\\(v): |

( Shamsuddin Katpar)

Deputy Director (Finance) SSWMB Karachi

Member

—

el

e

L
oy &
( Dr,A. D. Sajnani )

( Abdul Rauf )

%&g\s\\aﬂmf

Section Office? SGA&CD
Member . -

[N
>,
’.‘\} \N\)

D.(Tech) SEPA Karachi

Member

Executive Director-1, SSWMB Karachi

Chairman




works i.e ESTABLISHMENT OF 06 GARBAGE TRANSFER STATION (GTS)
MATERIAL RECOVERY FACILITIES (MRFJAND REFUSE DERIVED FUEL
UNIT. The Tender / work was divided into 3 Categories, A, B and C (details b

SUBJECT:-

COMPARATIVE STATEMENT

ESTABLISHMENT OF 06 GARBAGE TRANSFER STATION

(GTS) WITH MATERIAL RECOVERY FACILITIES (MRF)AND REFUSE
DERIVED FUEL (RDF) UNIT IN THE ADP - 2015-2016.

Sealed bids from interested contractors/ firms for carrying out the subject

WITH
(RDF)
elow).

The tenders were opened publically before Procurement Committee in
presence of bidders on 30t November 2015. The representative of Transparency
International attended the meeting as observer.

WORK-A.

Construction

of Garbage Transfer Station (Civil, Electrical, Water Supply Sanit

allied Mechanical Works (Single Stage- Two Envelope Procedure).

ary and

Work | Name of work Name of firm Quoted rates T Received Remarks
S.# 2% Bid
Security
A-1 Mewa Shah Near No any 0 0
Graveyard, District documents
West received from
contractors
A-2 Near Korangi Rehman 167,926,241.70 3,400,00 First
Causeway / Malir Construction Co Lowest
River
A-2 -do- Kamran & 264,249,013 5,300,000 | Second
Kampany Lowest
A-3 Sharafi Goth Near No any 0 q
Graveyard, Altaf documents
Hussain Road, received from
Landhi contractors
A-4 Sohrab Goth Near Gulzari 167,076,370 3,400,000 Single
| Lyari Express Way Associates Bid
A-5 Gulshan-e-Igbal Gulzari 164,575,163 3,400,000 First
Associates Lowest
A-5 -do- Zamir Ahmed & 167,325,239 3,400,000 Second
Co Lowest
A-5 -do- Kamran & 264,249,013 5,300,00( Third
Kampany Lowest
A-6 Safoora Goth Near Al- Hussaini & 144,882,568 1,500,004 First
Racecourse on Co 1,398,00¢ Lowest
University Road
A-6 -do- Gulzari | 167,076,370 | 3,400,00 Second
Associates Lowest
A-6 -do- Qammeruddin 171,954,222 64 3,450,000 Third
Shaikh Lowest

qf{ /Z CN/Q/ @%




WORK-B.
Manufacturing, Supply Installation
(Two Stage Bidding Procedure).

& Commissioning of Mechanical

Units

S.No NAME OF FIRM
They may be directed to provide detail technical proposals gnd financial
B- Technomen Kinetics proposals as required Rule 46{3) {b) Second Stage, Sindh Pyblic
Procurement Rules 2010 .
WORK-C.
Supply of Solid Waste Machinery (Single Stage- Two Envelope Procedure}.
C-1: Purchase of 07 Fork Lifters 01 (One) Ton Capacity
Vg_’o;k Name of Qty Name of Quoted Bid Amount | Received | Remarks
' work firm rates (Unit 2% Bid
Price) Security
C-1 | Supply of | 07 | KZK Group 1,478,000 | 10,346,000 | 400,000 First
Solid (in shape | | gwest
Waste of Bank
as - Guarantge)
Machinery
C-1 -do- 07 | Orient 1,830,000 12,810,000 | 265,500 Second
Energy Lowest
Systems {
C-2: Purchase of 07 Tractors with Front Loaders and Trollies
Vgogk Name of work | Qty | Name of | Quoted Bid Amount | Receivad Remarks
' firm | rates (Unit 2% Bid
Price) Security
C-2 | Supply of Solid | 07 No Bid N/A N/A N/A No BID
Waste
Machinery
In view of the above comparative statement / lowest quoted rates may be
discussed in next megting of Procurement Committee along with Bid Evaluatidn

and Contractor Eligi

(
Secretary/ V\Zm

ﬁ
ber Procurehrent Committee-|
WMB Karachi

‘-\
{Muh atneel ) - . Abdul Rauf }
Exe. Dir. / Dy. Director (Finance) SSWMB Karachi D.D (Tech) SEPA, Karachi
Member Member

{(Dy. A. D. Sajnani)
Executive Director-Ill, SSWMB Karachi
Chairman
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. @ .. Solid Waste Management
Board
ATTENDANCE SHEET
Bid Opening
Subject: “CONSTRUCTION OF 06 GTS WITH MRF AND RDF UNITS
KARACHI",
Reference: No.SSWMB/CD-1/NIT-18/PROC. /834 /2015 Dated 25.11.2015
Vi NUE Conference Room SSWMB. D-47, Block-2, Clifton, Karachi.
DATE: 30.11,2015
TIME: 03:30 PM
‘\ ) e N/ TTtTTYTTTT T T T
. i DESIGNATIO
‘ 5.No, NAME OF OFFICER CONTACT NO. / E-mail
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" SINDH SOLID WASTE MANAGEMENT BOARD, D-47, Block 2, Clifton, Karachi
Tel: 021 3586 3026 - 28; Fax; 021-3586 3029. Website: www.sswmb.gos.pk Emial: info@sswmb,.gos pk
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Subject:

Reference:

1C

VENUE:

W

Solid Waste Management

Board
ATTENDANCE SHEET
Bid Opening
“CONSTRUCTION OF 06 GTS WITH MRF AND RDF UNITS
KARACHI".
No.SSWMB/ED-I/NIT-18/PROC./834/2015 Dated 25.11.2015
Conference Room SSWMB. D-47, Block-2, Clifton, Karachi.
DATE:30.11.2015
TIME: 03:30|PM
wcor | EESCMNONT | wancoe et |l
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j Solid Waste Management
i Board

Minutes of Meeting of the Procurement Committee

SUBJECT:- ESTABLISHMENT OF 06 GARBAGE TRANSFER STATION (GT
MATERIAL RECOVERY FACILITIES (MRF) AND REFUSE
FUEL (RDF) UNIT IN THE ADP - 2015-2016

) WITH
DERIVED

With the approval of Competent Authority, the Sindh Solid Waste Management
Board (SSWMB) issued NIT (SSWMB NIT-18) for the job mentioned above. Sgaled Bids
were invited from interested contractors / firms for carrying out the subject work as a
part of Integrated Solid Waste Management Plan to Manage Municipal Solid Waste,
Medical Hazardous Waste and Industrial Hazardous Waste in an integrated and holistic
manner in Karachi and all other cities of the Province.

The NIT was published in the leading Newspapers through Information
Department, Government of Sindh, Karachi (Annexed at Flag “A"”) and uploaded on the
websites of SSWMB, SPPRA, Government of Sindh, Karachi:

1. Daily Jang Dated 28.10.2015.
2. Daily Kawish Dated 28.10.2015.
3. Daily Dawn Dated 29.10.2015,

The date was further extended through Corrigendum (SSWMB-NIT-18) published
in the leading Newspapers through Information Department, Government |of Sindh,
Karachi (Annexed at Flag “"B”) and websites of SSWMB, SPPRA, Government of Sindh,
Karachi as under:

1. Daily Jang Dated 12.11.2015.
2. Daily Dawn Dated 13.11.2015
3. Daily Kawish Dated 12.11.2015.

The tender floated was opened before the Procurement Committee-I, ESWMB in
the presence of bidders and their representative on 30.11.2015 (instead of 27.11.2015
which was declared a Public Holiday by the Government, 28 & 29 November 2015 were
Saturday and Sunday hence next working day was Monday 30" November 2015)
(Attendance Sheets of Members and Contractors is annexed at Flag “C”).

The Tender was divided into 03 broad categories:

Work A: Construction Work - Construction of Garbage Transfer Station
(Civil, Electrical, Water Supply Sanitary and allied Mechanigal Works
(Single Stage- Two Envelope Procedure)

Work B: Fabrication Work - Manufacturing, Supply Installation &
Commissioning of Mechanical Units
(Two-Stage Bidding Procedure)

Work €:  Supply of Machinery %’

SINDH SOLID WASTE MANAGEMENT BOARD, D-47, Block 2, Clifton, Karachi

e Nofé \
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f*@ﬂ Sindhb

W Solid Waste Management

A Board
The tender fee in shape of bank pay order/ bank draft amounting to Rs. 2000/-
each work received from above firms and the same has been deposited in SSWMB Bank

account.

Following Comparative Statement has been prepared:

Construction of Garbage Transfer Station (Civil, Electrical, Water Supply

WORK-A.

Sanitary and allied Mechanical Works
(Single Stage - Two Envelope Procedure)

Work | Name of work Name of firm | Quoted rates Received 2% RJemarks
S.# Bid Security |
A-1 | Mewa Shah No bid 0 0 -tender
Near recejved from
L Graveyard, any firms
District West
A-2 | Near Korangi Rehman 167,926,241.70 3,400,000
Causeway / Construction L west
Malir River Co
A-2 -do- Kamran & 264,249,013 5,300,000 jecond
Kampany } owest
A-3 | Sharafi Goth No bid 0 0 | Re-tender
Near documents
Graveyard, received from -
Altaf Hussain any firms
Road, Landhi
A-4 | Sohrab Goth Gulzari 167,076,370 3,400,000 | Single
Near Lyari Associates id*
Express Way
A-5 | Guishan-e- Gulzari 164,575,163 3,400,000 Trst
Igbal Associates ' owest |
A-5 -do- Zamir Ahmed 167,325,239 3,400,000 ﬁecond
& Co ) owest
A-5 -do- Kamran & 264,249,013 5,300,000 Ihird
Kampany ' owest
A-6 | Safoora Goth Al- Hussaini & 144,882,598 1,500,000 | First
Near Co 1,398,000 | Lowest
L Racecourse on
University Rd.
‘A-G -do- Gulzari 167,076,370 3,400,000 | Second
Associates : Lowest
A-6 -do- Qammeruddin | 171,954,222.64 3,450,000 | fThird J
Shaikh | owest

_,,?‘\7 e

SINDH SOLID WASTE MANAGEMENT BOARD, D-47, Block 2, Clifton, Karacl/ age 3 of 6
Tel: 021 3586 3026 - 28 Fax: 0¥1-3537 2985
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The committee evaluated RFP documents, all Bids received and the comparative
statement and recommends as under for submission to the competent authority for

consideraticn and approval:

WORK-A.

Construction of 06 (Six) Garbage Transfer Station (Civil, Electrical, Water
Supply Sanitary and allied Mechanical Works
(Single Stage - Two Envelope Procedure)

Bids have been received for GTS Mewa Shah and GTS Sharafi Goth. In view

It is noted the Bids have been received for 04 cut of 06 proposed Sites af GTS. No

of above,

following Lowest Quoted Bids for construction of 04 GTS sites as per comparative
statement is recommended for consideration for award of the work:

Work | Name of work Name of firm | Quoted rates Received 2% | Remarks i

S5.# Bid Security

A-2 | Near Korangi Rehman 167,926,241.70 3,400,000 | First
Causeway / Construction Lowest
Malir River Co l

A-4 | Sohrab Goth Gulzars 167,076,370 3,400,000 | Single
Near Lyari Associates Bid*
Express Way

A-5 | Gulshan-e- Guizari 164,575,163 3,400,000 | First
Igbal Associates Lpwest

A-6 | Safoora Goth Al- Hussaini & 144,882,598 1,500,000 | Fyrst
Near Co 1,398,000 | Lpwest

L Racecourse on
University Rd.

* The Single bid fulfills the comparative price criteria in terms of Rule

48 of the

Sindh Public Procurement Rules 2010, as the quoted rates are lower than one of
the three other lowest quoted bids.

For remaining following 02 sites i.e. GTS Meva Shah and GTS Sharafi

may be re-issued and Bids be re-invited.

WORK-B.
Manufacturing, Supply Installation & Commissioning of Mechanical Units

(Two Stage Bidding Procedure)

A

Goth, NIT

Only One bid from M/S Technomen Kinetics has been received for above work.
The committee recommends to ask the Bidder to submit detailed Technical and Financial
Proposal as required under Rule 46(3)(b) Second Stage of the Two Stage Bidding
Procedure of Sindh Public Procurement Rules 2010 (Amended 2013).

,/

%ﬁ‘;
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/‘/ K
N

.
N

,\\, \ \\\ SINDH SOLID
AN \

7

bu\-\‘\*\\l

il ".

Ly
i‘

WASTE MANAGEMENT BOARD, D-47, Block 2, Clifton, Kah!th)<\1\1gc 50?



- Solid Waste Management

Board
= ATTENDANCE SHEET
Meeting of the Procurement Committee
Subject: Meeting to discuss and evaluate also prepare recommendation on
Establishment of 06 Garbage Transfer Station {GTS) with| Meateriilf
Recavery Facilities (MRF) and Refuse Derived Fuel (RDF) Units” i
Karachi.
Reference: No . SSWMB/ED-I/NIT-18/Proc./89/2016 Dated 26.01.2016
VENUE: Conference Room SSWMB. D-47, Block-2, Clifton, Karachi,
DATE: 29.01.201¢6
TIME: 03:30 M
DESIGNATION /
S.No. NAME OF OFFICER CONTACT NO. INITEAL
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" SINDH SOLID WASTE MANAGEMENT BOARD, D47, Block 2, Clifton, Karach
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AUTIHORITY
GOVERNMENT OF SINDII

Newl_

The Assistant Director (Operation- 1),
Sindh Solid Waste Management Board,
Government of Sindh,

Karachi.

No. MGR(Asscssment)SPPRA /SSWMB-404/
SINDH PUBLIC PROCUREMENT REGUL

Karachi. dated the K\ March. 2010

2‘” :' ‘!()'-"i i

ATORY

SUBJECT: NIT REF_NO _ESTABLISHMENT OF 006(SIX) GARBAGHE

TRANSFER STATION (GTS)WITH MRF AND RDE _UNITS 1IN

KARACHL(SPPRA SR, NO.25587).

The undersigned is directed to refer to your Bid Evaluation

Lepo

received vide your letter No.SSWMB/AD(Ops-1)/NIT-18/231/2016, dated 09-(3-201-

and to observe that Technical Bids were opened on 30-11-2015 accordingly 90 day = b

validity period has been expired on 28-02-2016, where as Bid Lvaluation Report geeeiy e

on 11-03-2016.

2. In view of above, it is advised to furnish extension in bid validity period. b
may be hosted that 1t is the sole responsibility of Procuring Agency 1o ensure congpliance

of SPP Rules, 2010, (Amendcd 2013) in letter and spirit.

{ .
o) C \ ‘*\"?E&\»

+

Manager (Assessmant)

Copy forwarded for information:-
1. The P.S to Managing Director, SSWMB, Karachi.

2. The Staff Officer to M.D. SPPRA.
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No. MGR{Assessment)SPPRA /SSWMB-404/2015-16
SINDH PUBLIC PROCUREMENT REGULATORY
AUTHORITY
GOVERNMENT OF SINDH
Karachi, dated the March, 2016

The Assistant Director (Operation-1),
Sindh Solid Waste Management Board,
Government of Sindh,

Karachi.

SUBJECT: NIT __REF NO ESTABLISHMENT OF 06(SIX) GARBAGE
TRANSFER STATION (GTSYWITH MRF AND RDF UNITS IN
KARACHI.(SPPRA SR. NO.25587).

The undersigned is directed to refer to your Bid Evaluation| Report
received vide your letter No.SSWMB/AD(Ops-1)yNIT-18/231/2016, dated 09-03-2016
and to observe that Technical Bids were opened on 30-11-2015 accordingly 90 days bid
validity period has been expired on 28-02-2016, where as Bid Evaluation Report received

on 11-03-2016.

Turra Gy
2. In view of above, it is advised to[extension in bid validity period. It may
be hosted that it is the sole responsibility of Procuring Agency to ensure compliance of
SPP Rules, 2010, (Amended 2013) in letter and spirit.

—>

Copy forwarded for information:-

Manager (Assessment)

1. The P.S to Managing Director, SSWMB, Karachi.

2. The Staft Officer to M.D. SPPRA .
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g b Solid Waste Management
% Board

No.SSWMB/AD(Ops-1)/NIT-18/ 314 /2016

GOVERNMENT OF SINDH
Dated: 31 March, 2016

To,
~~  The Managing Director,

Sindh Public Procurement Regulatory Authority,
Government of Sindh,
Karachi.

Subject: UPLOADING OF FINAL EVALUATION DOCUMENT FOR ESTABLISHMENT OF 06 (SIX)
GARBAGE TRANSFER STATION (GTS) WITH MRF AND RDF UNITS IN KARACHL. $y . /Yy R S8/

| am directed to refer to this office letter No.SSWMB/AD(Ops-1)/NIT-18/2016/231 dated
09.03.2016 (along with Comparative Statement, Minutes Of The Meeting, Bid Evaluation Report
& Eligibility / Qualification Criteria Report).
2. In continuation of this letter enclose please find herewith |acceptance of
“Extension of Bid Validity” by the bidder, as required.

[

b

-
—)‘/ \ HA DB\’\‘:‘
( Muhnammad Irshad )
Assistant Director (Operations-|)
Copy for information to:
1. The Executive Directer (Operations-1), SSWMB.
2. The Deputy Director ( A & F ), SPPRA, Karachi.
3. P.S. te Managing Director, SSWMB.
4. Master File.

an.
Tel No. 021-35372981-84 Fax No. 021-35372985 URL : www.sswmb.gos.pk

Bungalow No. D‘47 Block 2 Chfton Karach1 S1ndh Pakls



GULZARYL ASSOCIATES

CONTRACTORS, ARCHITECTS & ENGINEERS /.. "o

of 21 AN

la, Oated: February 19, 201
EXECUTIVE DIRECTDR Ref: BA/AZ/SSWMB/LYL
(OPERATION-1), Karachi

sindh Solid Waste Management Board
Government of Sindh

— 4

AL/

Karachi

Subject; EXTENSIDON OF BID VALIDITY FOR ESTABLISHMENT OF 06 GARBAGE TRANSFER STATION {GTS) WITll
MATERIAL RECOVERY FACILITIES (MRF) AND REFUSE OERIVED FUEL (ROF) UNITS IN KARACHE ADI
WS206 [ /0@ 1< A0S ).

Qear Sir,

Please reler to your letter Nu. SSWMB/0D(Proc.)/NIT-1B/167/2018 dated 18.02. 206 on the subjected cited above.

We hereby accept extension of 90 (ninety) days in the bid validity te. upto 26.05.206 fer execution of|the cuntroit
mentigned above.

We understand that this exteasion in bid validity is being accepted as per Rule 38(3} of SPPRA Rutes 2010 (Anignded 2013

Yours grateful,

M/S GULZARI ASSOCIATES

e
o i
i -

AZEEI& Siofioul

Pruject Manager

HEAD OFFICE: KARACHI ADDRESS:

464, Street # 63, G-9/4, Islamabad, Heranand Khem Singh Kiian Road, Haeshiin
Ph: 051-2261708, 2281965 Baghecha Garden (Zoolofjical Garden) B
Fax: 051-2260472, Ph: 021-32730407,

E-mail: gulzariassociates@yahoa.com Fax: 021-32763021

E-mail: gulzariassociatesugiiail.. on




GUELZARE ASSOCIATIES &
CONTRACTORS, ARCHITECTS & ENGINEERS  \_ )= »

Io, Dated: February 19, 2015
EXECUTIVE DIRECTDR Wel: GA/AL/SSWMB/UOI/ 14/ 07 10
(DPERATION-1), Karaghi

Sindh Solid Waste Management Board
bovernment of Siadh

Karachi

Subiect: EXTENSION OF BID VALIDITY FOR ESTABLISHMENT DF (16 GARBAGE TRANSFER STATIUN (GTS) Wil
MATERIAL RECOVERY FACILITIES (MRF) AND REFUSE DERIVED FUEL (RDF) UNITS IN KARACHE alip?
w5200 ( prerk A~y

Dear Sir,

Please refer to your fetter No. SSWMB/0D0(Proc )/NIT-18/167/2016 dated 18.02 2016 vn the subjected cited abnvg

We hereby accept extension of 8] (ninety) days in the bid validity ie. upto 20002006 for exeeotion ol the vontion
mentinned abave.

We understand that this extension in bid validity is Geing accepted as per Rule SB(S) of SUPRA Bules 2008 (Anended 2005

Yours grateful,

M/S GULZARI ASSDCIATES

i
/Y
ez{ / // ‘
‘ f/ﬁ

AZEfM’SIQ[}[]UI

Profect Manager

/

KARACHI ADDRESS:
Heranand Khem Singh Khan Road, Heesinn.

Baghecha Garden (Zoolngical Gardeny B ¢
Ph: 021-32730407,
Fax: 021-32763021
E-mail: gulzariassociates@gniail.conm

HEAD OFFICE:

464, Street # 63, G-9/4, Islamabad,
Ph:051-2261708, 2281465

Fax: 051-2260472,

E-mail: gulzariassociates@yahoo.com




AN CONSTRUCTICN

b

Dafed: 19.02.200 1

The Executive Director (Operations-I) Karachi
Sindh Solid Waste Management Board
Government of Sindh

Karachi.

Subject: EXTENSION OF BID VALIDITY FOR ESTABLISHMENT Ol 0
GARBAGE TRANSFER STATION (GTS) WITH MATERIAL
RECOVERY FACILITIES {MRF) AND REFUSE DLRIVED Fuii,
(RDF) UNITS IN KARACHI ADP 2015-2016. (Fon Work A =)

Dear Sir,
Please refer to your letter No.SSWMB/DD(Proc)/NIT-18/167/ 111
dated 18.02.2016 on the subjected cited above.
We hereby accept extension of 90 (ninety) days in the bid validiny o
upto 26.05.2016 for execution of the contract mentioned above.
cented o

We understand that this extension in bid validity is being a

¢ 38(3) of SPPRA Rules 2010 (Amended 2013).

Gulistan-e-Johar, Karachi.

I Iqﬁu},l Gverseas | lgimg:,lm 5 G llli*aim £ Hmh A © Block No.t. 14, i arasbi,
Cell: 03245229034, 03202954732, 03060-3033595
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| {\‘H“C/786/16 BRI

The Deputy Director (Procurement) Karachi
Sindh Solid Waste Management Board
Government of Sindh

Karachi.

Subject: Extension of Bid Validity For Establishment of 06 Garbage Transfer Staucn
(GTS) With_Material Recovery Facilities (MRF) and Refuse Derived e
(RDF) Units In Karachi ADP 2015-2016. (for work A-6)

Dear Sir,

Please refer to your fletter No.SSWMB/DD(Proc)/NIT-18/167/20100 ot
18.02.2016 on the subjected cited above.

We hereby accept extension of 90 (ninety) days in the bid validity (e upte
26.05.2016 for execution of the contract mentioned above.

We understand that this extension in bid validity is being accepted ap per Rule
38(3) of SPPRA Rules 2010 (Amended 2013).

Yours grateful.

Gulshan e

Head Office: -3, 4th Floor, Amir Chamber Block-13-A, University Road, Gulshan-e-tgbal, Karaghi lifll: 021 --;g:‘ﬁa‘je;t;;’a, ;
Fax' 021-34680860, Ph: D21-34978281 Mob: 0321-2374426 Web: www.alhussanipvi.com Email: ahepyiltdidyalion o



Solid Woaate f\-i;m;u;mnunl

Flomrd

GOVERNMENT OF SINDII

Dated: 09" Marchl 2016

The Ranaping Dinector,
Sidb Pablic Procirement Repulatary Authorily,
Coovsermpnont of Sidiy,

Iaachi.

bt ESTABLISHVIENT OF 06 {SIX) GARBAGL TRANSFER STATION (GTS) WITH|VIRF AND

RDEUNDS IN KARACH]I.
Foam ditectad Lo ploase find endose the Tollowing documents with o request Lo upload

o bneat cvaliation doomments on SPPRA weheite,

~ S No. | Particular Remarls
| : ,
Pl Attachaod Oripgin Copy
P VAt ached Qricinal Cony ;
| - el " - = Tt i
_ : : : ‘
Lo b pealiation Repaort. Allached Originat Copy
' ? 1 [
Ao Feamparatiee Statemenl Altached Original Copy J
: e Y m‘*\_é’}‘
Y ™ it r‘a.\!\/} *
oA }

o Terndormatian oo ].‘-
. . . : . Pl
oo the Dxerntive Divector (Operations 1), SSWMB - { P .
S The Deputy Divector (AR T, SPRRAL Farachi ‘lr ‘
! .
Lol Sta Manacing Dioaclor, S5WHE,
oo Rdanter fife,
-y
Dinealow Noo A7, Block-2, Clifton. [Karacht, Sindhy, Palistan,
P R 001 anTOO8 L Py N 021008872000 TR - www.asswimb.gog. ph
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