
1. Name 

2. Tender 

3. Tender 

4. Method 

5. Tender 

6. Total 

7. Total 

8. Technical 

9. No. of 

10. Bid(s) 

11. Financial 

12. Bid 

of Procuring Agency: 

Reference No: 

Description/Name 

of Procurement: 

Published: Daily 

Bid Evaluation Report 

Kotri Barrage Division Jamshoro. Executive Engineer Irrigation 

TC/G-55/1780 dated:15-12-2017. 

of work/item: 

Single Stage 

REHABILITATION OF DRAINAGE SCHEME IN 
RIGHT BANK BARRAGE COLONY JAMSHORO. 

One Envelope 

Express (Urdu) Dated:30-I2-20I.& Daily Kawish (Sindhi) 
Dated:03-01-201 8. 

Print 

Bid documents 

Bids Received: 

& Electronic Media (SPPRA ID No. & News papers names with dates) 

Sold: 25 Nos. ._.- 

21 Nos. v 

Bid Opening date: (if applicable) 

Bid technically qualified (if applicable): 

Rejected: 

- (Provide details in separate form) 

- 

- 

Bid Opening 

Evaluation Report: 

date: 18-01-2018 

S No 
Name of 
Firm or 
Bidder 

Cost 
offered by 
the Bidder 

. 
Ranking 
in terms 
of cost 

Comparison 
i h 

Estimated 
cost 

Reasons for 
acceptance! 

rejection 
Remarks 

0 1 2 3 4 5 6 

I. 
M/S Yaseen 
& Company 

11134390  1 
Lowest 

14.922% 
Above 

Being lowest 
accepted 

Recommended 
for award of 

work 

2. 
M/S Bashir 
Ahmed 
Contractor 

11171590 
2nd 

Lowest 
15.306% 
Above 

Being Highest 
rejected 

Not 
recommended 

Hamlet 
Builders 

11270900 3' 
Lowest 

16.331% 
Above 

BeingHighest 
rejected 

Not 
recommended 

4.  
Ghulam 
Murtaza 
Enterprises 

11381200 
4th 

Lowest 
17.469% 
Above 

Being Highest 
rejected 

Not 
recommended 

5.  

Engr. 
Muhammad 
Akram 
Shaikh Ovt) 
Ltd. 

11478300 
5th 

Lowest 
18.472% 
Above 

Being Highest 
rejected 

Not 
recommended 

6.  

M/S Al-
Hussain & 
Al-Haseeb 
Enterprises 

11565850 
6th 

Lowest 
19.375% 
Above 

Being Highest 
rejected 

Not 
recommended 

F.B 
Enterprises 

11682200 
7th 20.576% Being Highest 

rejected 
Not 

recommended 

8. 

Agha Shoaib 
& Brothers 
Construction  
Company 

11800050  

Low

1,,

,/ Above 

L Above 

(

21.793% Being Highest 
rejected 

Not 
recommended 
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9.  
Meesam 
Construction 
Company 

11828650 
Lowest 

22.088% 
Above 

Being Highest 
rejected 

Not 
recommended 

10.  M.M 
Contractors 

11909500 
10th 

Lowest 
22.922% 
Above 

Being Highest 
rejected 

Not 
recommended 

11.  
MIS Dilawar 
Khan& 
Brothers 

11954900 Lowest 
23.391% 
Above 

Being Highest 
rejected 

Not 
reconi mended 

12.  Fayyaz 
Traders 

12027300 
12t11 

Lowest 
24.138% 
Above 

Being Highest 
rejected 

Not 
recommended 

13.  M/S Safdar 
Ali&Co. 

12112100 
13th 

Lowest 
25.013% 
Above 

Being Highest 
rejected 

Not 
recommended 

14.  

J&N 
Construction 
& 
Development 
Company 

12226750 
14th 

Lowest 
26. 197% 
Above 

Being Highest 
rejected 

Not 
recommended 

15.  Super Con 
Enterprises 12316250 

15th 

Lowest 
27.120% 
Above 

Being Highest 
rejected 

Not 
recommended 

16.  Au 
Enterprises 12395250 

16th 

Lowest 
27.936% 
Above 

Being Highest 
rejected 

Not 
recommended 

17.  
Muhammad 
Punhal 
Lashari 

12452450 
17th 

Lowest 
28. 526% 
Above 

Being Highest 
rejected 

Not 
recommended 

18.  M/S Saad 
Enterprises 

12541750 
18th 

Lowest 
29.448% 
Above 

Being Highest 
rejected 

Not 
recommended 

19.  Abdul Manan 
Chandio 

12631550 
19th 

Lowest 
30.375% 
Above 

Being Highest 
rejected 

Not 
recommended 

20.  Rabbi 
Traders 12702750 

20th 

Lowest 
31.110% 
Above 

Being Highest 
rejected 

Not 
recommended 

21.  

Rays 
Industrial 
Inspection 
Services 
(Pvt.) Ltd. 

12846250 2Pt  
Lowest 

32.59 1% 
Above 

Being Highest 
rejected 

Not 
recommended 

JJIMEM MEMON 
CHAIRMAN I EXECUTIVE ENGINEER 

KOTRI BARRAGE DIVISION 
JAMSHORO 

p 



NIT No.TCIG-55/ 1780 dated: 15-12-2017. 

Method and Procedure of Procurement:- Open Competitive Bidding (National / International 
Competitive Bidding) (Single Stage One Envelope). 

Name of Work: REHABILITATION OF DRAINAGE SCHEME IN RIGHT 
BANK BARRAGE COLONY JAMSHORO 

MINUTES OF BiD OPENING MEETING 

A meeting of the Procurement Committee of this division was held on 18-01-2018 
for opening the bids received in respect of above said work NIT till the deadlines of submission. 
The meeting was attended by all members of the Procurement Committee and the representative of 
bidders (Attendance sheet is enclosed). 

The following 21 Nos. bidders submitted their bids till the deadline of submission 
out of 25 Nos. 

I. M/S Yaseen & Company 
2. M/S Bashir Ahmed Contractor 
3. Hamlet Builders 
4. Ghulam Murtaza Enterprises 
5. Engr. Muhammad Akram Shaikh ()vt) Ltd. 
6. M/S Al-Hussain & Al-Haseeb Enterprises 
7. F.B Enterprises 
8. Agha Shoaib & Brothers Construction Company 
9. Meesam Construction Company 
10. M.M Contractors 
11. MIS Dilawar Khan & Brothers 
12. FayyazTraders 
13. M/S Safdar All & Co. 
14. J&N Construction & Development Company 
15. Super Con Enterprises 
16. All Enterprises 
17. Muhammad Punhal Lashari 
18. M/S Saad Enterprises 
19. Abdul Manan Chandio 
20. Rabbi Traders 
21. Rays Industrial Inspection Services (Pvt.) Ltd. 

The Bids were opened at 02.00 PM on 18-01-2018 in the presence of above 
mentioned participants and the rates quoted by bidders were read aloud and encircled by Chairman 
of the Procurement Committee. 

S.No. Name of Bidder Offered Price 
in Rs. 

Amount of Bid 
Security in Rs. 

Pay Order NoJ 
Date 

I. 
MIS Yaseen & Company 

Rs:11.134,390/- Rs:600,000/- 11915831 
Dated:17-01-2018 

2.  
M/S Bashir Ahmed Contractor 

Rs:11.171,590/- Rs:600,000/- 100127 
Dated:16-01-2018 

3.  
1-lamlet E3u ilders Rs: 11,270,900/- Rs:484,430/- 

11532659 
Dated: 17-01-2018 

4.  
Ghulam Murtaza Enterprises 

Rs:11,381,200/- Rs:485,000/- 0046219 
Dated: 18-01-2018 

5.  Engr. Muhammad Akram 
Shaikh (Pvt) Ltd. 

Rs:1 1,478,300/- Rs:490,000/- 1705 
Dated:17-01-2018 

6.  M/S Al-Hussain & Al-Haseeb 
Enterprises 

Rs:1 1.565.850/- Rs:490,000/- 06399047 
Dated: 17-01-2018 

7.  
F.B Enterprises Rs: 11,682,200/- 

-- 
No bid security 
was attached 



S.No. Name of Bidder Offered Price 
in Rs. 

Amount of Bid 
Security in Rs. 

Pay Order No.! 
Date 

8.  Agha Shoaib & Brothers 
Construction Company Rs:1 1,800,050/- -- No bid security 

was attached 
9.  Meesam Construction 

Company Rs:1 1,828,650/- -- No bid security 
was attached 

10.  
M.M Contractors Rs:11,909,500I- Rs:484,5001- 100912 

Dated:17-01-2018 
Ii. 

MIS Dilawar Khan & Brothers Rs:1 1,954,900/- Rs:500,000/- 19671239 
Dated: 17-01-2018 

12.  Fayyaz Traders Rs: 12,027,300/- -- No bid security 
was attached 

13.  MIS Safdar Au & Co. Rs:12,112,100/- Rs:335,000/- BC 02445332 
Dated:18-01-2018 

14.  
J&N Construction & 
Development Company 

Rs: 12,226,750/- Rs:476,000/- 11598267 
Dated:18-01-2018 

15.  Super Con Enterprises Rs: 12,316,250/- Rs:434,599/- 14040562 
Dated:18-01-2018 

16.  Ali Enterprises Rs:12,395,250/- Rs:484,430/- lB 00260266 
Dated: 18-01-2018 

17.  Muhammad Punhal Lashari Rs: 12,452,450/- Rs:484,500/- 06354653 
Dated:17-01-2018 

18.  MIS Saad Enterprises Rs: 12,541,750/- Rs:495,000/- 00465395 
Dated:18-01-2018 

19.  Abdul Manan Chandio Rs:12,631,550/- Rs:485,000/- 
BC 02422862 
Dated:18-01-2018 

20.  Rabbi Traders Rs:12,702,750/- Rs:485,000/- 19657713 
Dated:18-01-2018 

21.  
Rays Industrial Inspection 
Services (Pvt.) Ltd. 

Rs: 12,846,250/- Rs:484,430/- 555150 
Dated: 16-01-2018 

The Committee shall examine all the bids as per the Qualification / Eligibility 
criteria provided in the bidding documents, arithmetical check and verif' the documents and bid 
security submitted by the bidders. 

The meeting ended with the note of thanks to and from the chair. 

AL RAER 
MEMBER / DIV1S1Ot.AL A'CCOUNTS OFFICER 

KOTRI BARRAGED1VKSION JAMSHORO 

SYEDAHMEDI HAH 
MEMBER / EXECUTIVE NGINEER 

EDUCATION WORKS IVISION 
JAMSHOR 

JAV EM MEMON 
CHA / EXECUTIVE ENGINEER 

KITRI BARRAGE DIVISION 
JAMSHORO 



JAVED - EMON 
CHAIRM; 'I CUTIVE ENGINEER 

BARRAGE DIVISION 
JAMSHORO 
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NIT No.TC/G-55/1780 dated:15-I2-2017. 

Method and Procedure of Procurement:- Open Competitive Bidding (National I International Competitive Bidding) (Single Stage One Envelope). 

Name of Work: REHABILITATION OF DRAINAGE SCHEME IN RIGHT BANK BARRAGE COLONY JAMSHORO. 

Name of Procuring Agency: Executive Engineer Kotri Barrage Division Jamshoro. I.  

BIDDERS ELIGIBILITY / OUALIFICATION REPORT 

S.No. Eligibility! Qualiflcadon Criteria 8 
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I Registration with PEC 
Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes 

2 NTh 
Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes No Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes No Yes 

3 Professional Tax 
Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes No Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes No Yes 

4 Registration with Sindh Revenue Board 
(S RB) Yes Yes No Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes No Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes No Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes 

Qualification Criteria 

5 Company Profile Yes No No No No No No No No No No No No Yes Yes No No Yes No No Yes 

6 Listoflast3yeaissimilartypeofwork 
by the firmsf contractors. Yes No No No No No No No No No No No No No No No No No No No No 

7 Detail of Equipment's, Machineries and 
Transport owned by the firms! contractors Yes No No No No No No No No No No No No No No No No No No No No 

8 Financial Statement showing the Annual 
Turnover of last 3 years and Income Tax 
last 3yeais 

Yes No No No No No No No No No No No No No No No No No No No No 

9 Allidavit of No Litigation with Irrigation 
Deparlinent Yes No No No No No No No No No No No No Yes Yes No No No No No No 

10 
S\\Yes 

 Responsiveness 
No No No No No No 

t 
(lo No No No No No No No No No No No No No 



ATTENDANCE SHEET OF PARTICIPANTS CONTRACTOR! AGENCY 

WHO ATTENDED FOR OPENING OF NIT AGAINST NIT NO.TC/G-55/1780 
DATED:15-12-2017 

OPENED ON 18-01-2018  

REHABILITATION OF DRAINAGE SCHEME RBB COLONY, JAMSHORO 

S.No. Name Of Contractor! Agency Attended By Signature 

1.  
M/S Bashir Ahmed 
Contractor L2OZ 4L i..j, 

2.  
A.0 Engineering & 
Construction (Pvt.) Ltd. 
J&N Construction & 
Development Company a 

4.  Super Con Enterprises d 1  
5.  M/S Saad Enterprises T1 

6.  
MIS Ghulam Sarwar 
Panhiyar 

• 
Rays Industrial Inspection 
Seices (P:) Ltd. / - 

8.  M/S Yaseen & Company - 

9.  M.M Contractors '$C'&2d\ 

10 • 
Engr. Muhammad Akram 
Shaikh (Pvt) Ltd 

11.  Au Enterprises 4+d 
12.  Muhammad Punhal Lashari J1 jt?'t1•i 

f21e 13.  Ghulam Murtaza Enterprises tt-4'- iV)iY4 

14.  
M/S Al-Hussain & Au Haseeb 
Enterprises 

15.  Abdul Manan CHandio 

16.  Hamlet Builders ,/.1 2fA 
17.  

MIS Dilawar Khan & 
Brothers 9 - L-Y" 

18.  Fayyaz Traders 
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S.No. Name Of Contractor! Agency Attended By Signature 

19.  ML.S Khurasan Enterprises 

20.  M/S Safdar Au & Co S Ac _ t \\l*z  

21.  M/S Zainulabadin Bughio — 

22.  Rabbi Traders 
(A2 

23.  F.B Enterprises 
. 

24 
Agha Shoaib & Brothers 
Construction Co. t'i 

25. Meesam Construction 
Company 

0 

JAVED 
CHAIRM 

KO  

A/ EM MEMON 
•" ECUTIVE ENGINEER 

ARRAGE DIVISION 
JAMSHORO 



No.TC/G-55/ c97 of 2018 
Office of the 
Executive Engineer 
Kotri Barrage Division 
Jamshoro. Dated: -. 

To, 

The Director, 
Sindh Public Procurement Regulatory Authority, 
Karachi. 

SUBJECT: NOTICE INVITING TENDERS FOR PROCUREMENT OF ADP 
SCHEME "REHABILITATION OF. DRAINAGE SCHEME RBB 
COLONY, JAMSHORO" (NO.TC/G-55/1780 DATED: 15-12-2017).  

Kindly find enclosed herewith a Notice Inviting Bids for procurement of 

ADP Scheme vide No.TC/G-55/1780 dated: 15-12-20 17 alongwith following documents 

are submitted herewith for favour ó 

website. 

ation and posting the same on SPPRA 
PROCu 

1. Bidding Documents along with soft c 

2. Procurement Plan. 

3. Notification Procurement Committee. 

4. Notification Redressal Committee. 

This is for favour of your information. 

D.A/ As above. 
4"AVED AKEEM MEMON) 

EXECUTIVE ENGNEER 
KOTRI BARRAGE DIVISION 

<2 JAMSHORO 

O.vtCvr( tic, NIT ADP 21117.18 lull NITu) dcc 



Phone No.9210334. No..S-151/W-4 /Cornrnitt:/KBD/2017 /2..1 3 
Office of the Chief Engineer, 
Irrigation Kotri Barrage, 
Hyderabad, dated20 _I2017. 

READ:- Secretary to Government of Sindh, Irrigation Department 
letter No.SO(R&S)8-110/2012-13, dated 14-12-2015, 
regarding Authorization of Notify the Procurement 
Committee. 

NOTIFICATION.  

The Committee Comprising of the following members is 

constituted, as per Rules-07 of SPPR.A Rules 2010, for procuring 

the ADP Schemes, for the, year 2017-2018, in Kotri Barrage 

Division, Jamshoro of Baghar Circle, Hyderabad, as per Rules 2010 

(amended 2013) 

1. Mr. Javed Hakeem Memon, 
Executive Engineer, 
Kotri Barrage bivision, 
Jamshoro.  

2. Mr. Syed Ahmed AU Shah, 
Executive Engineer, 
Education Works Division, 
JamshOro.  

3. Mr. Au Rabber, 
Divisional Accounts Officer, 
Kotri. Barrage Division, 
Jamhoro.  

Chairman. 

Member. 

ABDUL •'IR 'tLIJO 
CH F ENGINEER, 

IRRIG ION KOTRI BARRAGE, 
HYDERABAD.  

C.c.to:- 

1. The Secretary to Government of Sindh, Irrigation 
Department, Karachi. 

2. The Managing Director, SPPRA, Karachi. 
3. The Superintending Engineer, Baghar Circle, Hyderabad, 

with reference to his letter No.TC/G-55/1519, dated 19-
12-2017. 

4. The All Committee Members. 



- PhO!-.E? Nc. •''i). :s15/w_4/sppRA/o' 
ffice of the Chief Eno:reer, 
!:igation Kotri barrage, 
-verabad, oated/  ç - 

Tn- Superintendirig Engineer, 
L.. ;er Sindh Drainage C:rcie, 
Hyde rabad.  

The Superintending Engineer, 
Pinyari Circle, 
Hyderabad.  

The Superintending Engineer, 
Baahar Circle, 
Hyde rabad.  

The Director, 
Hydrology & Research in Sindh, 
Hyderabad.  

SUBJECT:- COMPLAINT REDRESSAL COMMITTEE FOR M&R / ADP WORKS OF KOTRI  
BARPAGE REGION HYDERABAD. 

I am directed to enclose herewith a copy Oi letter 

No.SO(R&S)/O-ll0/2017-18 Pt-IX/1939, dated 05-09-20F7, as received 

from Secretary, Irrigation Department, Government of Siridh Karachi, 

aloncwith a copy of Notification No.SO(R&S)8-ll0/2012-li, dated. 09-

10-2015, The Compliant Redressal Committee for Kotri Barrage Region 

is same which is notified vide Notification No. cited above. 

This is for favour of your kind information. 

D.A/As above.  

C. c. to: - 

DE ENGIER 
-' FOR CHIEF ENG 1EEP, 

IRRIGATION KOTRI .ARRAGE, 
HYDERABAD. 

The Section Officer (RR&S), Irrigation Deoartment, 
Government of Sindh, Karachi, with reference to his letter 
No. quoted above, for information. 

The Managing Director, Sindh Public Procurement Regulatory 
Authority, Karachi. 



V NOSO(R&S)/8-1102r17-18 Pt-IX / 

GOVERNMENT OF SINDH ' 

IRRIGATION DEPARTMENT 

Karachi dated the S Sept 2017 

To. 

The Chief Engineer, 
Irrigation Kotri Barrage Region, 
HYDE RABAD  

Subject: REQUEST TO CONSTITUTE OF COMPLAINT REDRESSAL 
- COMMITTEE FOR M&R I ADP WORK IN LOWER SINDH DRAINAGE 

CIRCLE HYDERABAD. 

I am directed to refer to your letter No.S-1511W-4/R-D-

Committee/LSDC/2017/1817 dated 03.08.2017 on the subject noted above and to 

enclose the copy of Notification No.SO(R&S)8-110/2012-13 dated 09.10.2015, as the 

requested Complaint Redressal Committee already exists. 

2, 
7/ 

Copy to:- 

1:j L'/ 
t
_____,, :_ 

SECTION OFFICER (RR&S) 
FOR SECRETARY TO GOVT OF SINDH 

P.S. to Secretary, Irrigation Department, Govt of Sindh, Karachi. 
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N 0 TI F IC AT ION  

No.SO(R&S)8-110/2012-13 With the approval olcompeteni authority, a ComQIain Redres  
Committee is hereby consttutd in terms of Rule 31(1 0' SinIti public Procurement Rule 20O 
'Amended 2013) regarding ADP schemes 2015-16 of Irrigation Department, Government f 
Sindh pertaining to Kotri Barrage Region Hyderabad with the foJIowng composition:- 

Director General 
Monitoring & Evaluation Cell 
Irrigation Deparlment, Government of S;ndh 

Charm an 

2 Chief Engineer. 
Gudu Barrage Region Sukkur 

Superintending Engineer, 
Began Sindh Feeder Circle. Sukkur 

Member 

Member 

4.  Executive Engineer 
(Concerned Division) Irrigation Department 

Secretary 

5.  District Accountant Officer Sindh 
(Concerned Dvision 

Assistant 
Secretary 

T.O.R's of the Committee are as provided under Rule 31 of Sindh Public Procurement 
Rule 2010 and also perform any other function ancillary and incidental to the above. 

SYED ZAHEER HYDER SHAH .4 

SECRETARY TO GOVT OF SINDH 

No.SO(R&S)8-110/2012-13 Karachi, dated the 9th  October, 2015. 
A copy is forwarded for information & necessary action to:- 

1. The Accountant General Sindh, Karachi with the request to nominate your 
representative for the above Complaint Redressal Committee. 

2. The Director General. Monitoring & Evaluation Cell, Irrigation Department, 
Government of Sindh. Karachi. 

3. The M D. Sindh Public Procuremerkt Regulatory Authority Karachi 
4. The Chief Engineer, (All) Irrigation Development, Govt of Sindh. 
5. The Superintending Engineer, (All) Irrigation Depit, Govt. of Sindh. 
6. The Executive Engineer, (All), Irrigation Department. Govt of Sindh. 
7. P.S. to Secretary Irrigation Department, Govt. of Sindh, Karachi. 

0 /I C 

SECTION OFFICER (RR&S.) 
For Secretary to Government of Sindh 
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