

H. E. J. RESEARCH INSTITUTE OF CHEMISTRY INTERNATIONAL CENTER FOR CHEMICAL & BIOLOGICAL SCIENCES

University of Karachi, Karachi-75270, Pakistan



UAN:

111-222-292

Telefax:

(92-21)-34819018, 34819019 (92-21) 99261713, 99261714

Tel. Off:

(92-21) 34824924, 34824925

E.mail: Web: hej@cyber.net.pk www.iccs.edu

Ref. RIC/

Date:

ICCBS/HEJ/CTP(SGP)-070217(3)/8318/328

Sindh Public Procurement Regulatory Authority,

May 22nd, 2017

Government of Sindh,
Block – 8, Sindh Secretariat No. 4-A,
Court Road,
Karachi.
Tel + 021-99205356

Dear Sir

Please find enclosed herewith the Original Signed Copy of the Bid Evaluation Report of our Tender Notice No. ICCBS-HEJ-CTP(SGP)-070217 (3rd Time), having SPPRA / S. No. 31288 for hosting on your website.

With kind regards,

Yours truly,

PURCHASE OFFICER

Attachment(s)

- 1. Bid Evaluation Report (Duly Signed-Original)
- 2. Comparative Statement (Original)
- 3. Minutes of Technical Committee
- 4. Attendance Sheet
- 5. Bidder's Qualification Report
- 6. Tender Opening Minutes

Bid Evaluation Report

1. Name of Procuring Agency: INTERNAT	IONAL CENTER FOR CHEMICAL AND BIO	LOGICAL SCIENCES, U.O.K
2. Tender Reference No:ICCBS-HEJ-CT	P(SGP)-070217 (3 rd Time)	
3. Tender Description/Name of work/item	:PURCHASE OF EQUIPMENTS AND	CHEMICALS
4. Method of Procurement:SINGLE STAGE	GE – (ONE ENVELOPE)	
5. Tender Published: SPPRA S. No. 31288		
Print & Electronic M.	Media (SPPRA ID No. & News papers	s names with dates)
6. Total Bid documents Sold: NINE (09)	Nos.	
7. Total Bids Received: NINE (09) Nos.		
8. Technical Bid Opening date: (if applica	ble)(Provide de	etails in separate form)
9. No. of Bid technically qualified (if appl	icable):	
10. Bid(s) Rejected:		
11. Financial Bid Opening date:FEBRU	JARY 07 th , 2017	
PURCHA	SE COMMITTEE ICCBS INSTITUTIONS	
	5-2	
PROF. DR. M. SHAIQ ALI	DR. FARZANA SHAHEEN	DR. HAFIZUR REHMAN
Chairman (I.C.C.B.S)	Associate Professor (I.C.C.B.S)	Assistant Professor (I.C.C.B.S)
\wedge	Internal Member	
(1)		
¥	D 6	2
SYED IELIANZED	XX.	<u> </u>
SYED JEHANZEB Manager (Finance)	-	SAD rement & Customer Support
I.B.A, Karachi	I.B.A Ka	

12. Bid Evaluation Report:

S No	Name of Firm or Bidder	Cost offered by the Bidder	Ranking in terms of cost	Comparison with Estimated cost	Reasons for acceptance/rejection	Remarks
0	1	2	3	4	5	6
1.	M/s. Al Raza Printers	596,700.00	1 st Lowest in 08 items	Lowest and according to specification	According to Tender Specification	Recommended for Placement of Order of 08 items
2.	M/s. The Worldwide Scientific	929,000.00	1 st Lowest in 03 items	Lowest and according to specification	According to Tender Specification	Recommended for Placement of Order of 03 Items
3.	M/s. Lucky Lab International	171,450.00	1 st Lowest in 02items	Lowest and according to specification	According to Tender Specification	Recommended for Placement of Order of 02 Items
4.	M/s. Musaji Adam & Sons	787,675.00	1 st Lowest in 05 items	Lowest and according to specification	According to Tender Specification	Recommended for Placement of Order of 05 Items

PURCHASE COMMITTEE ICCBS INSTITUTIONS

PROF. DR. M. SHAIQ ALI

Chairman (I.C.C.B.S)

DR. FARZANA SHAHEEN

Associate Professor (I.C.C.B.S)

DR. HAFIZUR REHMAN

Assistant Professor (I.C.C.B.S)

Internal Member

Manager (Finance)

I.B.A, Karachi

Sr. Manager Procurement & Customer Support

I.B.A Karachi

12. Bid Evaluation Report:

S No	Name of Firm or Bidder	Cost offered by the Bidder	Ranking in terms of cost	Comparison with Estimated cost	Reasons for acceptance/ rejection	Remarks
0	1	2	3	4	5	6
5.	M/s. Scientific Technical Corp.	Not awarded any item	Not Lowest in any item	Not Lowest	Not according to Tender Specification	Not Recommended
6.	M/s. Mughal Traders	Not awarded any item	Not Lowest in any item	Not Lowest	Not according to Tender Specification	Not Recommended
7.	M/s. Muslim Trading Agency	Not awarded any item	Not Lowest in any item	Not Lowest	Not according to Tender Specification	Not Recommended
8.	M/s. Bio Sciences Intl.	Not awarded any item	Not Lowest in any item	Not Lowest	Not according to Tender Specification	Not Recommended
9.	M/s. Hoora Pharma	Not awarded any item	Not Lowest in any item	Not Lowest	Not according to Tender Specification	Not Recommended

PURCHASE COMMITTEE ICCBS INSTITUTIONS

PROF. DR. M. SHAIQ ALI

Chairman (I.C.C.B.S)

DR. FARZANA SHAHEEN

Associate Professor (I.C.C.B.S)

DR. HAFIZUR REHMAN

Assistant Professor (I.C.C.B.S)

Internal Member

SYED JEHANZEB

Manager (Finance)

I.B.A, Karachi

Sr. Manager Procurement & Customer Support

I.B.A Karachi

TECHNICAL COMMITTEE MINUTES OF TENDER NO ICCBS-HEJ-CTP(SGP)-070217 FOR PURCHASE OF EQUIPMENT AND CHEMICALS

Technical committee meeting for Re-Tender No: ICCBS-HEJ-CTP (SGP)-070217 (3rd time) was held on 17-02-2017. Following recommendations were made:

Item 1 Normal Saline

2 bids were received by M/S The Worldwide Scientific and M/S Al-Raza Printers.

After eareful evaluation, committee has recommended that the tender may be awarded to M/S Al-Raza Printers at unit price Rs 9,000 for 10 lit. (inclusive of taxes). Cat# is PBP01 (Caisson, USA), as they are the lowest among the bidders and quoted item as per our specification.

Item 2 HEPES (H3375)

2 bids were received by M/S The Worldwide Scientific and M/S Al-Raza Printers.

After eareful evaluation, committee has recommended that the tender may be awarded to M/S Al-Raza Printers at unit price Rs 35,000 for 1 kg (70,000 for 2 kg) (inclusive of taxes). Cat# is BI8181 (Apollo Scientific), as they are the lowest among the bidders and quoted item as per our specification.

Item 3 Sheep Blood (BD-21195)

No bid was received thus committee has recommended retendering the item.

Item 4 Neubauer chamber (BR717810-1EA)

Only 1 bid was received by M/S The Worldwide Scientific. After eareful evaluation, the Committee has recommended retendering the item as it is not quoted as per our specification.

ON THE RECOMMENDATION OF TECHNICAL COMMITTEE

PURCHASE COMMITTEE ICCBS INSTITUTIONS

PROF. DR. M. SHAIQ ALI Chairman (I.C.C.B.S)

SYED JEHANZEB Manager (Finance) I.B.A, Karachi DR. FARZANA SHAHEEN
Associate Professor (I.C.C.B.S)
Internal Member

DR. HAFIZUR REHMAN
Assistant Professor (I.C.C.B.S)

ASJAD ASAD

Sr. Manager Procurement & Customer Support I.B.A Karachi

Item 5 RPMI media

Only 1 bid was received by M/S The Worldwide Scientific. After careful evaluation, the Committee has recommended to awarded the tender to M/S The Worldwide Scientific at unit price Rs 5,800 for 1 lit. (for 25 lit. 1.45,000) (inclusive of taxes). Cat# is 21870100 (Gibco. USA), expiry should be atleast 2 year after delivery.

Item 6 FBS

Only 1 bid was received by M/S The Worldwide Scientific. After careful evaluation, the Committee has recommended to awarded the tender to M/S The Worldwide Scientific at unit price Rs 21,000 (for 12 lit. 5,04,000) (inclusive of taxes), Cat# is 10270106 (Gibeo, Germany), expiry should be at least 2 year after delivery.

Item 7 DMEM

Only 1 bid was received by M/8 The Worldwide Scientific. After careful evaluation, the Committee has recommended to awarded the tender to M/8 The Worldwide Scientific at unit price Rs 5,600 (for 50 lit. 280,000) (inclusive of taxes), Cat# is 1196526 (Gibco, USA), expiry should be at least 2 year after delivery.

Item 8 Pentamidine

Only 1 bid was received by M/S Al-Raza Printers. After careful evaluation, the Committee has recommended to awarded the tender to M/S Al-Raza Printers at unit price Rs 50,000 for 10 g (inclusive of taxes). Cat# is 140-64-7 (China).

Item 9 Ivermeetin

Only 1 bid was received by M/S Al-Raza Printers. After careful evaluation, the Committee has recommended to awarded the tender to M/S Al-Raza Printers at unit price Rs 55,000 for 10 g (inclusive of taxes), Cat# is 70288-86-7 (China).

ON THE RECOMMENDATION OF TECHNICAL COMMITTEE

PURCHASE COMMITTEE ICCBS INSTITUTIONS

PROF. DR. M. SHAIQ ALI Chairman (I.C.C.B.S)

SYED JEHANZEB Manager (Finance) I.B.A, Karachi DR. FARZANA SHAHEEN
Associate Professor (I.C.C.B.S)
Internal Member

DR. HAFIZUR REHMAN Assistant Professor (I.C.C.B.S)

ASJADASAD

Sr. Manager Procurement & Customer Support I.B.A Karachi

Item 10 Doxorubicin

Only 1 bid was received by M/S Al-Raza Printers. After careful evaluation, the Committee has recommended to awarded the tender to M/S Al-Raza Printers at unit price Rs 240,000 for 10 g (inclusive of taxes), Cat# is 25316-40-9 (China).

Item 11 Permethrin

Only 1 bid was received by M/S Al-Raza Printers. After careful evaluation, the Committee has recommended to awarded the tender to M/S Al-Raza Printers at unit price Rs 56,800 for 10 g (inclusive of taxes). Cat# is 52645-53-1(China).

Item 12Fluconazole

Only 1 bid was received by M/S Al-Raza Printers. After careful evaluation, the Committee has recommended to awarded the tender to M/S Al-Raza Printers at unit price Rs 57,900 for 10 g (inclusive of taxes). Cat# is 86386-73-4 (China).

Item 13 Amphotericin

Two bids were received by M/S The Worldwide Scientific and M/S Al-Raza Printers. Item quoted by M/S The Worldwide Scientific is not as per our specifications i.e., they are providing the required antibiotic in liquid form and we required in solid form. After careful evaluation, the Committee has recommended to awarded the tender to M/S Al-Raza Printers at unit price Rs 58,000 for 10 g (inclusive of taxes), Cat# is 1397-89-3 (China).

ON THE RECOMMENDATION OF TECHNICAL COMMITTEE

PURCHASE COMMITTEE ICCBS INSTITUTIONS

PROP. DR. M. SHAIQ ALI Chairman (I.C.C.B.S)

SYED JEHANZEB Manager (Finance) I.B.A, Karachi DR. FARZANA SHAHEEN
Associate Professor (I.C.C.B.S)
Internal Member

DR. HAFIZUR REHMAN
Assistant Professor (I.C.C.B.S)

ASJAD ASAD

Sr. Manager Procurement & Customer Support I.B.A Karachi

Item 14 96-Well plates

2 bids were received by M/S Musaji Adam & Sons and M/S Lucky Lab International.

After careful evaluation, committee has recommended retendering the item with revised specifications as the quotations received are not as per our specification.

Item 15 Yellow Tips

No bid was received thus committee has recommended retendering the item.

Item 16 Blue Tips

No bid was received thus committee has recommended retendering the item.

Item 17 White Tips

No bid was received thus committee has recommended retendering the item.

Item 18 Eppendrof Tubes

3 bids were received by M/S Musaji Adam & Sons, M/S BioSciences International, and M/S Lucky Lab International.

After careful evaluation, committee has recommended that for 0.5 mL the tender may be awarded to M/8 Lucky Lab International at unit price Rs 31,950 for 10 packs of 1000 pieces each (95,850 for 30 packs, 1000 pieces each) (inclusive of taxes). Catil is 5100500C (Capp-Denmark), as they are the lowest among the bidders and quoted item as per our specification. For 2.0 mL the tender may be awarded to M/8 Lucky Lab International at unit price Rs18,900 10 packs of 500 pieces each (1,134,00 for 30 packs, 1000 pieces each) as they are the lowest among the bidders and quoted item as per our specification (inclusive of taxes). Catil is 5102000C (Capp-Denmark).

For 1.5 mL the tender may be awarded to M/S Musaji Adam & Sons at unit price Rs 2,995 (89850 for 30 packs, 1000 pieces—each) (inclusive of taxes), Cat# is MCT-150-C (Axygencorning), as they are the lowest among the bidders and quoted item as per our specification.

ON THE RECOMMENDATION OF TECHNICAL COMMITTEE

PURCHASE COMMITTEE ICCBS INSTITUTIONS

PROF. DR. M. SHAIQ ALI Chairman (J.C.C.B.S)

SYED JEHANZEB Manager (Finance) I.B.A, Karachi DR. FARZANA SHAHEEN

Associate Professor (I.C.C.B.S)

Internal Member

Assistant Professor (I.C.C.B.S)

DR. HAFIZUR REHMAN

ASJAD ASAD

Sr. Manager Procurement & Customer Support I.B.A Karachi

Item 19 Cryovials

Only T bid was received by M/S Musaji Adam & Sons. After careful evaluation, the Committee has recommended that the tender should be awarded to M/S Musaji Adam & Sons at unit price Rs 36,000 for 10 packs 100 pieces each (inclusive of taxes). Cat# is 430659 (Corning, USA).

Item 20 Glass Beads (G8772)

No bid was received thus committee has recommended retendering the item

Item 21 1 Litre Membrane PES/PVDF, 0.2 µm

2 bids were received by M/S Musaji Adam & Sons and M/S Muslim Trading Agencies. After careful evaluation, committee has recommended retendering the item as it is not quoted as per our specification.

Item 22 0.5 Litre Membrane PES/PVDF, 0.2 µm

2 bids were received by M/S Musaji Adam & Sons and M/S Muslim Trading Agencies. After careful evaluation, committee has recommended retendering the item as it is not quoted as per our specification.

Item 23 Nano pure water Assembly

5 bids were received by M/S Bio Sciences, M/S Scientific Technical Corp. (Pvt). Ltd, M/S The Worldwide Scienctific, M/S Hoora Pharma, and M/S Lucky Lab International. None of them was in accordance to the specification provided thus after careful evaluation, committee has recommended that this item should be re-tender with revised specification.

Item 24 Centrifuge

3 bids were received by M/S Scientific Technical Corp, (Pvt). Ltd, M/S The Worldwide Scienetific, and M/S Lucky Lab International. After careful evaluation, committee has recommended that this item should be re-tender with revised specification as it is not quoted as per our specification.

ON THE RECOMMENDATION OF TECHNICAL COMMITTEE

PURCHASE COMMITTEE ICCBS INSTITUTIONS

PROF. DR. M. SHAIQ ALI Chairman (I.C.C.B.S)

SYED JEHANZEB Manager (Finance) I.B.A, Karachi DR. FARZANA SHAHEEN
Associate Professor (I.C.C.B.S)

Internal Member

DR. HAFI**EUR REHMAN**Assistant Professor (I.C.C.B.S)

ASJADASAD

Sr. Manager Procurement & Customer Support I.B.A Karachi

Item 26 Biosafety Fridge

4 bids were received by M/S Scientific Technical Corp. (Pvt). Ltd. M/S The Worldwide Scienctific, M/S Muslim Trading Agencies, and M/S Mughal Traders. None of them was in accordance to the specification provided thus after careful evaluation, committee has recommended that this item should be re-tender with revised specification.

Solvents

Item 1 Chloroform

2 bids were received by M/S Musaji Adam & Sons and M/S Al-Raza Printers.

After careful evaluation, committee has recommended that the tender may be awarded to M/S Musaji Adam & Sons at unit price Rs 4,600 for 1 bottle of 4 lit. (for 50 bottles, 2,30,000) (inclusive of taxes). Cat# is 2548-2304 (Daejung, Korea), as they are the lowest among the bidders and quoted item as per our specification.

Item 2 Acctonitrile

2 bids were received by M/S Musaji Adam & Sons and M/S Al-Raza Printers.

After careful evaluation, committee has recommended that the tender may be awarded to M/S Musaji Adam & Sons at unit price Rs 3.590 for 1 bottle of 4 lit. (for 20 bottles, 71.800) (inclusive of taxes). Cat# is 1012-2304 (Daejung, Korea), as they are the lowest among the bidders and quoted item as per our specification.

Item 3 n-Haxane

2 bids were received by M/S Musaji Adam & Sons and M/S Al-Raza Printers.

After careful evaluation, committee has recommended that the tender may be awarded to M/S Musaji Adam & Sons at unit price Rs 4,550 for 1 bottle of 4 lit (for 100 bottles, 4,55,000) (inclusive of taxes). Cat# is 4081-2304 (Daejung, Korea), as they are the lowest among the bidders and quoted item as per our specification.

ON THE RECOMMENDATION OF TECHNICAL COMMITTEE

PURCHASE COMMITTEE ICCBS INSTITUTIONS

PROF. DR. M. SHAIQ ALI Chairman (I,E.C.B.S)

SYED JEHANZEB Manager (Finance) I.B.A, Karachi DR. FARZANA SHAHEEN
Associate Professor (I.C.C.B.S)

Internal Member

DR. HAPIZUR REHMAN

Assistant Professor (I.C.C.B.S)

ASIAD ASAD

Sr. Manager Procurement & Customer Support I.B.A Karachi

Item 4 Methanol

2 bids were received by M/S Musaji Adam & Sons and M/S Al-Raza Printers. After careful evaluation, the Committee has recommended canceling the item as it is no more required.

Item 5 Ethyl Acetate

2 bids were received by M/S Musaji Adam & Sons and M/S Al-Raza Printers.

After careful evaluation, committee has recommended that the tender may be awarded to M/S Musaji Adam & Sons at unit price Rs 4.800 for 1 bottle of 4 lit (for 20 bottles 96,000) (inclusive of taxes), Cat# is 4016-2304 (Daejung, Korea), as they are the lowest among the bidders and quoted item as per our specification.

ON THE RECOMMENDATION OF TECHNICAL COMMITTEE

PURCHASE COMMITTEE ICCBS INSTITUTIONS

DR. FARZANA SHAHEEN
Associate Professor (I.C.C.B.S)

Internal Member

DR. HADIZUR REHMAN Assistant Professor (I.C.C.B.S)

Asylva

ASJAD ASAD

Sr. Manager Procurement & Customer Support I.B.A Karachi

External Member

PROF. DR. M. SHAIQ ALI Chairman (I.C.C.B.S)

SYED JEHANZEB Manager (Finance) I.B.A, Karachi

H.E.J RESEARCH INSTITUTE OF CHEMISTRY INTERNATIONAL CENTER FOR CHEMICAL AND BIOLOGICAL SCIENCES UNIVERSITY OF KARACHI

COMPARATIVE STATEMENT

TENDER NOTICE NO. ICCBS-HEJ-CTP(SGP)-070217 (3rd Time)

				TANK S	1				E VER	2				SEP 2	3		18 2
				M/s. N	lusaji Adar	n & Sons			M/s. Bio	Sciences Inte	ernational			M/s. 7	The WorldWid	e Scientic	
S.No.	" Chemicals for cell culture For cell culture"	Qty	Bid Qty				Unit Price	Bid Qty	Packing	CAT No.	Make	Unit Price	Bid Qty	Packing	CAT No.	Make	Unit Price
1	Normal Saline (D8537)	1 lit. x 10											10	1 Ltr	14190235	Thermo Scientific	5,400 00
2	HEPES (H3375)	1 kg x 5											5	1 Kg	11344041	Thermo Scientific	85,000.00
3	Sheep Blood (BD-21195)	15 ml x 1000															
4	Neubauer chamber (BR717810-1EA)	10 × 2											2	No.	C10228	Thermo Scientific	18,000.00
S.No.	" Media: "	Qty	Bid Qty	Packing	CAT No.	Make	Unit Price						Bid Qty	Packing	CAT No.	Make	Unit Price
5	RPMI-1640 Medium (R0883)	100 lit.											1	1 Ltr.	21870100	Thermo Scientific	5,800 00
6	Fetal Bovine Serum	100 lit											20	500 ml	10270106	Thermo Scientific	21,000.00
7	DMEM	100 lit											1	1 Ltr.	11965126	Thermo Scientific	5,600.00
S.No.	" Drugs and Antibiotics: For in vitro and in vivo studies:"	Qty	Bid Qty	Packing	CAT No.	Make	Unit Price						Bid Qty	Packing	CAT No.	Make	Unit Price
8	Pentamidine	10 gm															

PROF. DR. M. SHAIQ ALI Chairman (I.C.C.B.S) DR. FARZANA SHAHEEN
Associate Professor (I.C.C.B.S)

DR. HAFIZUR REHMAN Assistant Professor (IC.C.B.S)

SYED JEHANZEB Manager (Finance) I.B.A, Karachi

Sr. Manager Procurement & Customer Support I.B.A Karachi H.E.J RESEARCH INSTITUTE OF CHEMISTRY INTERNATIONAL CENTER FOR CHEMICAL AND BIOLOGICAL SCIENCES UNIVERSITY OF KARACHI

COMPARATIVE STATEMENT

TENDER NOTICE NO. ICCBS-HEJ-CTP(SGP)-070217 (3rd Time)

			100115		1			THE CASE		2		35 20		M. Care I	3		
				M/s. M	usaji Adar	m & Sons			M/s. Bio S	ciences Inte	rnational		ESF.	M/s.	The WorldWie	de Scientic	
9	lvermectin	10 gm															
10	Doxorubucin etc	10 gm															
11	Permethrin (Standard for scables)	10 gm															
12	Fluconazole (drug to cure Candida albicans)	10 gm															
13	Amphotericin B	10 gm		v							9		1	50 ml	15290026	Thermo Scientific	9,000.00
S.No.	" Supplies For in vitro and in vivo studies"	Qty	Bid Qty	Packing	CAT No.	Make	Unit Price						Bid Qty	Packing	CAT No.	Make	Unit Price
14	96-well plate	5000 plates	50	100 Plates		Nest Bio	11,500.00										
15	Yellow	x 1000 pack x 1000 each size tips															
16		1000 pack x 1000 each size															
17	white tips	1000 pack x 1000 each size tips															

PROF. DR. M. SHAIQ ALI

Chairman (I.C.C.B.S)

DR. FARZANA SHAHEEN Associate Professor (I.C.C.B.S)

DR. HAFIZUR REHMAN Assistant Professor (I.C.QB.S)

SYED JEHANZEB Manager (Finance) I.B.A, Karachi

Sr. Manager Procurement & Customer Support I.B.A Karachi

H.E.J RESEARCH INSTITUTE OF CHEMISTRY INTERNATIONAL CENTER FOR CHEMICAL AND BIOLOGICAL SCIENCES UNIVERSITY OF KARACHI

COMPARATIVE STATEMENT

TENDER NOTICE NO. ICCBS-HEJ-CTP(SGP)-070217 (3rd Time)

1 2 3 3 3 1	2	3
M/s. Musaji Adam & Sons		
M/S. Musaji Adam & Sons	M/s. Bio Sciences International	M/s. The WorldWide Scientic

18	Eppendorf tubes	0.2, 0.5, 1.5 and 2.0 µL 1000 pack x 1000 tubes 10	0.6 ml (100X1000 Pcs.)	MCT-060-C	Axygen/ Corning	5,500.00	2	0.5 ml 500/Pack	0030121023	Safe-Lock	6,048.00
	Eppendorf tubes	0.2, 0.5, 1.5 and 2.0 μL 1000 pack x 1000 tubes	1.5 ml / 2 ml (100X1000 Pos.)		Axygen/ Corning	2,995 00	1	1.5 ml 1000/Pack	0030123328	Ssfe-Lock	6,216.00
	Eppendorf tubes	0.2, 0.5, 1.5 and 2.0 μL 1000 pack x 1000 tubes					1	2.0 ml 1000/Pack	0030123344	Safe-Lock	8,472.00

PROF. DR. M. SHAIQ ALI Chairman (I.C.C.B.S)

> SYED JEHANZEB Manager (Finance) I.B.A, Karachi

DR. FARZANA SHAHEEN Associate Professor (I.C.C.B.S)

Sr. Manager Procurement & Customer Support

I.B.A Karachi

DR. HAFIZUR REHMAN Assistant Professor (I.C.C.B.S)

H.E.J RESEARCH INSTITUTE OF CHEMISTRY INTERNATIONAL CENTER FOR CHEMICAL AND I UNIVERSITY OF KARACHI

COMPARATIVE STATEMENT

TENDER NOTICE NO. ICCBS-HEJ-CTP(SGP)-070217 (3rd 1

					4	1 90			1971	5	10 19 19	
					M/s. Al Raza l	Printers			M/s. Lu	cky Lab Int	ernationa	
S.No.	" Chemicals for cell culture For cell culture"	Qty	Bid Qty	Packing	CAT No.	Make	Unit Price	Bid Qty	Packing	Cat No.	Make	Unit Price
1	Normal Saline (D8537)	1 lit. x 10	1	10 Ltr.	-	Sigma	9,000 00					
2	HEPES (H3375)	1 kg x 5	5	1 Kg	B18181	Apollo	35,000 00					
3	Sheep Blood (BD-21195)	15 ml x 1000										
4	Neubauer chamber (BR717810-1EA)	uer chamber										
S.No.	" Media:"	Qty	Bid Qty	Packing	CAT No.	Make	Unit Price	Bid Qty	Packing	Cat No.	Make	Unit Price
5	RPMI-1640 Medium (R0883)	100 lit.										
6	Fetal Bovine Serum	100 lit										
7	DMEM	100 lit										
S.No.	" Drugs and Antibiotics: For in vitro and in vivo studies:"	Qty	Bid Qty	Packing	CAT No.	Make	Unit Price	Bid Qty	Packing	Cat No.	Make	Unit Price
8	Pentamidine	10 gm		10 gm		China	50,000 00					

PROF. DR. M. SHAIQ ALI Chairman (I.C.C.B.S)

DR. FARZANA SHAHEEN Associate Professor (I.C.C.B.S) DR. HAFZUR REHMAN Assistant Professor (I.C.C.B.S)

SYED JEHANZEB Manager (Finance) I.B.A, Karachi

Sr. Manager Procurement & Customer Support I.B.A Karachi

COMPARATIVE STATEMENT

TENDER NOTICE NO. ICCBS-HEJ-CTP(SGP)-070217 (3rd 1

		[4			A SAME		5	14 mile	
					M/s. Al Raza I	Printers			M/s. Lu	cky Lab Inte	ernationa	
9												
10	Ivermectin	10 gm		10 gm		China	55,000.00					
10	Doxorubucin etc	10 gm		10 gm		China	240,000.00					
11	Permethrin (Standard for scables)	10 gm		10 gm		China	56,800.00					
12	Fluconazole (drug to cure Candida albicans)	10 gm		10 gm		China	57,900.00					
13	Amphotericin B	10 gm		10 gm		China	58,000.00					
S.No.	" Supplies For in vitro and in vivo studies"	Qty	Bid Qty	Packing	CAT No.	Make	Unit Price	Bid Qty	Packing	Cat No.	Make	Unit Price
14	96-well plate	5000 plates						8	25 Pcs.	5100313C		136,125
15	Yellow	x 1000 pack x 1000 each size tips										
16	blue	1000 pack x 1000 each size tips										
17		1000 pack x 1000 each size										
	white tips	tips										

PROF. DR. M. SHAIQ ALI Chairman (I.C.C.B.S)

DR. FARZANA SHAHEEN Associate Professor (I.C.C.B.S)

DA HAFIZUR REHMAN Assistant Professor (I.C.C.B.S)

SYED JEHANZEB Manager (Finance) I.B.A, Karachi

Sr. Manager Procurement & Customer Support

I.B.A Karachi

H.E.J RESEARCH INSTITUTE OF CHEMISTRY INTERNATIONAL CENTER FOR CHEMICAL AND I UNIVERSITY OF KARACHI

COMPARATIVE STATEMENT

TENDER NOTICE NO. ICCBS-HEJ-CTP(SGP)-070217 (3rd 1

			4	建筑设置			5		Birth B
			M/s. Al Raza Pr	inters		M/s. Lu	cky Lab Int	ernational	
18	Eppendorf tubes	0.2, 0.5, 1.5 and 2.0 μL 1000 pack x 1000 tubes			-1	0.5 ml (10x1000 Pcs.)	5100500C	Capp. Denmark	31,950.00
	Eppendorf tubes	0.2, 0.5, 1.5 and 2.0 µL 1000 pack x 1000 tubes			1	1 5 ml (20x500 Pos.)	5101500C	Capp. Denmark	31,950.00
	Eppendorf tubes	0.2, 0.5, 1.5 and 2.0 µL 1000 pack x 1000 tubes			1	2 0 ml (10x500 Pcs.)	5102000C	Capp, Denmark	18,900.00
	PROF. DR. M. SHAIQ ALI Chairman (I.C.C.B.S)	DR. FA	ARZANA SHAHEEN ate Professor (I.C.C.B.S)				DR. HAFIZU	JR REHMA	
	Mar	ED JEHANZEB nager (Finance) B.A, Karachi		AS Sr. Manager Procure	JAD ASA		Support		

COMPARATIVE STATEMENT - I (For End User)

TENDER NOTICE NO. ICCBS-HEJ-CTP(SGP)-070217 (3rd Time)

			15:15	V.E.V	1	DE SOL	358		1.00	2	HEEDER				3			Mary Control	Un Harris	4	P. Cont.	- Section
			100	M/s.		am & Som			M/s. B	io Sciences	Internations			M's. Scientif	ie Technical Co	rp (Prt.) Las			M/s TI	he WorldWide	Scientic	
S.No.	" Supplies For in vitro and in vivo studies"	Qty	Bid Qty	Pocking	-			Bid Qty	Packing	C4T No.	Make	Unit Price	Bid Qty	Packing	CAT No.	Make	Unit Price	Bid Qty	Packing	CAT No.	Make	Unit Pr
19	Cysivier CC15430489 SISAMA Corning* Cryogenic vials, internal thread capacity 2.0 mt, bottom, round, seal, washer, self- standing	2 mt, 10 packs ×100	1	500 Pire	430658	Coming. USA	18,000.00															
20	Glass beads (G8772) G8772 SIGMA	G8772 (500e)																				
S.No.	" Stericups "	Qty	Bid Qty	Packing	C4T No.	Make	Unit Price	Bid Qty	Packing	C4T No.	Make	Unit Price						Bid Qty	Packing	CAT No.	Make	Unit Pri
21	1 liter: Membrane: PES/PVDF, 0.2 μm, Hydrophilic, Nalgenie Car # 567.0020	250 mi x 1000																				
	do	500 ml a 1000																				
	do	500 ml s 1000																				
		1000 ml x	84	12 Pos	430516	Coming USA	25,150.00							60	2							

PROF O M. SHAIQ ALI Chairman (I.C.C.B.S)

> SYED JEHANZEB Manager (Finance) LB.A, Karachi

DR. FARZANA SHAHEEN Associate Professor (I C C B.S)

DR. HAFIZUR EEBMAN Assistant Professor (I.C.C.B.S)

AS JAD AS AD

Sr. Manager Procurement & Customer Support

LB A Karachi

COMPARATIVE STATEMENT - I (For End User)

TENDER NOTICE NO. ICCBS-HEJ-CTP(SGP)-070217 (3rd Time)

			464	offis.	1	E.S. T		200	1100	2	V 30000			STATE OF	3	Joseph L.	19200	N - RE	Sept Marie	4		SE S
				M/s.	Musaji Ad	am & Som	震調		Ma. B	lo Sciences	International			M/s. Scientific	c Technical Co	rp. (Pvt.) Ltd.	10.35		M/s. TI	he WorldWide	Scientic	
S.Na.	"Supplies For in vitro and in vivo studies"	Qty	Bid Qty	Packing	CAT No.	Make	Unit Price	Bid Qty	Packing	CAT No.	Make	Unit Price	Bid Qty	Packing	C4T No.	Make	Unit Price	Rid Qty	Packing	CAT No.	Make	Unit Price
22	500 ml: Membrane: PES/PVDF, 0.45 µm. Hydrophilic, Nalgene Cat # 566.0020	250 ml x 1000																				
	do	500 ml x 1000	м	12 Pos	430770	Corring USA	17 450 00															
	do	1000 mi s 1000																				
S.No.	" Equipment"	Qty	Bid Qty	Packing	CAT No	Make	Unit Price	Bid Qty	Packing	CAT No.	Make	Unit Price						Hid Qty	Packing	CAT No.	Make	Unit Price
23	Nano pure water assembly/ distilled and Delonized water assembly Equivalent to (2000015WW) Milli-Q* Integral Water Purification System, MERK MILLIPORE, USA (01)	1						- e	No	29/X/Q015 WW	Mills-O megnal WPS	2 400 000 00		No	Plus 1-2 GR UF 15 Uh	Wasserlab, Span	1,111 500 00	Y	Fan.	830-810	Adron/Europe	960 000 00
24	Centrifuge 5920 R refrigerated with rotor	1												No	K2MRFS	Centurion Sci.	1,368,900.00		No.	MPW-352R	MPW.Europe	1,100,000.0

PROF. DR. M. SHAIQ ALI Chairman (I.C.C.B.S)

DR. FARZANA SHAHEEN Associate Professor (I.C.C.B.S)

DR. HASLIGH REMMAN Assistant Professor (I.C.C.B.S)

STED JEHANZEB Manager (Finance)

Sr. Manager Procurement & Customer Suppo

	I.b.A, Kara	icia			_	LO.A N	e acre										
25	Biological Safety Cabinet Class II Type A2Company : ESCOModel No: AC2-2[8	1															
				_													
				-	+												
26	Biosafety Fridge (BBO BK)	1						,	No.	UniFranz U700	Deman Sci. USA	1,860,300.00	,	No	ZUN-UT300	Polekoff urape	1,100,000
					-		-										

Chairman (I.C.C.B.S)

DR. FARZANA SHAHEEN Associate Professor (I.C.C.B.S) DR. HAFIZUR REHMAN Assistant Professor (I.C.C.B.S)

SYED JEHANZEB Manager (Finance) I.B.A, Karachi ASJAD ASAD

Sr. Manager Procurement & Dustomer Supp

LB.A Karach

COMPARATIVE STATEMENT -1 (For End User)

TENDER NOTICE NO. ICCBS-HEJ-CTP(SGP)-070217 (3rd 1

				F198162	5		RELEGIO	THE STATE OF	V-SAID	6		BREILE.			7	Mir.		The same		8	LESS:	
					M/s. Hoora l	Pharma			M/s. M	uslim Trading	Agencies			M/s.	Mughal T	raders			Mis. Luc	ky Lab Int	rnationa	
S.No.	" Supplies For in vitro and in vivo studies"	Qty	Bid Qty	Pecking	CAT No.	Make	Unit Price	Bid Qty	Packing	Cat No.	Make	Unit Price	Bid Qty	Packing		Make	Unit Price	Bid Qty	Packing	Cat No.	Make	Unit Price
19	Crystaler CL5430485 SiGMA Corring* cryogenic vials, internal thread capacity 2.0 ml, bottom, round, seal, washer, self standing	2 mt. 10 packs x100																				
30	Glass beads (GB772) GB772 SIGMA	G8772 (500g)																				
S.No.	" Stericups "	Qty	Bid Qty	Packing	CAT No.	Make	Unit Price	Bid Qty	Pecking	Cat No.	Make	Unit Price	Bid Qty	Packing	Cat No.	Make	Unit Price	Bid Qty	Packing	Cat No	Make	Unit Price
21	1 liter: Membrane: PES/PVDF, 0.2 μm, Hydrophilic, Nalgene Cat # 56 7.0020	250 ml x 1000																				
	do	500 ml x 1000																				
	· · do · ·	500 ml x 1000																				
	/	2000 ml s																			6	1

PROF. DR. M. SHAIQ ALI Chairman (I.C.C.B.S)

> SYED JEHANZEB Manager (Finance) I.B.A, Karachi

PROF. DR. M. SHAIQ ALI Chairman (I.C.C.B.S)

> SYED JENANZEB Managey (Finance) I.B.A. Karachi

DR. FARZANA SHAHEEN Associate Professor (I.C.C.B.S)

C.C.B.S)

DR. HAFIZUR REHMAN Assistant Professor (I.C.C.B.S)

ASJAD ASAD

COMPARATIVE STATEMENT - I (For End User)

TENDER NOTICE NO. ICCBS-HEJ-CTP(SGP)-070217 (3rd 1

					5	13122	THE STATE OF		Digital season	6	10000				7				-	8		
					M's. Hoors Pt	arma		SHE	M/s M	aslim Trading	Agencles			Mh	Mughal T	raders			M/c Luc	ky Lab Int	ernations	
S.No.	"Supplies For in vitro and in vivo studies"	Qty	Bid Qty	Packing	CAT No.	Make	Unit Price	Bid Qty	Packing	Cat No.	Make	Unit Price	Bid Qty	Packing	Cat No.	Make	Unit Price	Bid Qty	Packing	Cat No.	Make	Unit Pri
22	SOO rel: Membrane: PES/PVDF, 0.45 µm. Hydrophilic, Natgene Cat # 566.0020	250 ml x 1000																				
	do	500 ml x 1000							(0.45 um) 500 mr / Pack	SCHVLOSRE	=1	19,071 00										
		1000 ml x 1000	le.																			
S.No.	" Equipment"	Qty	Bid Qty	Packing	CAT No.	Make	Unit Price	Bid Qty	Packing	Cat No.	Make	Unit Price	Bid Qty	Packing	Car No.	Make	Unit Price	Bid Qty	Packing	Cat No.	Make	Unit Price
23	Nano pure water assembly/ distilled and Delonized water assembly Equivalent to (EKKO) SWW) Milli-Q* Integral Water Purification System, MERK MILLIPORE, USA (01)	1		Pt	Ultra Clear GP 36 TWF ED 30 UV UF TM (with TOC)		1,690,000.00											,	No	NO-12	Nove. Turkey	295,000.00
24	Centrifuge	1																1	Pt	NF-4009	Nove Turkey	496,500.0
																					2	

M. SHAIQ ALI

SYED JENANZEB

DR. FARZANA SHAHEEN Associate Professor (I.C.C.B.S)

ASJAD ASA Sr. Manager Procurerpers & Cur Support I.B.A Karachi

Manager (Finance) I.B.A, Karachi Biological Safety Cabinet Class II Type A2Company : ESCOModel No: AC2-2E8 Biosafety Fridge (280 DC) UPSER kval 1 No Optional: CO2 Backup System

PROF. DR. M. SHAIQ ALI

SYED JEHANZEB Manager (Finance) I.B.A, Karachi

SYED JEHANZEB

DR. FARZANA SHAHEEN Associate Professor (I C C B S)

DR. HAFIZUR REHMAN Assistant Professor (I.C.C.B.S)

DR. HAFIZUR REHMAN Assistant Professor (I.C.C.B.S)

ASJAD ASAD Sr. Manager Procurement & Customer Support LB.A Karachi

COMPARATIVE STATEMENT - I (For End User)

TENDER NOTICE NO. ICCBS-HEJ-CTP(SGP)-070217 (3rd Time)

				B II B	1	P. Baller				2	100 FE	0.1243
				M/s. Th	e WorldWi	ide Scientit	iie .		M/s.	. Al-Raza F	Printers	
S.No.	" Chemicals, Drugs and Kits"	Qty	Bid Qty	Packing	CAT No.	Make	Unit Price	Bid Qty	Packing	CAT No.	Make	Unit Price
27	Easy-Titer Human IgG (H+L) Assay Kit, (Thermo Scientific) Product Number 23310	10 kits	1	No	23310	Thermo Scientific, USA	640,000.00	1	96 Test		Cohesion Bio, UK	53,400.00
28	Easy-Titer Human IgM Assay Kit, (Thermo Scientific) Product Number 23315	10 kits	1	No	23315	Thermo Scientific USA	640,000 00	1	96 Test		Cohesion Bio, UK	53,400.00
29	Alkaline Phosphatase Assay Kit (Colorimetric)(Thermo Scientific) Product Number 9945.170	5 kits						1	96 Test		Cohesion Bio, UK	37,400.00
30	Gamma Glutamyltransferase 1 (GGT1) ELISA Kit (Bio Scientific) Product Number 5601-01	5 kits						1	96 Test		Cohesion Bio, UK	57,700.00
31	Aspartate Aminotransferase Kit (Thermo Scientific) Product Number 89-024-584	5 kits						1	96 Test		Cohesion Bio, UK	42,600.00
32	Alanine Aminotransferase Kit (Thermo Scientific) Product Number 0872034	5 kits						1	96 Test		Cohesion Bio, UK	40,800.00
33	AUTOCLAVE (HICLAVE HV-110 STRELIZER) HIRYAMA OR EQUIVALENT -1	1										

PROF. DR. M. SHAIQ ALI Chairman (I.C.C.B.S) DR. FARZANA SHAHEEN Associate Professor

DR. HAFIZUR REHMAN Assistant Professor

SYED JEHANZEB Manager (Finance) I.B.A, Karachi ASJAD ASAD
Sr. Manager Procurement &
Customer Support
I.B.A Karachi

INTERNATIONAL CENTER OF CHEMICAL AND BIOLOGICAL SCIENCE UNIVERSITY OF KARACHI

COMPARATIVE STATEMENT - I (For End User)

TENDER NOTICE NO. ICCBS-HEJ-CTP(SGP)-070217 (3rd Time)

			WW.		1	0.14.14.6				2				
				M/s. N	Iusaji Adar	n & Sons		M/s, Al Raza Printers						
S.No.	" Solvents "	Qty	Bid Qty	Packing	CAT No.	Make	Unit Price	Bid Qty	Packing	CAT No.	Make	Unit Price		
1	Chloroform 99.8% HPLC Grade	4 Ltr. X 100	100	4 Ltr.	2548-2304	Daejung, Korea	4,600.00	100	4 Ltr.		Tedia, USA	7,300.00		
2	Acetonitrile 99.9% HPLC Grade	4 Ltr. X 100	100	4 Ltr.	1012-2304	Daejung, Korea	3,590.00	100	4 Ltr.		Tedia. USA	6,000.00		
3	n-Hexane HPLC Grade	4 Ltr. X 100	100	4 Ltr.	4081-2304	Daejung, Korea	4,550.00	100	4 Ltr.		Tedia, USA	6,500.00		
4	Methanol 99.9% HPLC Grade	4 Ltr. X 100	100	4 Ltr.	5558-2304	Daejung, Korea	1,525.00	100	4 Ltr.		Tedia, USA	3,900.00		
5	Ethyl Acetate 99.9% HPLC Grade	4 Ltr. X 100	100	4 Ltr.	4016-2304	Daejung, Korea	4,800.00	100	4 Ltr.		Tedia. USA	6,300.00		

PROF. DR. M. SHAIQ ALI Chairman (I.C.C.B.S)

DR. FARZANA SHAHEEN Associate Professor DR. HAFIZUR REHMAN Assistant Professor (I.C.C.B.\$)

SYED JEHANZEB Manager (Finance) I.B.A, Karachi ASJAD ASAD
Sr. Manager Procurement &
Customer Support
I.B.A Karachi