


























































































































































SENIOR SUN 	\ I I \ 111 \ I VI I I I II 14 E MATIARI 
& CHAIRMAN COMMI 	rui It I ■ 1 	(mit 1 M ADJACENT TO 

POLWE STA 141\ 111111 	\ 	■ It 	1)I RARAD. 

NO. %01 	/2015. 
Dated 	clati —04-2015 

To 	1 he ilunager (Assessment)/IT Department 
Sindh Public Procurement Regulatory Authority, 
Barrack No. 8, Sindh Secretariat No. 4-A 
Court Road Karachi  

SUBJECT:- BID EVALUATION REPORT OF REMAINING 
REPAIRZRENOVATIOIL WORK L ,PURCHASE 	 OF 
1001../MACHIENRY & FURNITURE & FIXTURE FOR POLICE 
AUDITORIUM ADJACENT 	TO  PS _B_H MU  NAGAR 
HYDERABAD.(SPPRA SERIAL NO.234851 

• 

It is submitted that NIT was advertisement by this office 

and same was published by electronic media and print media (SPPRA 

Serial No. 23485. 

2/- 	The bids were opened and "Bid Evaluation Report" was 

prepared along with supporting documents are sent here with to hoist 

on SPPRA website without further delay of time. 

3/- 	Your cooperation in this regard is highly appreciated. 

(AM)AD AHMED SHAIKH) PSP 
SSP MATIARI 

& Chairman Committee Police Auditorium 
Adjacent PS Bhitai Nagar Hyderabad 

Copy to. 
1. The Director IT Department, CPO Sindh Karachi, with request to hoist 

Bid Evaluation Report (Sr.No.67) on Sindh Police Website. 

X.)  



V 
BID EVALUATION REPORT 

Renttuis 

6  

Lowest 

Iligesht 

MA Vernon 
Enierprises 

M/s Tafrucklin 
Budder:. 

(RASHID IIIDAVAT) PSP 
ASP Cantonment Hyd & Member 

( GRA AMA A 	A 1 
OSP/A DMN 

DRIP Office flydetabad Range & lember 

(IS RAT PERVEZ CIIANDIO) 
AEN/Bldg I lyd/ Member 

't " IM, 	113 ROOMI) 
IL SinditiMember 

• 1. Name of Procuring Agency: 	SENIOR SUPEttINTENDEN'e OF POLICE MATIARI 
& CHAIRMAN COMMITTEE POLICE AUDITORIUM ADJACENT TO 
POLICE STATION Kill IA I NAGAR HYDERABAD. 

2. Tender Reference No: 	DICP/2010, dated 06.04.2015 & SPPRA Serial No.23485:INE/KRY-1211-15 

3. Tender Description/Name of mirk: !Category-A) Remaining Repair/Renovation stork of Police Auditorium 
adjacent to PS Bhitai Nagar rip.  

4. Method of Procurement: 	 Single Stage one Envelop 

5. Tender Published: 	SPPRA Website Serial No.23485 dated 91.04.2015, Sindh Police Website 
(Sr.FitrelLDsily  Tribune I...Awn. Sotd.. I ialchal. Jatigri  Bat (03.04.2015) 

6. Total Bid documents Sold: 	03 Nr  
7. Tata Bids Received: 	 03 (Three Bidders Approached  & %Imbed, 
3. lifollS) Rejected: No Bids) 	 1111. 
9. No. of Bid Technically Qualified 	 Ni  
10. Bid Rejected 	 NI I  
I I. Financial Bid Opening date: 	 17.04.20I5 

Rooldng In  
terms of 

cost  

Pt lawn 

2.14  leant 

Conspatison 
with 

&Bonded cost 
4 

914% Ado% 

4% abort 

Reasons for 
CUreptaftee/ 

refired." 
5 

Accemed tan 
loons 

No convonico 
twine Nebo! 

No am:saw; 
bong lughn4 

12. Bid Evaluation Report: 
too offered by 

$ rNoote of tient 
Bidder or 

the Bidder 

I 2 

Is  Wont 	1 5s% above 

(AMJAD AHMEI)•SHAIKH) PSP 
SSP. Matiar & Chairman 

0 

Mrs Yosir Masan Rs.N 

2 Rs.25.46.23bb 

Its 25.91.90V- 



 

BID EVALUATION REPORT 

I . Name of Procuring Agency: SENIOR SUPERINTENDENT OF POLICE MATIARI 
& CHAIRMAN COMMITTEE POLICE AUDITORIUM ADJACENT TO 
POLICE STATION BIIITAI NACAR IIYDERABAD. 

2. Tender Reference No: DIGP/2010. dated 06.04.2015 & SPPRA Serial No.23485:INF/FCRY-1211-15  

3. Tender Description/Name of work: (Category-B) Purchase of Tool /Machinery (Air conditioner Fans, etc) 
of Police Auditorium adjacent to PS tihdai Nagar TM.  

4. Method of Procurement: 	 Single Stage one Envelop 

5. Tender Published: 	SPPRA Website Serial No.23485 dated 01.04.2015, Sindh Police Website 
(Sr. No.67).DaiIy Tribune Express. Sobh. lialchal, Jung, Nat Bat (03.04.2015) 

6. Total Bid documents Sold: 
7. Taal Bids Received: 
8. Bid(s) Rejected: No Bid(s) 
9. No, of Bid Technically Qualified 
to. Bid Rejected 
11. Financial Bid Opening date: 

03 Nr 
03 (Three Bidden Approached & Applied) 

NIT 
N 

NII 
17.04.2015 

12. 	Evaluation Report: Item #.O1 Split Air conditioner 13 Ton . pipe, angliers including 
testing / installation at site complete in all respect (with Stabliter) 

Reasonsfor 
acceptance/ 

rejection  
5 	 

\Lceptctl being 
Wont 

No accrpiance 
being highest 

No acceptance 
bung. highest 

SO 
Name of Firm or 

girlder  

Cost offered 
by the Bidder 

Per Unit 

Ranking in 
terms of 

COSI 

0 I 2 3 

I M/s Al Rana Computes. Rs.75.0004 l' lowest 

2 M/s Wants Lnierphese Its.76.500b 2".  lowest 

3 Ws Verona linesman Rs.77.001V- 2'1  knew 

Comparison 
with 

Estimated cost 
4 

mwsi %whin 
cosi/qualm 

[behest Con 

Highest Cost 

Remarks 

6 

Lowest 

Highest 

Highest 

 

(RASIIII) IIIDAVAT) PSP 
ASP Cantonment Ilyd & Member 

( 11A AIJAZ ALI 10 A 
DSPIADMN 

DIGP Office I lyderabad Rang e  • ember 

(1 RAT PERVEZ CHANDIO) 	 oil I MMA SOIIAIB ROO, I) 
AEN/Bldg Ilyd/ Member 	 WPM Sindh/Member 

(AMJAD AIIML SIT IK II) PtiP 
SSP. Mailer & Chairman 

O 



NIL 
N/A 
N11. 

17.04.2015 

8. Bid(s) Rejected: No Bid(s) 
9. No. of Bid Technically Qualified 
10. Bid Rejected 
II. Financial Bid Opening date: 

BID EVALUATION REPORT 

SENIOR ST PHU\ l'ENDENT OF POLICE MATIARI 
& CHAIRNLA ( OMNIFI FE 1. POLICE AUDITORIUM ADJACENT TO 
POLICE STA 110 \ 131111 9,1 NAGAR HYDERABAD. 

2. 'fender Reference No: 	DICP/2010, dated 06.04.2015 & SPPRA Serial No.23485:INF/K RV-1211-15 

3. Tender DescriptionfNamt of work: (Category-B) Purchase of Tool /Machinery (Air conditioner Fans, etc) 
of Police Auditorium adjacent to PS Bhitai Nagar Hyd.  

4. Method of Procurement: 	 Single Stage one Envelop 

5. Tender Published: 	SPPRA Website Serial No.23485 dated 01.04.2015, Sindh Police Website 
(Sr. No.67),Daily Tribune Lipress, Sobh, lialchal, Jung, Nal Bat (03.04.2015)  

6. Total Bid documents Sold: 	03 Nr  
7. Total Bids Received: 	 03 (Three Bidders Approached & Applied) 

12. Bid Evaluation Report: Item #.02 Floor Standing Air conditioner (2 Ton) frequency cooling 
canacitv 24000 BTU including installation/testing. 

S.11 
Name of Firm or 

Bidder 

Cost offered 
by the Bidder 

Per Unit 

Ranking in 
terms of 

cosi 

Comparison 
with 

Estimated cos 
0 1 2 3 4 

I Mis Al Rank Computers Rs.165.000/- II  lowest 
Lowest %Whin 

cost/quality 

2 Ws Wania Entespnesc Ra1.66.000/- 2" lowest Highest Cosi 

3 Ws Vernon Entemnses R5.1,68.000C. r lowest Highest Cost 

Reasons for 
acceptance/ 	Remarks 

resection 
5 	 6 

Accepted being 
lowest 

No ace:pumice 
bong highest 

No acceptance 
being highest 

Lowest 

Highest 

Highest 

6.9.11A AIJA AL 
DSP/ADMN 

DIGP 0 lice Hyderabad Ijpnge & ember 

(MUD MMAZSIet HICCOOMI) 
0. /MU Sindh/Member 

(AMJAD AHME 	PSP 
SSP, Metier & Chairman 

I. Name of Procuring Agency: 

(RASHID HIDAYAT) PSP 
ASP Cantonment Hyd & Member 

(I IIRAT PERVEZCHANDIO) 
AEN/Bldg I lyd/ Member 

I 



Reasons for 
acceptance/ 

rejection 

- 
Accepted Ming 

lowest ..„  
No acceptance 
being highest 

No actxplance 
bong highest 

Remarks 
Comparison 

with 
Estimated cost 

4 
owes within 
..,ostiquakty 

I Isels:st Cast 

I helnist Cast 

LowyM 

Highest 

Ilighes 

CHIA ALI 	L 
"DSPiADMN 

DIGP Office I iyderabad Itai me & Member 

   

 

BID EVALUATION REPORT 

 

I . Name of Procuring Agency: SENIOR SUPERINTEND! N. I OF POLICE. MATIARI 
& CHAIRMAN COM NIIT 11.1 POI ICE XI' nrromum ADJACENT TO 
POLICE STATION BIIITM \'1G It I11 DERABAD. 

2. Tender Reference No: 	DIGP/2010, dated 06.04.2015 & SPPRA Serial No.23485:INF/KRY-121I-1 5 

3. Tender Description/Name of work: (Category-13) Purchase of Tool /Machinery (Air conditioner Fans. etc) 
7511e71-idfln  Ewen o Malta' Nagar Ilyd.  

4. Method of Procurement: 	 Single Stage one Envelop 

5. Tender Published: 	SPPRA Website Serial No.23485 dated 01.04.2015, Sindh Police Website 
(Sr. No.67).Daily Tribune Express, Sobii, Ilalchal, Jung, Nai Bat (03.04.2015)  

6. Total Bid documents Sold: 	03 Nr  
7. Total Bids Received: 	 03 (Three Bidders Approached & Applied) 
8. Bid(s) Rejected: No Bid(s) 
9. No. of Bid Technically Qualified 
10. Bid Rejected 
1 I. Financial Bid Opening date: 

     

NIL 

   

          

          

     

NIA 

    

          

          

     

NII. 

    

          

          

    

17.04.2015 

  

          

          

12. Bid Evaluation Report: Item #.03 Bracket Fan Wall mounted in whim color size 18", volt 
220 / 230 RPM 1350 cycle 50 watts 65 . Air displacement 3000 cu.11./min with fitting & 
estin . 

Sit 

I 

Name of Firm or 
Bidder 

Cost offered 
by the Bidder 

Per Unit 

Ranking in 
terms of 

cost 
1 2 3 

F  Ws Al kazztk Coinputeis Rs 3200f- I' lowest 

2.  Ws Wants Enierpriese Rs340n1- rs Itasca 

3.  Ws Vcrizon Enterprises Rs.34011/- 3" lowest 

(RASHID HIDAYAT) PSP 
ASP Cantonment Hyd & Member 

(ISHIEATPERVEZ CHANDIO) 
ALE/Bldg Hyd/ Member 

(MI111 MA12,01 AIB 00M1) 
O. PPM Sindh/Member 

(AMJAD AIMED :MAI KII) NP 
SSP, Matiar & Chairman 



2. Tender Reference No: DICP/2010, dated 06.04.2015 & SPPRA Serial N o.23485:INF/K RY-1211-15 

3. Tender Description/N ame of work: ICategory-13) Purchase of Tool /Machinery (Air conditioner Fans. etc) 

BID EVALUATION REPORT 

I. Name of Procuring Agency: 	SENIOR SUPERINTENDENT OF POLICE NI 1TIARI 

& CHAIRMAN COMMIT] I I POI 1( I 11 Di I ORIUM ADJACENT TO 

POLICE STATION BIIITA I 	tit III 0(14 %BAD. 

of Police Auditorium  iiajacent to PS littitai Nagar Md. 

4. Method of Procurement: 	 Single Stage one Ens clop 

5. Tender Published: 	SPPRA Website Serial No.23485 dined 01.04.2015, Sindh Police M ensile 

(Sr. No.67),Daily Tribune Express, Sobb. Hatch's!, Jong, Nat Bat (03.04.2015) 

6. Total Bid documents Sold: 	03 N r 
7. Total Bids Received: 
8. Bid(s) Rejected: No Bid(s) 
9. No. of Bid Technically Qualified 
10. Bid Rejected 
11. Financial Bid Opening date: 

03 (Three Bidders Approached & Applied) 

17.04.2015 

Nil. 

\ 

SO 
Name of Finn or 

Bidder 

Cost offered 
by the Bidder 

Job 

Ranking in 
terms of 

cost 
0 I 2 3 

I M/s Al gunk Compiling Its 130.000/- 1 4  lowest 

1 M/s Wants Financiers Rs 190.0006 t lowest 

3 M/s Vernon Entoptises lb. 395.000/- 34  linnaa 

12. Bid Evaluation Report: Item 0.04 Sound System of I3cst Quality with 6 speakers & 2 mikes 

Pone wire & one wire less Mike) including fixing, installation & testing. 	_ _ 
(*emporium 	Reasons for 

5 

Accepted being 
lowcsi 
- - - 

Nu  setvpiance 
being highest 

acceptance/ 
rejesion 

No Emmet 
being higlyst 

Remarks 

6  

Latta 

Ihghcsl 

Bogus 

(RASIIID HIDAYNT) PSP 
ASP Cantonment Hyd & Member 

(ISHRAT PERVEZ CHAND(0) 
AEN/Bldg Hyd/ Member 

( 	A AIJAZ ALI 1 A ) 
DSRADMN 

DIGP Office I lyderabad Range & Mc 

(MU IAMMAD.Seil*It1lttMI)  
S/PPIU Sindh/Member 

(AMJAD AIIMED:HAIKIDPSP 
SSP, Matiar & Chairman 

with 
Esthrtuted cost 

4 

CIAVII within 

Ilighen tint 

Highest Cam 



S. Name of Finn or 
Bidder 

0 

M/s AI Runk Computer 

2 
	

Ws Wane Entecoricse 

Vanton Emotritoes 3. 

BID EVALUATION REPORT 

I . Name of Procuring Agency: SENIOR SUPERINTENDENT OF POLICE. NIATIARI 

& CHAIRMAN commrrm: pout': AUDITORIUM ADJACENT TO 
POLICE STATION BIIITAI NAGAR HYDERABAD. 

2. fender Reference No: 	 DIGP/2010. dated 06.04.2015 & SPPRA Serial No.23485:I N 1-7ERN-1211-15 

3. lender Description/Name of work: (Category-B) Purchase of Told /Machinery (Air conditioner Fans, etc) 
of Police Auditorium milkmen! to PS Bhitai Nagar Ilyd.  

4. Method of Procurement: 	 Single Stage one Envelop 

5. lender Published: 	SPPRA Website Serial No.23485 dated 01.04.2015. Sind's Police Website 

(Sr. No.67).Daily Tribune Express, Sold'. tbilelnng. Nai Bat (03.04.2015) 

6. Total Bid documents Sold. 	03 Nr  
7. Total Bids Received: 	 03 (Three Bidders Approached & Applied) 

8. Bid(s) Rejected: No Bid(s) 	 NIT 
9. No. of Bid Technically Qualified 	 \ A  

10. Bid Rejected 	 NII  
I I. Financial Rid Opening date: 	 17.04.2015 

12. Bid Evaluation Report: Item 0.05 Generator 5 or 6 KVA PetrolICNG quality consumption 
self start including batter. and installation on  appropriate place.  

Rs 235,000/- 

RS.2.38.0130/- 

Rs234.01XX- 

Carl offered Ranking in Comparison 
by the Bidder 	terms of 	with 

Per Unit 	cost 	Estimated cow 
2 	 3 	 4 

I.tnwst %%Wm 
I" lows' 

coil/nimbly 

r lowest 

3 lowest Highest l'on 

COol 

Reasons for 
acceptance/ 

rejection 
5 

Accepted being 
lowest 

No occrytolcc 
Nine highest 

No uarplonet 
lying hirhest 

Remarks 

6 

Lomat 

highest 

Highest 

(RASHID III DA YAT) PSP 
ASP Cantonment Hyd & Member 

(A(IU3IJA.A . 	A )  
IBP'ADMN 

DIGP Office I Iyderabad Range 	ember 

(ISI RAT PERVEZ CHANDIO) 
AEN/Rldg I lyd/ Member 

MMAD.  
S/1,11.1 Sindli/Member 

(AMJAD AHMED SIIAIKII) PSI' 
SSP. Matiar & Chairman 

@,) 



Remarks 

6  

Lowest 

Highest 

Highest 

Highest 

■ I I 

.■ I 

BID EVALUATION REPORT 

• I. Name of Procuring Agency: SENIOR SUPER! FENDENT OF POLICE NIATIA RI 
& CHAIRMAN ('0 NI MIME POLICE AUDITORIUM ADJACENT TO 
POLICE STATION 81111 U NAGAR HYDERABAD. 

2. 'fender Reference No: 	DIGP/2010, dated 06.04.2015 & SPPRA Serial No.23485:INF/KRY-1211-15  

3. fender Description/Name of work: (Category-C) Purchase of Furniture / Fixture 
of Police Auditorium adjacent to PS MUM Nagar Hyd.  

4. Method of Procurement: 	 Single Stage one Envelop 

5. Tender Published: 	SPPRA Website Serial No.23485 dated 01.04.2015, Sindh Police Website 
(Sr. No.67),Daily Tribune Express, Sobh, lialchal, Jong, Nai Bat (03.04.2015) 

6. Total Bid documents Sold: 
7. Total Bids Received: 
8. Bid(s) Rejected: No Bid(s) 
9. No. of Bid Technically Qualified 
10. Bid Rejected 
II. Financial Bid Opening date: 

04 Nr 
04 (Four Bidden Approached & Applied) 

NIL 
N/A 

NIL 
17.04.2015 

12. B'd Evaluation Report: Item COI Sofa Set Single Seater I.eather/ Silk Cotton Mix of best 

uali , ( Foam used Molti or e uivalent . 

Sit 
Name of Firm or 

Bidder 

Cost offered 
by the Bidder 
Per Unit/Each 

Ranking in 
terms of 

cost 

Comparison 
with 

Estimated cost 

0 1 2 3 4 
unco %%ulna 

cog/quality 

Highest Cost 

I. hVs WanWaneEnterpnese Its.16.200/- 14 lowest 

2 M/s Al Rarzak Computers Rs.16.400A 2" lowest 

3 Ws Rhein' International Rs. 16.7001- 4. lowest Highest Cost 

4 Mis Vetizon Enterpnses Its.16500/- 314 lowest I lighot Cost 

Reasons for 
acceptance/ 

rejection 
5 

Accepted hong 
lowest 

No acceptance 
being highest 

No acceptance 
hong highest 

No acceptance 
hong highest 

- — 

(RASHID HIDAVAT) PSP 
ASP Cantonment Hyd & Member 

(1SHRAT PERVEZ CHANDIO) 
AEN/Bldg Hyd? Member 

~CTJAZ. ACIRUAI ) 
DSP/ADMN 

DIGP*011ice I lyderabad Ran e & ember 

(MUll MM 	1A1B ROOMI) 
( 	I SindhiMember 

(AMJAD AIIME SHAIKH) PSI' 
SSP. Matiar & Chairman 



04 Nr 
04 (Four Bidden Approached & Applied) 

NIL 

NIL 
17.04.2015 

Reasons for 
acceptancr/ 

rejection 
5 

Accepted hang 
lowest _ - 

No acceptonce 
hone blithest 

No acceptance 
bone highest 

No acceptance 
being highest 

Remarks 

6 

Lowest 

'behest 

Mellen 

HO= 

Canaurriton 
With 

Estimated cost 

4 
Amesi v.101111 
cost/quality 

(behest CVO 

I behest t es 

I be Com 

;IIA 	.1 
DSWADMN 

DRIP Ottlee I lyderabad Runge & Me bar 

1611111 MM 	• AIR R(()MI) 
'111,11 Sindh/Member 

BID EVALUATION REPORT 

I . Name of Procuring Agency: SENIOR SUPERINTENDENT OF P01.1( Alm %RI 
& CHAIRMAN COMMITTEE row U DI 10ItII NI \ WACENT TO 

POLICE STATION 	I NAGAR liN 111 \ It v i.  

2. Tender Reference No: 	DIGP/2010, dated 06.04.2015 & SPPRA Serial No.23485: IN 	RY-I211-15 

3. Tender Description/Name of work: (tategory-C) Purchase of Furniture / Fixture 
of Police Auditorium adjacent to PS BMW Nagar Ilyd.  

4. Method of Procurement: 	 Single Stage one EnNelop 

S. Tender Published: 	SPPRA N ebsite Serial No.23485 dated 01.04.2015. Sindh Pollee Website 
(Sr. No.67).Daily Tribune Express, Sobh. Ilakbal. Jang. Nai Bat (03.04.2015) 

6. 'total Bid documents Sold: 
7. total Bids Received: 
IL Bid(s) Rejected: No Bid(s) 
9. No. of Bid Technically Qualified 
10. Bid Rejected 
11. Financial Bid Opening date: 

12. Bid Evaluation Report: Item #412 Sofa set 7 seater with center table for dressing room. 

m use of Molti or equivalent 

SI 

0 

I. 

, Nome of Firm or 
Bidder 

Cost offered 
by the Bidder 
Per Unit/Each 

Ranking in 
terms of 

cost 
1 2 3 

WO Wens Enterprise Rs 65.000.4  1.  lowest 

2 Mn Al Ramer Computers Rs 63.2001- 2"I  !oust 

3 Mis Malin International Rs 65.5001. 3111 	lowest 

4 Ws Veins Enterposs 11465300/- r loven 

(RASHID HIDAVAT)PSP 
ASP Cantonment Hyd & Member 

(1 BRAT PERVEZ CHANDIO) 
AEN/I3Idg HycV Member 

(AMJAD AIIMF 	 PSP 
SSP, Matiar & Chairman 



Remarks 

_ _ _ 6 

lowest 

Menai 

Highest 

BID EVALUATION REPORT 

1. Name of Procuring Agency: SENIOR SUPER1NTENDEN I OF POLICE MATIAR1 

& CHAIRMAN COMMITTEE POLICE Allorromum ADJACENT TO 

POLICE STATION BIIITAI NAGAR HYDERABAD. 

2. Tender Reference No: 	 DIGP/2010, dated 06.04.2015 & SPPRA Serial No.23485:INI7KRY-1211-15 

3. Tender Description/Name of work: (Category-C) Purchase of Furniture I Fixture 
of Police Auditorium adjacent to I'S Bhitai Nagar Ilyd.  

4. Method of Procurement: 	 Single Stage one Envelop 

5. Tender Published: 	SPPRA Website Serial No.23485 dated 01.04.2015, Sindh Police Wehsite 
(Sr. No.67),Daily Tribune Express, Sobh, Ilalchal, Jong, Nal Bat (03.04.2015) 

6. Total Bid documents Sold: 	04 Nr  

7. Total Bids Received: 	 04 (Four Bidden Approached & Applied) 

8. Bid(s) Rejected: No Bid(s) 	 NIL 

9. No. of Bid Technically Qualified 	 WA  
10. Bid Rejected 
11. Financial Bid Opening date: 

12. Bid Evaluation Report: Item #.03 Meeting Chair make of sheesham wood or equivalent 
wood (Large size), French polishing, and back and siting with cushion of best quality foam 
covered with ragzene of superior quality Logo of Police affixed on Chair at top of front of 
chair.  

N11. 
17.04.2015 

5.11 
Name of Finn or 

Bidder 

Cost offered 
by the Bidder 
Per UnWEach 

Ranking in 
terms of 

cost 
0 1 2 3 

I Mix Wanio Emoplime Rs I7,500/- I' lowest 

2 Mrs Al %link Computers RYA/1.000h 2"1  lowest 

3.  M/s Venial Enterprises Rs 1132001- 3" lowst 

4.  Mrs Khnhq International Fts.18.3U0i. 4th  lowest 

Comparison 	Reasons for 
with 	acceptance/ 

Estimated cost 	rejection 

4 	 5 

ours' within 	N..;pncd bang 
cost/quality 	i 	lowest 

Ni
I  
	acceptance 

I ugliest Cowl 'ring highest 

No heccplance 
hoar htehcst I I gibes! Cosi 

I light-sr C•osi 
Nu acitcptimee 
twisty blithest 

 

(FtASIIID HIDAYKI") PSP 
ASP Cantonment I-1yd & Member 

ALIA% All 
DSP/ADMN 

MCP °Bice 1 lyderahad Rabe & ember 

27 

(IS RAT PERVEZ CHANDIO) 
AEN/Bldg Hyd/ Member 

(M111IA MAIrlittratrM1) 
OS PI mdh/Member 

(AMMO AHME SHAIKH) PSP 
SSP. Matiar & Chairman 

11 



04 \r 

  

   

04 (Four Bidders Approached & Applied) 
NIL 
N/A 
NIT 

17.04.2015 

Name of Firm or 
Bidder 

Mu Warm Entombs% 

Ws Al Raz.tak Compacts 

Ws Khali,' intrnsoonie 

Ntis Vat000 Entapriscs 

Cost offered Ranking in 
by the Bidder 	terms of 
Per ilniVEach 	cost  

2 	 3 

R065,(1001- 
	

lootst 

Rs 165,%10/- 
	

Is  lona 

14.166300e- 
	e bwml  

Rs 166,0001- 
	

latot 

SO 

0 

2 

3 

BID EVALUATION REPORT 

I Name of Procuring Agency: 

2. Tender Reference No: 

SENIOR SUPERINTENDENT OF POLICE M ABA RI 
& CHAIRMAN COMMITTEE POLICE AUDITORIUM ADJACENT TO 
POLICE STATION BHITAI NACAR HYDERABAD. 

DICP/2010, dated 06.04.2015 & SPPRA Serial No.23485:INEVICRY-1211-15 

3. Tender Description/Name of work: (Category-C) Purchase of Furniture / Fixture 
of Police Auditorium adjacent to I'S Wild Nagar Ilyd. 

4. Method of Procurement: Single Stage one Envelop 

5. Tender Published: 	SPPRA Ve ellsite Serial No.23485 dated 01.04.2015. Sindh Police IA eb.ite 

(T7.-SO.67).Daily Tribune FApress. Sobb. Ilalchal. Jong, ai Bat (03.04.20151 

6. Total Bid documents Sold: 
7. Total Bids Received: 
8. Bid(s) Rejected: No Bid(s) 
9. No. of Bid Technically Qualified 
10. Bid Rejected 
II. Financial Bid Opening date: 

12. Bid Evaluation Report: Item #.04 Lamination Table for stage of Wood for stage 211 width. 
22 ft Length. Top 2.5 . & 29" from Floor Level. Affixed Steel/Silver Logo in front. 

Comparison 
with 

Estimated cost 

4 

Lowell within 
t tot/gunk,' 

I lighest Con 
_ — 

I litficst Cosi 

Highest Cost 

Reasons for 
al instance/ 

rejection 
5 

Accephal hong 
IuwrM 

No otcriouno: 
bone loghtro 

No ottoptsrKc 
twenr 

No x.a-rianix 
boor torIN+1 

Remarks 

6 

(owes: 

Highest 

Mghost 

 

(RASHID 1111)A 1 A l) PSP 

ASP Cantonment I lyd & Member 
( (HA ALIA/ 1.1 

DSP 
DIGP Office 11yd:rah:id ange & NI tuber 

7 

(ISHIRAT PERVEZ CHANDIO) 
AF.N/Bldg I lyd/ Member 

AMIN . HIAIB ROOM) 
SIPPIU Sindh/Member 

(AMJAD AIIMEI sliA11:11) PSP  
SSP. Matiar & Chairman 

/Z. 



5 
Atm:pled being 
It 

No acceptance 
being bight% 

6 

Lowesi 

Highest 

Flights: No acceptance 
being Isighist 

Ihrber. No acceptance 
being highest 

..... 

• 

(ACYftwXIJ A AN) 
DSP ADMN 

IMP Office Hyderabad Range Member 

(RASHID HIDAYAT) PSP 
ASP Cantonment Flyd & Member 

(ISIfRAT PERVEZ CHANDIO) 
AEN/Bldg Hyd/ Member 

(MUll MMAD HAIR ROOMI) 
7PPII) Sindh/Member 

BID EVALUATION REPORT 

• 1. Name of Procuring Agency: SENIOR SUPERINTENDENT OF POLICE NI MARI 

& CHAIRMAN COMMITTEE POLI(F %I nl IORILIM ADJACENT TO 
POLICE STATION BlitIA 1 NAGAR in in.R %BAD. 

2. Tender Reference No: 	DIGP/2010, dated 06.04.2015 & SPPRA Serial  No.23485:INFIKRY-1211-15 

3. Tender Description/Name of work: (Category-C) Purchase of Furniture / Fixture 
of Police Auditorium adjacent to PS Bhitai Nagar Ilyd.  

4. Method of Procurement: 	 Single Stage one Envelop 

5. Tender Published: 	SPPRA Website Serial No.23485 dated 01.04.2015, Sindh Police Website 

(Sr. No.67),Daily Tribune Express. Sobh, Ilalchal, Jang, Nai Bat (03.04.2015)  

NIL 

NIL 

17.04.2015 

2. Bid Evaluation Report Item #.O5 Auditorium Chirs made of wood/steel/iron cover fully 
with cushion and cover of good quality cloth(standard shape and design) 

Contparicon 	Reasons for Cost offered Ranking in 
Remarks 

(AMJAD AIMED SIIAIKII) I'SP 
SSP, Matiar & Chairman 

'3 
I 

6. Total Bid documents Sold: 	04 Nr 

7. Total Bids Received: 	 04 (Four Bidders Approached & Applied) 

8. Bid(s) Rejected: No Bid(s) 
9. No. of Bid Technically Qualified 	 A 

10. Bid Rejected 
I I. Financial Bid Opening date: 

S.. 
Name of Firm or 

Bidder 
by the Bidder 
Per Unit/Each 

terms of 
cost 

0 1 2 3 

I Ws Wants Enterprises Its.18,500/. I" lowest 

2. Ws Al Runk Computers Rs.19,1011/- r lowest 

3 Ws Vernon Efiterwises Rs 19,800/- 3"11oftst 

4 M/s KWh' International Its 20.0004 4" lowest 

with 
Eytimated cost 

4 
tilivCs1 11-11iIM 

cosi/quality 

Highest Cost 

Iiiithest Cost 

Ilightst Cost 

acceptance/ 
refection 



Comparison 
with 

Estimated cost 
4 

ioost within 
cosUqualin 

thanes! Cost 

Highest Cosi 

Highest Cost  

Reasons for 
acceptance/ 

rejection 

. _ 	. 
Accepted being 

lowest 

No Lica:ptma 
living highest 

No accept:ma: 
being Inghsst 

No acceptance 
being highest 

Remarks 

6 

Lowest 

Highest 
. 	 _ 

Highest 

Highest 

I 

BID EVALUATION REPORT 

• I. Name of Procuring Agency: 	SENIOR SUIT RI \ 	i OF P01.1(1 	I I %RI 

& CHAIRM 	( 	 POLIC1 t 1)110Itit NI ADJACENT JO 
POLICE S I Ai 10 \ BIll I 	\ \GAB 11\ DI it \It %D. 

2. Tender Reference No: 	DIG P/2010, dated 06.04.2015 & SPPRA Serial No.23485:INF7K RY-1211-15 

3. 'lender Description/Name of work: (Category-C) Purchase of Furniture I Fixture 
of Police Auditorium adjacent to PS Mutat Nagar Hyd.  

4. Method of Procurement: 	 Single Stage one Envelop 

5. Tender Published: 	SPPRA Website Serial No.23485 dated 01.04.2015, Sindh Police Website 
(Sr. No.67),Dail) Tribune Express, Sobh, Ilalchal, Jong, Nai Bat (03.04.2015)  

6. Total Bid documents Sold: 
7. Total Bids Received: 
8. Bid(s) Rejected: No Bid(s) 
9. No. of Bid Technically Qualified 
10. Bid Rejected 
II. Financial Bid Opening date: 

04 Nr 
04 (Four Bidders Approached & Applied) 

NII. 
NIA 

17.04.2015 

12. B'd Evaluation Report: Item #.06 Rostrum / Desk made of Lamination Wood as per 
standard design. 

Sit 
Name of Firm or 

Bidder 

Cost offered 
ky the Bidder 

Per UniilEach 

Ranking in 
terms of 

cost 
0 

I 

I 2 3 

M/s Wasiak Enterprises Rs 21.200/. I.  lowest 

2 M/s Al Kaiak Computers Rs 21.511W- 2' lowest 

3 M/s Verizon Enterprises Ks 21,9001- 3 1̂10wint 

4 M/s Khaki Intonational Rs 22.500b 4*  lowest 

 

(14 ■ ti l ll D IIIDAVAT) PSP 
ASP (. airloninertl Hyd & Member 

GIJA AI A 	IL 
DSP/ADMN 

DIOP Office Hyderabad !tan & ember 

ti 

(ISI RAT PERVEZ CHANDIO) 
AEN/Bldg Hyd/ Member 

(Alt it \I 	I) SOIIAIR Ito0 I) 
itli J Sindh/Member 

(AMJAD AHMED SHAIKII) PSP 
SSP, Matiar & Chairman 

19 
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